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Irving Oil, Pepsi, and the City 
of Fredericton. Neill House also 
recognizes the kindness of other 
businesses that contributed to 
the success of our events: 
Save-Easy, Speedy Propane, 
Bunsmaster, Kings Place, the 
Daily Gleaner, C-Hi, and 
CFNB.

The most encouraging

and the ladies of Tibbitts ere 
particularly generous and 
actively supportive.

Neill House is proud to be 
involved with the Kid’s Help 
Line. Literature explaining the 
Help Line is available through 
the Knights of Neill. (459- 
3445)

important opportunity to 
communicate with the Acadian 
community.

It should also be remembered 
that only the COR party would 
base the hiring of Government 
employees on the individual 
applicants' qualifications, not 
racial background. This is 
hardly a racist policy.

Allen Carter asked, “... what 
would compel people to vote 
for... COR"? People voted 
COR because of our commit­
ment to responsible Govern­
ment, both financially, and in 
terms of responsiveness to the 
electorate. Our policies in 
regards to Government reform 
are now being copied by parties 
such as the social Credit Party 
of British Columbia, and the 
Reform Party of Canada.

Students should also note that 
the Liberal Party platform failed 
to include a youth plank. The 
youth wing of the COR party 
played an important role in the 
writing of the party platform, 
including the youth plank.

Hardly a one issue party.

support, however, came from 
the UNB residence community, 
and on behalf of the Knights of 
Neill, I would like to thank 
Aitken House, Jones House, 
MacKenzie House, and LBR 
for their interest. The ladies of 
the Dunn and their don, Lynn 
Fraser, were instrumental in the 
organization of our truck pull.

Is Allan for real?

Allan Carter, Managing 
Editor,has made an attempt to 
be “politically corect”. Adlan’s 
personal feelings have ex­
hausted his credibility, to any 
thinking person.

Allan’s Expression of his hate 
for the Confederation of 
Regions Party (COR) indicates 
he has not taken the time to

Kelly VanBuskirk 
Neill House

comprehend or even read the 
COR policies which by the way 
were composed “by the 
people".

Allan says he is sad and 
scared. Perhaps Allan would 
prefer the government to 
legislate language and culture. 
Perhaps Allan wants a “distinct 
society" of the few bilingual 
people who qualify or are 
preferred for most government 
jobs.

Allan's hatred, sadness and 
scarey feelings may be dis­
pelled with knowledge.

Is Allan Carter really Don 
Hoyt?

Is Allan Carter for real?
Reg J. Fleming 
President
COR NB Youth, York North

Andrew Corman

Kid's Help LineA one-issue party?
I would like to express my very 
sincere gratitude to the people 
of Fredericton for their gener­
ous support of the 1991 Knights 
of Neill fundraising drive.

The residents of Neill House 
chose to direct our efforts 
toward the Kid’s Help Line, 
which is Canada’s only 24 hour, 
toll-free counselling service for 
children. This worthy organiza­
tion provides emotional support 
and practical assistance to over 
700 callers each day.

The overwhelming success 
of our campaign is largely due 
to the full co-operation of our 
major sponsors, namely:

It was with some degree of 
incredulity that I read Mug­
wump on September 27. Allan 
Carter accused the Confedera­
tion of Regions Party - New 
Brunswick of being one issue 
party, and racist I would 
therefore like to take this 
opportunity to address those 
misconceptions.

It should be remembered that 
it was not Mr. Pafford that 
refused to attend a televised 
debate organized by the french 
language branch of the CBC. It 
was Mr. McKenna and Mr. 
Cochrane that rejected this

,
... V..j I

Getting Back To The Basics.
brought to you by Get A Real Life Inc.

|i.

i

I ip m

“LET THE GOOD TIMES ROLL’’ Wm
with Kü m VS

DAN SEALS É1L A
IN CONCERT 

FRI.OCT. 11 -8:00 P.M. if
ü

TICKETS: 
BOX OFFICE
453-5054 r

and
MAZUCCA’S 
79 YORK ST.. -- .

♦ rTheatre Bowl Reserved Seating $18.50 Incl. GST^ vm.^
SOCIATED ALUMNI

TKEH<E>CEH8ITYOF NEW BnUNflWHTtC


