
· NOTES UN SPECIALTIES.
Relief in Rheumatoid Conditions.

Dr. Pettinghill, of New York
citv, under the head of "Intestinal
Antisepsis," reports sonie excellent
experiences, from which the fo'low-
ing is selected:

" Every physician knowNs full
well the advantages to be derived
from the use of antikamnia in very
many diseases, but a number of
theni are still lacking a knowledgc of
the fact that antikamnia in combina-
tion with various other renedies,
has a peculiarly happy effect. Par-
ticularly is this the case when com-
bined with salol. Salol is a most
valuable remedv in many affections;
and its usefulness seems to be en-
hanced bv combining it with anti-
kaninia. The rheumatoid conditions
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so often seen in various manifesua-
tions are wonderfully relieved by the
use of this combination. After fev-
ers, inflammation, etc., there fre-
quently remain various painful and
annoving conditions which mav con-
tinue, nanielv: the severe headaches
which occur after meningitis, i
'stitch in the side' following pleur-
isy, the precordial pain of pericardit-
is and the painful stiffness of the
joints which remain after a rhcumai-
ic attack-all these conditions arc re-
lieved by this combination called
'Antikania and Salol Tablets' con-
taining 2,14 grains each of antikam-
nia and of salol, and the dose of
which is one or two everv two or
thrce houis. They are also recom-
mended highly in the treatment of
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Nasal, Throat, Intestinal,
Stomach, Rectal, and

Utero-Vaginal. ..
SAMPLES ON APPLICATION. W
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