
sixty native helpers and local
preachers, one thousand one hundred
and forty-four native members, and
nineteen schools. Some of the con-
verts were soidiers in the Chinese
army. Great injury has been done
to, the mission property by the wvar
wvith France.

METHODIST EPISCOPAL CHURCH.

The Woman's Foreign Mission
Committee recently met at Evanston,
111. The report of the treasurer
showved that $1 57,000 had been col-
Iected by the brancli societies during
the year. Four lady missionaries
were appointed to China and japan.

The General Missionary Coni-
mittee, at its recent annual meeting,
adopted the twvo following resolu-
tions : (i) that we ask the Church
for $i,oooooo; and (2) that $8-oooo
of it le now appropriated for home
and foreign missionary wvork; $350,-
ooo, was the limit of appropriations
to the home missionary work in the
United States; $3.00o was appro-
priated for the salary of Bishop
Taylor.
*Bishop Taylor was in Lisbon in
November. That day lie ivas to see
the King of Portugal. Before his
departure fromn Africa ail bis mission
families were comfortably settled in
bouses. There are six stations, lie-
sides that assigned to the Quakzers.
Bishop Taylor wvent from Lisbon to,
London, wvhere lie preacbed and gave
soine account of bis African ivork
He said that last Mardi lie wvent to
South Central Africa with forty-four
missionary men and women and
chuldren. Several of these had
returned, thirty-one were stricken
down ivith African fever and one
yoiing man succumbed and died, but
the tbirty-one who remained at tbe
front -vere now well and happy in
their 'vork He proposes to extend
the line of mission stations stili fur-
thcr into the interior. He nov ivants
frcsh recruits, and then wvill lead a
neu, missionary expedition up the
Cong and Kasai rivers into the
Tushe1ange-country. Bishop Taylor
bas also seen the King of Belgium,
Leopold Il., to wbom lie gave a full
account of bis mission and bis pro-
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posed visit to the Congo Valley.
The king expressed lis great plea-
sure and readiness to, co-operate
wvith him by ai the means at hbis
conmmand.

At the recent meeting of the Mis-
sionary Board in New York, the Rev.
Dr. Goucher stated the prospects and
needs of the Anglo-Japanese College
at Tokio, and asked for a grant of
$12,ooo for the College buiilding, and
offered to give $5,ooo, of that amount.
The $7,000 wvas accordinglv voted by
acclamation.

THE METHODIST CHURCH.

It is just one'hundred years ago,
since Metbodism wvas introduced
into, Newvfoundland The Rev. John
McGeary wvas the first Metbodist
nzsionary stationed there. The
total population is 197,589, of whoin
69,646 are reported Episcopalians;
75,350 Roman Catholics, and 48,943
Metbodists; othiers, 3,67o. During
the decade, Episcopalians increased
16.89, Roman Catholics 17.12, and
Methodists 37.18, more than both
the two former united.

A few% Nveeks ago a committee re-
presenting the principal Methodist
churches in Montreal extenided a
welcome at the Theological College
to the ninety-eigbt students attending
the McGill University and other
colieges in the city. A pleasant
evening -%vas spent, the programime
consisting -of choice music and ap-
propriâte addresses by distinguisbed
ministers and laymen.

A meeting of a similar kind was
recently held in the parlours of the
Metropolitan Church, Toronto, to,
give a welcome to ail the Metbodist
students attending the various edu-
cational and literary institutions in
the city. A similar reception wvas
also given in the Sherbourne Street
Churcli. Sucb social gatherings have
a tendency to malze young -people
increasingly attached to the Church
of their fathers. Sucli meetings
should be beld frequently.

Recently a Woman's Missionary
Society was formed in the Indian
Reserve, Georgina Island. The offi-
cers were ail selected froru the native
women on the island. This is pro-
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