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either killed and buried it, or stuffed and preserved it, or caged 
and tamed it. Of course, England has been in many ways, 
like M. Jourdain speaking prose, creating Socialism all the 
time without knowing it : a part of England has been creating 
it, perhaps more practically than other countries, and the rest 
of England did not know, or pretended not to know. Any 
Englishman among his acquaintance in the sturdy middle 
classes can point to a score of the sturdiest pillars on whom 
the last General Election brought down a bolt from the blue, 
bringing down Socialism from the region of mad dreams to 
reality, wrong or right, but still a reality henceforth to be 
reckoned with.

There has been no such recent discovery in France. The 
Frenchman in the street, as a rule, long since either has walked 
in step with the army of Socialism or has tired of the crusade 
altogether, and smiles happily, or wearily jeers, when the host 
goes marching by nim. The prosperous bourgeoisie either 
refuses to think of the cause otherwise than as of that of 
dangerous fanatics whose faith has long ago been proved 
absurd, and refuses to consider their arguments at all, or else 
has called and proclaimed itself Socialist these ten years, 
usually for politic reasons. The “ aristocracy of the intellect ” 
has for twenty years past turned the subject over and over 
unto weariness and scepticism. The old “Ivory Tower” of 
the poet, seer, mystic, and egoist has crumbled, and left its 
denizens standing open to the modern world. But the old 
castle in the air of the altruist, reformer, and regenerator has 
large rents in its vaporous sides too. Either a great scepticism 
or a great mellowness has come over the jeunesse pensante, 
which looks all round Socialism and other things. The jeunes 
“are all Socialists now,” of course, but none are “unified” 
Socialists of the Parliamentary party. Socialism may have 
gained by losing good intellectual haters, but also has lost 
fervent intellectual enthusiasms.

Enthusiasm, in fact, goes more to individualism. The 
“ cult of the ego ” has died, but not the cultivation of person-


