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SECT. XKIX.

J D.fjripfr.'r ^,r tht: Town' rf /'! Hartmn!', Aara, ir 7,>ara,

c;v.7 f/' .'.'/..• Tawm iDiil D :> i] cf Dant tit:.! jll,j'i at.i.

£7*1/ Hiiiim.Th, a:i aiitiiiit town long '^riK to d^^':iy,

Al/ is fitiiati:'! in thirty-four dcorcfs north latitude, and

is oiilv rcn: irk.i'ili; for its Rnniaii walls of ("qcare lloiie~,

•111. I I. line nii'cnptioiis niciitio.icvi by (,ei) Africmus and

J).ilip.r, Init now lii defaced as not to be road, and !ur

i''. ho; (uli.iiircoiis Iprinizs, which aie conveyed to it by an

old aiiueJiitt. It is now a poor niifuaMe town, only in-

habited bv a few hufbandmen and fi(h.-rmen, and thole

who fcek lor .1 bctrrr livelihood from the piratical trade.

ZaiM, or Zoara, another miiiniis town, cnromp.ified

by an old d-rc.-.ycJ w.dl, and feated near the fea, about

tliinceii lra;;ii:s from the illaiid of Jcrlia, or Jerbis. It

is at preli.-iit inhabited oiilv by poor p-ople, who live

cither liy burn ii;'; quick-lir.io and pnt-alh-s, or follow

til-' piraiual an I hlhnij; tr.ide. All thele tland on the

caltern co ill ol th • !;iilph of .Sidr.; : thofo that are within

it, and on its e-idcrn fide, .ire in a !lill more ruin'iu<

condition. What has moil contributed to h:s and to th'?

dcllruction of their piratical trade, on whi^'i, like their

neighbours, thcv chicHy fubfillod, i: their brinw fo near

to the iil.'.nd of Malta ; which hemi.r convenicntiv fitiiat-

cd oppulite to the coalt, the knights of that i:1.md 'r..wf

conlt.iiiilv watched them, and, bv fupprcHiiv.^ their fre-

quent ixciitfions oblige th'.in to apply to filhiii;, and

to cultivate as much land abrnit t.iolc towns as will julb

ferve llnni frotii li.ind to n-.oiitil.

The only place worthy of notice on th-; weft fide of

the a'L).^ve gulph is Deriie, now a fmal! town. It Hands

about half a mile from the lea, audi; fiirrouivlcd with

fine l"piin:;s of l-.veet water, one of which runs through

the town, and otiiers round the wall-s and therefore its

territory is Ifill cap.ihle of bearing corn and gardcn-

ftutf"; but it is fo poorly inhabited, that little advantage

is obtained from it. This town is Ihll the capital of a

diilricl of its own name, which extends from Cape K.n;nb

on the calf to thj pjiilph ot Hen^ifi, wlv>h is above three

hundred miles ; hut is clii' (ly inhabited by wandering
Arabs, wlYh are laid to amount to thirty thoufand fami-

lies, that pay a fna'.l tribute to the bey of I'ripoii. This
tract is almolf c ery where cov..ri:d with a plant or (brub

that bears a thick downy Icat", with branches of yellow

flowers, and not only keeps green, but blolioms durintr

the grcatclt part of the year. The bees chiefly feed up-

on this flower, which gives an excellent taffc to their

honcv.

On the w-(l;rn fide of the piilph i.l 'iJra is alio the

diilnil of Melrata, which contains the i .ntry antitntiy

called Cyrcnaica and I'entapolis, from . thin bavins;

five cities ; but is now called Mefr.'ta, tiom its capital.

It has tome town; and villas;c9, both on the fea-fidc and

within land, that trade witli the Chndiani for Euro-

pean c immo.li;;.;, which they fell to the ne.;roe-, and

oxchaii::e for fl ives, mulk, and civet, which they carry

into riirky. The inhabitants were formerly rich and

warlike, impatient of the yoki- rrt" the Tunileens, a> they

lire now of that of the I'ripoiitans. Thev can niulter a-

Iniut ten thoiil'and men fit to be.ir arms, and are often at

war with the Arabs.

The other countries within land are (lill more dcf.irt

aiul void of towns ; thi-y arc inhabiteil by much the fime

.p- opie with the two 1 ilt mentioned, live a("ter the f^me

in.inncr, anil are pcrpetu.il'.y ende.ivourin:» to free them-

lelvfs from the tribute exacted from them. I':-.: Ian.! i$

for the moll part dry, barren, and covered with fii- h light

("and, that on.' cannot travel throu;;h it wi'hout lomc-

times finkinj; into it above the middle ; fo that were it

not ("or the abundance of dates that i^row there, and for

("cime mountains that afford pafture for their cattle, it

would be impoflibic to fubfill.

SEC T. XXX.

Oflht Dffart ef finrca, ill Situation and Exltitl, and ihe

Aliinncn of tht InliuLltanti.

THE dcfart of Ihrca, fitiiated between Eevpt and

what is more properly called the kingdom of

4J

Tripoli, is in breadth from north fo fouth auou! thirty

leagiu. ; but its cor.finc:; on the lomh liuC mull be ac-
knowledged to be very uncertain.

'I'hii. country is (or the nioft part, cfpccially in the
miiidle, nothiiii; mote th.tii a trail of diy and barren
lanJ.i, on whicM account the Arabs, itspriiuip.il niii.-bi-

tants, (tile It I'lie delait or road of whirlwind-.. It.ili'ioll

every where labours und.r aijreat ("canity of w.ittr ; and,
except in the neighbourhood of the towns and villai;es,

where the earth produces a ("null quantity of '.;rain, as
corn, millet, and tome in.nze, the letl is in a manner
uncultivated. Even ol tne Iniall quintity of corn pio-
ductd III the few l"pot> capable of cultivation, the poor
iiihaimants are obliged to exchan^tc a part with their in-
iligent lui^thbours lor dat-s, (h:.ep, and cam,-;;; thefelatl
tlicy Hand in greater nee! of than thcv, on a.count of
their great daitity ofgial^, and other propc-r tood.

VhK moll dcl'art and dangeiou ; canton of all is th.it in
which the temple of Jiip'ter Amnion ant; n'ly (t..od,

whicn, thouyh in otiicr relpccts pl'.al.intiy lituated, w.:.:

encompafli d a great wav* round with luch quick and
burnin;; lands, as have al ways been detri.iu iitai to ir.ivel-

Krs, not only as they link iiin!cr their feet, but, being
lignt and heated by the rays of the fun, aio calily raikd
by every breath ol wind; wiiich, if it haj.j.ciis to be in
their faces, almoll burns out tncir eyes, an I ril'cs them
for want of breath ; and, if vehfincnt, ottcii ov.vwh'tlms
whole caravans. The (ad catallrophe of Cani!iyl">.s and
his army in his bold attempt ngainlt tiiat trmjile .ind

oracle, as well as .Mexandei's more luccelful, t!iou(;K

ditlicult expedition thither, are well known. Upon t1ic

whole, the country may be jiiftly termed fo wild a dcfart,

that there i^ no travelling t.troiigh it without the direc-
tion of the liars, 01 the help of acompnfs ; and thoiiah it

was once the thorough-tare for tlie caravans Irom Ijar-

bary to .Mecca, yet it has been (iiicc fo iiiielf ,1 with
wild Arabs, that thofe caravans arc obliged 10 'ravel a
hundred and fifty miles about to avoid bein;; pi u in' red.

Some of the French geographers divide the country of
IJirca into what they teim the kini;dnm, and the dif.irt ;
the former of which has lome cimlidcrable ports, towns,
and viiUgcs, and is under the protection i;f tli.- Porte,
and governed by a cady who refides at Tripo.i

; but
other authors call the coalf, the eadcrnfhore of Tripoli :

it IS, however, more comntonly known by tiie name of
Deine, from one of its molt conliderable towr.j and ports;
hcfides wliich it has (everal others, and the ruins of manr
more, now reduced to poor villages ; but what Kuidition
they arc in, or by ,vhom they are governed, is not known.
Indu.d the maritime towns are probably under the pro-
tection ot the I'orte ; but whether under the goveinment
of the bafha of Tripoli or Egypt, or whethi.rtluy have
formed thcmlelves into iiulependant tlatcs, like thofe of
Tunis and Algiers, is not eafy to determine.

The inhabitants ot tiie maritime towns are more civi-
li/.cd and convcrfablc than thofe of the inland country,
and have imbibed notions of humanity and jullice, whilr:

thj people who live in the defart appear in many relpecti

favages, and, like other wild Arabs, fubfill by robbery
and plunder.

It was indeed by the Arabs that this fraifl, tlil then a
continued barren delart, was liilt inhabited ; tl.cle, at
their firft coming into it, (ettled in the be(t cantons ;

but .IS tliey multiplied, and the feveral tribes eniragcd
in frequent wars at'ainlf each other, the (frorfett diovc
the weaked out of the bed Ipots, and lent them to wander
in the delart parts, where they live in the moff abiect
and miferabie condition, the country yielding little tor^d

and no raiment. Hence they arc rcprtfenttd as lcin(»

the molt difagreeable of all the Arabs, their bodies hav-
ing fcarcely any thing but (kin and bones, their facej

are meagre, their looks (iercc and rav-mnus, and their

gaib, which is what they commonly lake from the paf-
fengers and pilgrims who travel through thofe parts, are
tattered with long wearing, while the poorefthave Icarce-

ly a ra:: to wrap round their wailts. It is no wonder that

thef'e are faid to be the mod refolutc and expert robber*
and plunderers ; but both frequently yield them lb mile-
rable a harvril, that ncccfTity lorces them to makcexcur-
(i'ns as far a: into Numidia, Libya, and other louthern

partj, to obtain frcfh ("upplies. Uardened by ind-grn'e,
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