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inspiration as spoken of in the Bible,
whose source a nd founitain is the
Divine Throne, and governed and
controlled by that inspiration they went
about among the people 'doing good,
distributing their almis.

The other, whose name was Logan
Johnson, aged probably about thirty-
five, delivered an able and cultured ad-
dress, seeming to be thoroughly familiar
with the labors of Friends in their be-
haif, and forcibly expressed bis appre-
ciation thereof. He referred pathetic-
ally to, the incident related in Uncle
Tom's Cabin, of the escape from bond-
age of the woman Eliza that rather than
suifer torture from the blood-hounds
that were in pursuit of her she plunged
into the roaring Mississippi and mar-
vellously escaped by the aif of floating
masses of ice to, the other shore, the
banks of deliverance, and that she was
rescued and cared for in a Quaker
home. He also referred to, the possi-
bilities of their race, and counselled
themn to greater dilligence, and to the
formation of good habits, and con-
cluded by saying that the Friends were
with themn-in their bondage with
them, after their liberation they had flot
forsaken them, but that they were with
themn now, in endeavoring to advance
their race and elevate themn to hetter
citizenship, surround them, with good
influences, as was evinced by their
generous act in donating them, that
abode of worship, which could flot but
bhave its good eifect in after yeais.

M. 0. T.
IBaltimnore, Md., 4th mo. 3 othi, 1891.

[NoTE.-To those who are flot fam-
iliar with the disposition of the property
above referred to, sonse explariation
appears to, be required. The Friends
having charge of the property agreed,
some years ago, to seli it to, the colored
people of that vicinity, for three hun.
dred dollars, and deed it to them when
the full amount was paid. They paid
one hundred dollars, and after a time
abandoned it. Another organization
has recently sprung up there, put the

building under suitable repairs, and be.
lieving them to be. worthy recipients
thereof, the property was deeded to
them, with the reservation nained
therein. k M.

PICKERING EXECUTIVE
MEETING.
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Pickering Executive Meeting was
held at Uxbridge the 23rd of this
month. The attendance I think as
large as usual. A number of Friends
from Pickering drove out, and enjoyed
a pleasant drive through a very "«rustic"
part of the country-some places being
quite picturesque with its immense his,
and innumerable littie streams of run-
ning water, and miniature falîs. Thie
roads and weather were ail that could
be desired at this time of the year.

Our esteemed Friend, Richard Wid.
difield, was very acceptable wîth us, he
having just recovered from an attack
of "La Grippe." Hie spoke in very
feeling terms of the place mnade vacant
and the loss sustained in the Meeting
by the death of our much respected
friend and brother, Sylvanus C. Brown.
We were charged faithfully to, strive to
live each day of our lives very close
to, our Heavenly Father, for ive kuow
flot what a day or an hour may bring to
us, and if the messenger of God cornes
to us as it did to, our lamented brother,
in a moment of timne as it were, we rnay
be ready for that final change.

He svas faithful in attendance of
meetings and in all that pertaincd to
the interest of the Society, and endea-
vored to, do what he felt to, be his duty.

The routine of business was gone
through with, the queries were ail an.
swered at this time, previous to oui
H. Y. M.

After partakinb of the hospitality of
kind Friends that night we wended oui
way towards home next morning, think-
ing it had been good to be there.

A. WV.


