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The question is on the amendment. Is it the pleasure of the
House to adopt the amendment?

Some Hon. Members: Agreed.

Somne Hon. Members: No.

The Acting Speaker (Mr. Charest): Ail those in favour of
the amendment will please say yea.

Somne Hon. Menibers: Yea.

The Acting Speaker (Mr. Charest): Ail those opposed will
please say nay.

Sonie Hon. Members: Nay.

The Acting Speaker (Mr. Charest): In my opinion, the nays
have it.

And more thanfive Members having risen-

The Acting Speaker (Mr. Charest): Cali in the Members.

Before the taking of the vote:

[En glish]
Mr. Speaker: Before we proceed to the vote on the amend-

ment, with the consent of the House 1 arn going to try to
expiain the procedure we are going to follow. We are now
dealing with an amendment to the main motion. Therefore, 1
have some assumptions about who may be voting in favour of
the amendment. Given that assumrption, the vote wili begin
with the Right Hon. Leader of Her Majesty's Opposition (Mr.
Turner). We wiIi then proceed in the normai way with that
Party, starting with the Hon. Member closest to me.

Making an assumption for the moment about a potential
other Party's interest, we will begin again with the Leader of
the New Democratic Party and we will then proceed from the
front bench to the back bench. If that Party were to vote
against the amendment, we would deal with it after we have
deait with the Government.

Now we get to the complicated part. We wiIl begin with the
Deputy Prime Minister (Mr. Nielsen). We wiII then proceed
as is normal, starting with the Member closest to myseif on the
front bench, then continuing with Members on the second
bench, the third bench, etc. We will then proceed-

Some Hon. Members: Hear, hear!

Mr. Speaker: You should try to figure out how the Clerk
Assistant feels! We will then begin with the opposition Mem-
ber closest to me on this side and we will cail out the names of
ail the Memnbers on the front bench voting that way. We wil
do the same with ail the Members on the second bench voting
thatt way, etc.

An Hon. Member: Would you say that again?

Mr. Speaker: 1 wonder if everyone would accept that 1 have
said that twice?

The House divided on the amendment (Mr. Turner (Van-
couver Quadra)) which was negatived on the following divi-
sion:
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