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that he does flot like it as much as the first report. H-e
reiterates his support in the first letter by the words "as 1 did
the first report" in the second letter. He had flot changed bis
mind too much in those four months.

What the House deserves to know now-I hope we wiil get
some answers fromt the government-is what will the govern-
ment do about these recommendations, so many of which are
stili outstanding. During our further examinations in the
Public Accounts Committee, we wili be re-examining some of
our recommendations. We have a very good follow-up proce-
dure and we wiIl be asking for some of these answers in
committee. 1 think it is fair, however, that the House, having
heard these strong words from the minister, should now concur
in this motion and in what the minister has said. The govern-
ment knows from the Treasury Board that the President of the
Treasury Board is iosing bis battle. As 1 say. 1 do flot know if
he is Iosing it in the Privy Counicil Office or in cabinet, but it is
obvious that the President of the Treasury Board needs the
help of the House. 1 appeai very strongiy to members in the
House from ail sides to give the House the strength of its
concurrence in the recommendations of the Public Accounts
Committee.

Mr. David Smiith (Pariiamentary Secretary to President of
the Privy Council): Mr. Speaker, it is obvious and regrettable
that the officiai opposition is using the same staliing tactic
today that it used yesterday to prevent the House from deaiing
with Bill C-85, the Canagrex bill, which is a badiy needed
piece of legisiation. To aliow the House to deal with this
legislation rather than drone on about a two-year-old report, 1
move, seconded by the hon. member for Lambton- Middlesex
(Mr. Ferguson), pursuant to Standing Order 24:

That the Flouse do now proceed to Orders of the Day.

The Acting Speaker (Mr. Corbin): Is it the pleasure of the
House to adopt the said motion?

Some hon. Members: Agreed.

Some hon. Members: No.

The Acting Speaker (Mr. Corbin): Ail those in favour of the
motion please say yca.

Some hon. Niembers: Yea.

The Acting Speaker (Mr. Corbin): Ali those opposed wiii
please say nay.

Some hon. Members: Nay.

The Acting Speaker (Mr. Corbin): In my opinion the yeas
have it.

And more thanfive members having risen:

The Acting Speaker (Mr. Corbin): Cail in the members.

The House divided on the motion (Mr. Smith), which was
agreed to on the foilowing division:
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