
of Durham for a number of years, then 
attended the Ontario Normal College, 
Hamilton, in 1899, was Principal of 
Richmond Hill Public School for one 
year, and joined the teaching staff of
Toronto in 1900. He was assistant- 
master in Ryerson School for six years. 
Principal of Duke Street School for 
three years, of Cotting'nam Street for 
one year, and of Bolton Avenue for 
four years. He is a graduate of 
Queens University, Kingston. His 
educational attainments, energy and 
enthusiasm mark him as a man well 
qualified to fill the highest position a 
School Board may offer.

Lord Dufferin took a personal interest 
in his namesake, and after his death in 
1902, Lady Dufferin presented the 
Dufferin medal, the guardianship of 
which is awarded each year to a mem­
ber of the graduating class. This medal 
was the last of a number Lord Dufferin 
had struck for the universities of India 
while he was Vice-Roy of that part of 
our Empire. Through the interest and
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