
r

r i.i

183 Nom cm woBBsraiL.

iNdiBsoLL—" If consaqnenoes are good, so lathe action.*'
Ogmmeht—According to this diotam, yoa oannot sav a

cold-blooded niarder or aa asgassinatidn ia good or bad
nntil yoa hat^ leimed the oomeqaences of itl The con-
e^aenoea^ef Garfield's taldng <m can never beloiown to
man. Then, aooording to yoor philosophy, it can nerer
be known whether his moraer was a crime or a virtue I

Are yoa not afraid that yoor pliilosophy may pot a bee
into the head of soma religuMUi fanatic, who, misled by
year toadiings, mif^t eonsioer bis killing- of yoa a virta-
oas and holy act, foolishly imagining that^ the result of it

might, in its conseqaences, prove bmiefidal to society and
religion ? I , as a Christian, condemn that act beforehand,
as a crlaie deserving the eternal torments oi hell ; but you
cannot consistentty condemn it, beoaMise, according to
your iuMel tbec^y, the act cannot be said to be evu or
v/icked tiU its oonsequenoes are known. As the coitte-
qnences of >your death oannot be known, it follows that
you£ muMor %2ight be a good or bad act I This is the
rebuH or c>fase(iaen<» of your philosophy. From a Ohris-
ti&n ^idhit of view it is a very bad o(mseqaeQoe» and there-
fore, n there is any virtue in ktfio. your philosophy is ba&
The Gbrfstiaa holds not only t£«t murder is a crima, but
tiiat evon the intention, determination, or iimaetnated re-
solve jle a orims, deserving of hell. It is tbos that the
Christian retigioc strikes at the very root of this murder-
c«as propensity in man, and kills the dragon before he
Issues from hn Innermost den in the human heart. The
dootHne that acts take their nature and quality from their
x^ETilts is m logical and necessary oonsequuioe of the
denial of Ood. It destooys individiMl resioonsibility and
is dubversive of all government and social order. It
denim all appeal to ri^t, and destroys not only jtutioe^

but the very idea of it. It contemplates uothu^ but re*
BoltB^i^ysioalr cognisable xesults.


