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*Cross country

Team places third
unfortunately stumbled on the 
last loop and lost his momen­
tum. Other Tiger runners in 
the top twenty were Tim 
Prince (13th); Gord Valiant 
(16th) and Leonard Currie 
(19th). Don Brien was the first 
runner from the B team to 
finish, coming 17th overall.

Incidentally the third place 
finisher, Dave Fudge, who ran 
as an independent may shortly 
enrol at Dalhousie. This would 
be a big boost for the 
cross-country team.

This weekend the Tigers 
travel to Moncton for their 
next meet.

Ithe seasoned UNB squad and 
the runner-up Tartans. Coach 
Al Yarr was proud of the fact 
that he was able to enter two 
teams.
pleased with our depth.' 
commented Yarr. ‘‘We’re a 
young team so I expect much 
improvement. I am confident 
we will make gains.

Individually. Dal's Robert 
Englehutt finished second 
with a time of 22:58.5 over the 
4.6 mile course.
Allison Robertson took first 
place honours with a time of 
22:36.2. Englehutt was closing 
fast on the fleet Robertson but

Dalhousie men's cross­
country team splashed their 
way to a third place finish in 
the Dalhousie Invitational 
cross-country meet, in a rain 
soaked Point Pleasant Park on 
Saturday.

The meet, the first of the 
AU A A season, attracted 
teams from Acadia. UNB and 
the local Tartan track club. 
The Tigers were able to enter 

A and a B team. U. of M. 
and UPEI also had harriers 
competing, but not enough to 
form teams. Amid confusion 
at the finish line, it was 
eventually determined that
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Norma Hogg to coach Dal volleyball
to act as manager for the 
team. This position is open to 
both male and females and 
any interested person should 
contact either Lois MacGregor 
(424-2152) or Kent Rodgers 
(469-1830) before October 3rd.

One of the major cogs in the 
Black and Gold machine will 
be last year’s most valuable 
player. Beth Fraser. Return­
ing to Dal to take her MBA, 
Beth has played for the Tigers 
for the past three seasons. A 
strong hitter with excellent 
court sense. Beth is at her best 
in tight situations.

Coach MacGregor also indi­
cated that the Tigers are 
presently looking for a person

pleasure with this season’s 
training camp. Although the 
number of persons vying for a 
spot on the team is smaller 
than in past seasons, the 
calibre is far superior. Mac­
Gregor feels this year’s club 
will have a good chance of 
winning the National Cham­
pionships as it will be the 
strongest club seen in the 
Atlantic region in the last ten 
years.

Head coach Lois MacGre­
gor. in making the announce­
ment, stated that she felt 
Hogg would be a great asset to 
the team as she has many new 
and innovative techniques. 
Additionally, having acted as

Dalhousie Tigers Women’s 
Volleyball Team has a new 
assistant coach in the person 
of Norma Hogg. A native of 
Summerside. P.E.I.. Hogg is 
no stranger to the Dalhousie 
Volleyball scene having com- 
peted with the varsity team for captain for the Tigers for the

past two seasons. Hogg will be 
able to instill her experience 
and knowledge into the team. 

MacGregor also stated her

four seasons. A level one 
coach. Hogg is presently 
working towards her level two 
certification.

Athletes of week Mmm
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submit the names of their 
outstanding performers each 
week. The winner is chosen by 
an independent selection com­
mittee.

Each week Dalhousie Uni­
versity's Athletic Department 
will select “athletes of the 
week" in men's and women's 
play.

The coaches are asked to -
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Mary Delmas - Field Hockey

A second year Commerce 
student from Fredericton. 
Mary was outstanding last 
weekend as the Tigers won a 
pair of field hockey games on 
the road. She assisted on five 
of the seven goals scored and 
played outstanding games de­
fensively as well. She played 
for Fredericton High and for 
the New Brunswick Provincial 
Junior Team.

Dave Riddell - Soccer
Now playing his third year 

for the Soccer Tigers. Riddell 
has been the offensive spark­
plug through the early games. 
Last weekend Dave scored 
once against Mount Allison 
and three times against 
U.P.E.I. During the first 
weekend of play in the Lauren- 
tian Tournament, 
scored twice against Univer- 

•4*- sity of Toronto.
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KOREAN ART OF SELF DEFENCE
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t ‘SELF-CONFIDENCE 
‘SELF-DEFENCE 
‘WEIGHT CONTROL 
‘LADIES FIGURE

CONTROL 
‘SELF CONTROL
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Classes;
Mon. to Fri. 12:30-2pm 

and 5:00-10pm 
Sat & Sun 12:30 - 2pm

k *A ^Ritm flavoured. 
Wine dipped.

* SPECIAL INSTRUCTION FOR WOMEN

MASTER:KWANG KIM-6th Degree Black Belt
(INTERNATIONAL TAB KWON-DO INSTRUCTOR)

PHONE 423-8401 
KWANG KIM INSTITUTE OF TAE KWON-DO

a.

packofColts 
along with the beer.

m
AFTER HOURS 
CALL 443-5789

1252 HOLLIS ST., HALIFAX. N. S.
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