
irttion frein the regular picture detecte1
w-ithout Conscious thought. And a v'ariet.y
limiter (loesn't necessai'ily imply a variety
collector. The pleusure is largely in hunt-
in- and flnding (anticipation exceeds reali-
zlition) and anyt.hing fouind ean he rettdily
(isl>05ed( of if riot wanteil for yourself.
Even on dealers approval sheets, finds niay
soinetimes be made, unleé!s philatelie
writers prevarieate. Some varieties are
glaringly apparent, am for instance the Die
A of the prebent 2 cent envelope; others
aeain are bard to deqcribe even with a
specimen in hand. The American, National
and Continental Prints of the 1870-79
stamps are regular cryptograms, and the
penalty attacbed to publishing cuts, corn-
Iîined with the studious8 avoidance of Iucid
description on the part of cataloguera,
renders it next to impossible for the aver-
agie collector to identify each print. But
!soine one finda out these sub-varieties, and
usualty with profit to, himself, and every
coltector when turning away from a batch
of common stamps should feel sure that he
hasn't left anything good tiierein, to be
found by some more painstaking observer.
The abov'e bas been in my mind since hear-
iig of a succession of finds by a collector-
dealer in 'Washington white looking oe-er
what were suppoEed to be the veriest of
trabh. The 3 cent of 18I61 in rose is worth
about le, the 3c "Premier gravure" of the
same year is worth $60; this coliector found
one of these latter in a search for shade var-
ietie.s of the conimon stamp, and many
more may be drifting around in 100 bunch.
es of the one cent type. He also unearthed
(so to, speak) some of the "double paper"
st4imps of the 1882 1 and 3 cent values.
These were devised to [)revent washing,
and consisted of an upper thinner layer

of paper upon a thicker, the thin layer
havng for each stamnp a circle of sinal
perforations, through which the ink would
jSs to the layer beneath. A eonsiderable
nunnber of these were issued, but they are
rare. Ri bbed paper speci mens are also
worth looking out for. So the collector
should always have hb eyes open, and
neyer beconie set in the ideu that because
a st4mp is common, there may not he un-
discovered rare variations§ froîn one geiieral
type.

Argentine Republic.
Its Rule and Raiers, 1860-1880.

BY APiEMANTUS.

Bartolomne Mitre was born in Buen.os
Ayres June 26th 1821. He was banislied
by Rosas, but took lxart in the overthrow
of Rosas in 1852. He held sevreal impcr.

tant offices until in 1861 his army <iefeated
Urguiza's, whieh put an end to the Fed-
eralist Systeni. In 1862, Mitre was elected
to t.he presidency of the Argentine Confed-
eration. In 1865, a few months after the

breaking out of war between Brazil and
Paraguay, Mitre refused the requesit of Pres

ident Lopez to permit the Paraguayan
army passing through one of the Argentine

Provinces, neutrality having been previous-
ly dclared. Upon this refusai, Lopez cap-
tured two vensels of the Argentine Navy

and took possession of one of the ports, af -
terward marching bis army acros Argen-

tine territory. The Argtntines were iso in-

dignant at this proeeeding on the part of

the Paraguayans that on May lât the
Triple Alliance wus formed. Mitre took

the field at the head of the Argentine
troops (afterwards mde commander-mn-

chief of the allied forces) through this camn-
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