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alrea(ly on this case. She is an unusually competent woman, in
whom I have the rnost implicit confidence. Then began one of
the hardest batties of some years in my experience. I ordered
high enemas of glyco-thymoline in 25 per cent. solution, and
warm. Useci four ounces at a tirne, with a soft rubber catheter
once every three bours. The child could retain nothing, was in
frightful pain, and passing constantly thin, foul-smelling dis-
charges tinged with blood. The chilci was emaciated to the last
degree, andi for several days before I was called had been in a
semni-conscious state. The poor littie baby was a pitiful sight.
For nourishment I ordered several combinations to be adminis-
tere(l, an ounce at a time, as a rectal clyster following the enemas
of glyco-thymoline. I know it is flot good practice to give
hypoclermics to an infant, but this wvas a grave case. My prede-
cessor had ordered gr. 1/64 morphine, gr. i/96o atropin, sub. q.
every four hours, if needed, with strychnine 1/240 gr., if neces-
sary. I continued this, as the baby was often in intense pain,
ai-d there seemed to be no other way. This xvas mny plan of
campaign, and I anm hoth thankful and please(l that it was
successful. The baby improved f rom the first, but so slowly that
it wàs scarcely (liscernible to the parents, but the nurse and miyself
saw it. After tbree days the cbild could take some nourishment
per oram. I then gave :2 mn. of glyco-thymoline in one ounce of
water every two hours before feeding. It began to have short
perio(ls of natural rest, and the discharges were in every way
improved. At the end of a week (Auigust. 14 th) the improve-
ment was quite marked, but we did not relax our vigilance. The
hypodermics, except of strychnine, were discontinuied. The
enemas were continued flfteen days, once everv three hours, then
at less frequent intervals for a month , then once a day for six
weeks. The recovery of the little patient wvas long and slow, but
uneventful. The mother and nurse were devoted, and ably
seconcled my efforts. At this time the baby is a strong, rosy
youingster. Tt gives me great pleasure to tell you of this case.
The experience nmay be of value, and it certainly proved to miy
satisfaction at least, the potential possibilities of glyco-thymoline
in gastro-intestinal work. May you be speeded in your good
work.-By W. O. Cori), M.D., Easthampton, Mass.

THE ROLE 0F IRON IN TUTE NUTRITIVE PROCESS.-It is an
established custom of physicians to adininister iron whenever a
patient with pale, waxy, or sallow complexion coniplains of
extreme exhaustion, muscular feebilness, easily accelerated
pulse, aplaxia, anorexia an(l the several synmptomis which consti-
tute the clharacteristic issues of a qualitative or quantitative


