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The SOLICITOR GENEJIAL began by
obMrviiiR, ihnt,uhep U>iA ^niporlaDt 8ul)ject

was r«rerrcJ tu n select cominitt«e. the house
nod the country had a right to expect that an
able, 8tatesm<y)-)U<e auii temperate report

would have heeln^^ad'j. containing intellit.ible,

if Dot cunviucing nr^uments, aud referring to

authorities which u-uuld at least have the np-
pearauco ofpliiusihiliiy, ifthey were untTnund
absolutely conclusive in favor of the views of

its fratners :—ho regreued however to state

that in these expectations the country at least,

ifoot the house, tvould be completely disap-

pointed. The dispassionate and intelligent

reader of the voluminous document then lyin;;

OD the tahin, would search in vain throughout
its pages for dignity of aentimenc, patriotic

views, or cidni, coovinciog argument illustra-

tive of truth : while, as a literary production,

it ivould he found to be beneath criticism,

—

aod in its general style and language, so mark
fld with an utter disregard of all delicacy of

feeling, and the ordinary courtesies of life, as

to render it a dis;;r<ice to any legislative body
that mi^tit sanction its promulgation. The
speech of the Cliairraao of the committee,
which had been addressed tu the house, was
but a repetition of the leading statements con-
tained in ilie report, ;iiid like tlie report itself,

contained nut oite stdid argument, to sustain

the new aotl most extraordinsiry inierpreta-

'ion of <Mir (j'onsiiiution which had s«(ldenly

broken i^i upon the minds of some of our self-

styled reformers. It would not be surprising,

therefore, if, in the course of the remarks he
should Htlrlress to ihc house, he should nut re-

fer very Crequeiitly either to the report or to

the speech of the Chairman, asinf-ict his prin-

cipal duty would be, to endeavor to supply in-

formation wliicli iiadheen altogether overlook-

ed or disregarded by the advocates of the new
theory. Itiipjieared to him that the point to

which till* eouiinittee should have turned their

attention, w.istlu; ori;;in of Executive Coun-
cils in tlu> (yidonies,— the duties originally as-

signed to tliiMo.— arid llie respoosil)iliiy, if any,

which r.Kielied to them as Counciihtrs :—had
this com-; ' been adopted l)y the Committee,
they would h.ive hcen j;reatly assisted in com-
ing to a correct conclusion—and why they

ttnd not (lone so, he would not stop to enquire,

but leave ii ;u the poldic to conjecture motives

of which they could form as good an opiiiion

as he couhi. Another advantage which would
i|ave resulted from this piau of iuveslig^tiuu,

had it been adopted, would have been, that the
committee would have infurmed themselves of
the utter itnpnssihility of the Lieutenant Go-
vernor's divesting himself of respousibilitf, and
that liy the Laws and Constitution, he is em-
phatically and distinctly responsible to the

King as the head of the Empire, politically
;

and to the people of this Province, individual-

ly, in his private capacity, for every art of his

Government, and that the Executive Council
are not and cannot be made responsible to the

people for any acts of theirs. VViihont further

I'omark he (the Sol. Gen.) would proceed to

show on what grounds and upon what author-

ities he rested these opinions. There'were not

many works extant containing a history of the

Constitutions and forms of Government in the

Colonies, but there were a few, and some of

them giving a very explicit account of the

Councils appointed by the Crown,— their du-

ties and responsibilities, especially io the Col-
onies in America ; and in order to attract the

attention of the House tu the line of argument
he intended to pursue, ho begged bun. mem-
bers would bear in mind that it would eveo-

tiially appear, that the Executive Council of

Upper Canada, which it was contended was
created by. as well as identified with, the Cno-
stiiution of the Province, (as conferred by the

Slst Geo. 3,) was merely the continuation of a
body that had existed in Canada from the first

n\. metit of anorgatiized Government after the

Conquest, down to the period of the passing

of that Act which divided the Province of Que-
bec into Upper and Lower Canada,— and
which was precisely similar to those existing

in the old Colonies, on this Continent and the

West Indies.—The first anthority he should

cite in support of this argument was that of a
gentleman who held the olRce of Chief Jus-

tice of Georgia, during the time that State was
a (Colony of Great IJritairi, and subsequently

held 111;;!) legal appoininienis in the West In-

dies. 'I'his gentleman in his remarks on the

Council says,

—

"They are to give advice to the Governor
or Coiomander-iiiChief for the time being

u'!nn thereunto required; and they stand in

the same relation to tiie Governor in a Colony
that the Priuy Council does to the King in

Great Britain : in some cases the Governor
can act without their advice and concurrence,

aod there are other cases in which the Gover-
nor is requited by his instructions aol to act

without the advice aud concuirence of h'u
i

Council"
nor and (

attend to.
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