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and ppt half of the colonies into it about 
the 20th of November, 1887. The other 
half of the colonies had been packed on 
the summer stands about the 1st of Oc- 
lolier with foirest leaves. All the col 
onies that were wintered in the cellar and 
all that were packed on the summer 
Hands came through to spiing in fine 
condition, and it was impossible to see 
any difference early in that spring (1888) 
between the colonies that had lieen win­
tered in the cellar and those that were

on the summer stands, and while that 
was small I wits thankful for it, because 
1 got no honey from the colonies that 
had lieen wintered in the cellar. This 
experiment that 1 tried on a large scale 
proved to me that colonies well prepared 
and parked early in the fall on the sum­
mer stands will give best results in this 
latitude than any cellar, no matter how 
good it might be.

Woodburn, January 9, 1911.

PARTIAL VIEW OF MR. JOHN L. BYARD'S APIARIES.

The hive marked X contains a queen on which he won a $5.00 prize 
at the Southhoro Orange Fair, Sept. 23rd, 1910.

packed on the summer stands. When 
going through the .spiring the colonies 
that were packed on the summer stands 
gained on those that had been wintered 
in the cellar, and by the 1st of June had 
almost double the bees in their hives. 
The honey season of 1888 was one of the 
poorest we ever had, but poor as it was 
I got about half a crop of clover honey 
from the colonies that bad been packed

EIGHT OR TEN FRAME—WHICH?
*nd»*ed -----------

I noticed in the last numbelr of your 
journal that the question of eight or ten 
frames is receiving attention once more. 
Now, as 1 am in favor of the eight frame 
I would like to ask a few questions :

1. Is it not easier to handle a yard of 
bees in eight-frame hives?

2. Can’t you build up a colony in


