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LITERATURE.

MT UNCLE’S GIG.
BT OBOBOl AUGUSTUS (ALB.

My uno'e Fred was à gay man 
The complaint, I have reason to 
think, has run in the family for many 
generations; and I hope that the 
descendants of my nephesrs and 
nieces may continue to indulge In 
gaiety, inspired by discretion, for 
many generations to oome. The 
only drawback connected with my 
uncle Fred was that, while he never 
missed an opportunity of being gay, 
he sometimes forgot to be discreet. 
In fact, had a special entry been 
made against his name on every par­
ticular occasion when the inherent 
gaiety of my uncle Fred compelled 
him to make a fool of himself, con­
ducing to his subsequently getting 
into a terrible scrape, the recording 
spirit mentioned by the late Mr. 
Sterne, in “ Tristram Shandy,” and 
by the Right Honorable Lord Byron 
in hie “ Vision,” would have been 
compelled to order a new set of 
ledgers, and engage a new set of 
clerks, solely for the purpose of 
keeping my uncle Fred's debit and 

"credit account. Tes; there was 
something to register on the credit 
side—for a warmer hearted, more 
generous and upright fellow than my 
uncle Fred never existed, nor travel­
led in the wholesale pickles, sauces 
and preserved fruit line. He was 
extremely charitable ; a fast friend 
to all commercial travellers—in my 
uncle Fred's days commercial gents 
were sometimes called bagmen—fal­
len upon evil ways ; he was a sound 
Church and State man. a Mason, a 
member of a Glee and Catch Clnb— 
“ the Jolly Blind Men Association,” 
indeed ; and a capital judge of old 
port. “ But for my being almost 
always on the wing,” my uncle Fred 
was accustomed to say “ I don’t see 
why I shouldn't be church-warden of 
my parish. Net rector's church­
warden, mind ; I am not quite moral 
enough for that.” As it was,-Freil 
was a member of litnd standing of 
one of the select vestries—bodies 
wjijeh, forty years ago, partook more 
•f a harmonic and convivial nature 
than the presentstuck-up conventions 
known as “ representative councils ” 
are apt to do. My uncle flourished 
in the good old days before the New 
Poor Law. If a parishioner was a 
substantial householder and a good 
fellow, they put him on the select 
vestry, and there he generally re­
mained for life. As fir thé poor, 
they were left to the master of the 
workhouse, who as far as was prac­
ticable, left the poor to themselves. 
The parishioners obediently paid 
such rente as were imposed upon 
them ; and the select vestry treated 
themselves to nice little tavern din­
ners, and rural excursions in the 
summer to Highgate or Thames Dlt- 
ton, out of the surplus of the paro­
chial revenues. There was no high 
and mighty Board at Somerset House 
to worry and interfere with the 
guardians of the poor; and although, 
of course, the system of relief was 
dreadfully faulty, and the law gene­
rally, a scandal to civilization, my 
uncle Fred—who survived the pass­
ing of the new 1\x>r Law many 
years—used to say in his old ago, 
that paupers didn’t die of starvation 
when he was a young man.

Pickles, sauces a53 preserves were, 
as I have said, the articles in which 
my uncle did business, and a capital 
man of business he was, too. He 
embraced the three kingdoms in his 
periodical journeys, and from the 
Land’s End to John o’ Groat’s, from 
Whittlesea Mere to Salisbury Plain, 
fiom the Isle of Man to the Giant’s 
Causeway, he had made known (he 
virtues of Stump of Leafby’s super­
ior and unrivalled East India Pickles, 
of Timour the Tartar's Samaroand 
Sauce, that delicious flavoring for 
cold meats, hashes, stews and game 
—none of whom are genuine without 
the signature of Stump and leaf by, 
to counterfeit which is felony ; and 
of the Arabian Extract of Ripe 
Gooseberries, together with all the 
other condiments, from pickled 
onions to anchovy paste, from guava 
jelly to dansom cheese, In which 
Stump and Leafby dealt. My uncle 
when a very old man, more than 
once Informed us that in bis day, 
people epent less on their backs, and 
more on their—well, on their atom- 
achs.

For all this gaiety, my uncle was 
such an active, Intelligent fellow, and 
in business matters so thriftly.that he 
throve and throve more every year, 
and hie friends often wondered that 
he should be content to remain a 
mere bagman—I beg pardon, a com­
mercial gent. He bad saved enough 
to give up travelling, or to become a 
junior partner in the house he repres­
ented, or to start In business on bis 
own account, years ago; but my 
unde continued to explore the three 
kingdoms at given times of the year 
in quest of orders, and moreover 
proclaimed hie intention of persisting 
in this course, until he was old and 
infirm and laid on the shelf. “I 
like the road,” said my uncle Fred, 
“and the road likes me; aud I 
mean to stick to it." So he-popped 
four or five thousand pounds—my 
uncle tnsde a very good thing of 
some quiet speculations In shares In 
•26, and was prudent enough to re­
alize Just before the panic—into 
Stump and Leafby’s house ; and not 
only let It lie there at good interest, 
but was eventually admitted in mod­
ified participation in the profita of 
the firm. He might have called him­
self a Junior partner, without incur­
ring the risk of being hauled over

you dined with my uncle, you might 
make yourself perfectly easy as to 
>he particular old port, and the no 
lees particular sherry, which he 
placed on the table after dinner. In 
those days, people were not ashamed 
to drink beer at dinner, and wine— 
a good of wine, too—after it ; and I 
can't see that murder, robbery, fer­

tile coals for the assumption ; but 
my unde was not a man to give 
himself airs, and he considered him­
self sufficiently honored by being re­
cognized In every leading town in 
England, Scotland, Wales and Ire­
land ; as senior traveler and collector 
for Stump and Leaiby, of St.Martin's 
Lane, London. You know their 
great pickle and preserve warehouse, 
round which, for scores of yards, 
there hangs, all the year round, a 
warm and pungent odor of a house­
keeper’s still-room.

My uncle had also a very comfort­
able nest-egg. In the way of L, S. D„ 
in a quiet-going house in the Cadiz horseflesh in bis stable at Edge- 
end Oporto trade, in Eastcbeap. If j ware. He was the best whip bn the

flirtations and limited mail love 
makings with the -oung ladies who 
dispense pork pies, and scalding 
soup, and cups of tea, at the Swin­
don and Wnlverton refreshment- 
rooms; but, in the year ’28, com­
mercial gentlemen, not yet acquaint­
ed with fast trains, found stage 
coaches too slow for them, and 
made their journeys on the King’s 
Highway in gigs, buggies, and 
phaetons. My uncle had a Couple 
of “ traps ”—and a light elegant one 
for the summer, a heavy affair with 
a hood for the winter, and no less 
than three good, sound pieces of

North Road, and from Pinner to 
Preston there could not have been 
seen on the smooth turnpike a neater 
nor better turnout than hie. And, 
wherever my uncle went, he made 
love ; whether at the little roadside 
hostelry, where he halted to bait bis 
horse, or a( the commercial inn where 
he put up, 'or at toy shop—if there

gery and swindling were much more hapiiened to be a pretty girl behind
rife forty years ago tnan they are 
now. With nandsome annual divid­
ends coming in then from hie sunken 
capital in the pickle and preserve 
line; with some very snug little 
picking from the wine business in 
Eastehesp ; with a handsome salary 
and a liberal allowance for travelling 
expenses from tbe firm whom he al­
ways delighted to speak of as “ my 
honored employers,”—it wilt be clear 
that my uncle Fred was rather in an 
enviable position as regard this 
world’s goods than otherwise.

At the time to which this story 
refers, he was just a little on the 
sunny side of forty —about thirty 
nine, eleven months and a few weeks, 
I should say ; he was rather a good 
looking fellow, with a bright eye, a 
fresh complexion, a capital set of 
teeth, and a formidable pair ofbnshy, 
black whiskers. He told a story 
excellently and sang a capital song. 
He had a comfortable cottage, hand­
somely furnished at Edgeware ; and 
finally, he was a bachelor. Surely 
he ought to have been one of the 
happiest of mortals.

“ ’Tis woman that seduces all man­
kind,” tne old song says ; and since 
the days of Mrs. Eve and her apple, 
this indictment has gone forth 
against the fair sex, and has been 
declaired a true bill by Innumerable 
and unanimous grand juries of men. 
It is true that tbe ladies declare they 
are libelled, and and that if anybody 
be amenable to a criminal charge for 
Inveigling and cajoling their fellow 
creatures, the ruder sex are the real 
culprits. However the men have in 
most ages of the world’s history suc­
ceeded in getting and keeping the 
upper hand, and their diatribes 
against women have consequently 
obtained the more credence. In par­
ticular, in all communities, . save 
those of the Quakers, the arrogant 
lords of the creation have usurped 
possession of the pulpit, and there Is 
no end to the sermons and homilies 
that have been preached against 
feminine follies and vices. “ Like 
as the kicking of a mule is often­
times with wine hindered, so con­
trariwise, the malapert sauciness of 
a woman is with wine provoked.” 
“ Like a man who is stung with 
bees, and does thereupon forsake the 
honey, even such a wife who, being 
offended with the manners of her 
husband, doth forsake him.” “ As 
none doth feel and perceive so well 
in what place the shoe doth wring 
him as the wearer, so none doth

wife as he that is married unto her.” 
These are tbe polite and gallant 
things, ladies, which your spiritual 
pastors used to say against you in 
old times ; aud now-a-days, in lieu 
of sermons, there are secular preach­
ers, in newspapers and reviews, who 
are never tired of inditing bitter 
leading articles and essays against 
tbe sex. Now, my uncle Fred—I 
must say at once for all—bad much 
too high a degree of admiration for 
the sex to speak spitefully or dis­
paragingly of them. No railer at 
the “ girls of the period,” no castiga- 
tor of “ frisky matrons,” a lover of 
tbe sex was he; for, although he 
lived long before the day otchignons, 
there were “ gelle ” of the period, 
and matrons in the year 1828 who 
were “ frisky,” and ladies of 
“ a certain age,” not so young as 
they had been. My uncle Fred ad­
mired them all. He called them 
habitually the “dear creatures. He 
kissed the tips of bis Ungers when 
be spoke of them. I should blush 
to think that my revered and now 
deceased relative was what Is deemed 
a rake. I don’t believe that he was. 
I don’t think, even, that any distinct 
accusation of deliberate profligacy 
could be brought home to him ; but 
there is no blinking the fact that he 
was—well, what shall we say?—a 
“ male flirt,” a “ gallant, gay, 
Lothario,” an “ Inconstant swain,” 
a “gay deceiver?"—no; he was a 
“general lever !”

My uncle waa quite correct in de­
claring he liked the road, and that 
the road liked him ; but the worst of 
It waa, that he liked so many people 
on the road who belonged to the 
fairer portion of humanity I don’t 
know how many thousands of miles 
my uncle traversed during hie 
business Journeys in the course of 
every year ; but I don’t think I am 
overshooting the mark when I say 
that he must have made love to at 
least one comely damsel for every 
ten miles be drove. There were no 
railways you see, in those timne ; so 
that my ancle’s flirtations if measured 
by distance, were many, and not far 
between. If he bad flourished in 
these Woe tinea, be would have been 
the very man to get up express

the counter, or a rubicund mistress 
in the parlor—It was always the 
same stary. He made love to the 
landladies,to the landladies’ daughter 
to the barmaids, and to the chamber­
maids, at every inn in every county 
in Englandr Tbe grocer’s petty 
niece quivered with excitement 
when my uncle Fred-came in, pickles, 
preserves, and sauces, on bis 
plausible tongue, but flirtation in 
his wicked eye. So incorrigible was 
that eye, that the depraved. organ 
had been known to wink at the 
buxom daughters of turnpike-gate 
keepers, as they stepped ont to take 
toll. He made love to provincial 
post-mistresses through tbe little 
hole in the post-office window,when he 
went to ask for hie letters. When 
he was in London, he made love all 
round ; in public-house bar-parlors— 
people were not ashamed of frequent­
ing taverns in those days ; — in 
pastrycook’s shops; in the public 
street—yea, even on the Sabbath, 
coming home from church, would that 
audacious uncle of mine indulge hie 
umallve propensities. Hie person I 
have already described ; and when I 
assure you that gentleman used to 
dress somewhat nattily In those day’s 
and that the ordinary costume of my 
relative was a chocolate-colored 
body-coat, with gilt buttons, a buff 
waistcoat, a blue-spotted necker­
chief, and a neatly plaited shirt frill, 
with a diamond brooh in the contre, 
buckskin smalls, top-boots (in Lon­
don, he wore stocking-net pantaloons 
and Hessians), a white hat, and a 
great bunch of seals in hie fob, and 
that he always kept in stock a seem­
ingly inexhaustible supply of verbal 
small change which is vulgarly 
termed “ soft sawder,” you. may 
imagine that he was just the sort of 
fellow to get on with the women, 
and produce the deepest impressions 
on their tender hearts. And yet 
there was no barm in my uncle 
Fred. He was accustomed, himself, 
to declare most vehemently t|)pt if 
any evil intentions towards the fair 
sex he waa as innocent as the babe 
unborn. Nobody could say he was a 
libertine ; but ail the women con­
curred in saying that he was gay. 
He was supposed to pass the twelfth 
and thirteenth day of every February 
solely occupied in writing valentines ; 
and he always presented balf-a- 
crown to the postman who brought 
him a bndget of love-lorn corres­
pondence on Valentine’s Day Itself. 
“ Love-letters !" my hardened kins-

iow so well the perversity of bis man used to cry ; “ I’ve got tons of
’em down at my place at Edgeware. 
Locks of hair I I can show ’em to 
you by the sackful." His male ac­
quaintances used to slap him on the 
back, and tell him that he was a 
lucky dog.” Young men studied my 
uncle Fred’s “ make up," and took 
him as a model to dress by. They 
tried to mould their morals after hie ; 
but generally failed, degenerating 
into vulgar dissipation, or else tell­
ing fibs about conquests which, with 
their exemplar, were facts. My 
uncle, in fact, was unique. He was 
a non-criminlal Lovelace—a Don 
Giovanni without guile ; so he said. 
The women aseeverated that he was 
a monster, a betrayer, a wretch, a 
vile creature, a cruel and pitiless de- 
ceivsr-t but they continued to return 
my uncle Fred’s winks by encour­
aging smiles, and he grew gayer 
than ever. The only thing that 
gave him concrrn waa the appre­
hension that, irritated by an In­
curable inconstancy, a combat 
organization of buxom widows and 
old maids should be formed to seize 
upon my uncle Fred, and marry him 
by force.

But this kind of thing cannot go on 
for ever. My unde Fred waedeetiqed 
to be cured, and in a very elrange 
manner, of his adddletedness to pro­
miscuous gaiety; end the manner 
In which his reformation was brought 
about, I shall how briefly narrate.

Forty years ago, the environs of 
London were grievously afflicted with 
footpads. It seems to me that there 
is always an average amount of 
criminality in this world ; that when 
society is not troubled with a Robin 
Hood, we have a Dick Turpin, a 
Golden Farmer, a Claude, DnVal, or 
a Jerry Aherahaw ; that, by the way 
of change for such rufflns, we only 
get a Jack Sheppard, a Bill Sykes, 
a Marlsy, a “ Scotty,” or a « velvet 
band;”—In short, that society is 
compelled to pass through per­
iodically recurring oydes of outlaws, 
banditti, highwaymen, housebreak­
ers, garrotters and roughs.

When tbe criminal classes are 
tolerably quiet, which happens now 
and then, there arises a nice little
war, sod peaceful countries are in- 
vaded by tens

threats and ruffians, instead of being 
ravaged by individual villians. and 
our lives are sacrificed, and our 
property devastated, wholesale and 
not in detail. Well, our chief social 
courses in 1868 were > lie roughs and 
garrotters of Whitechapel, and 
Endell Street, and the purlieus of 
Westminister. You could scarcely 
walk from Bloomsbury Square to 
the Strand without the risk of being 
knocked down, strangled ' and dis­
pelled of your vatualdes by some 
strapping young soon idrel just out 
of the reformatory school. Railway 
stations and carriage t swarm with 
pickpockets and card sharpers ; and 
if a vagabond insults you in the 
street, and you secure him, with the 
Intention of handing him over to the 
police, you are at once surrounded 
by a gang of brutal roughs, who 
hustle and stone you, and would 
probably murder you if they had a 
chance. Society is naturally thrown 
Into a frenzy of terror and indigna­
tion by those outrages ; and we hear 
of nothing but the necessity of 
flogging garrotters and roughs, or 
committing them to penal servitude 
in double irons for the term of their 
natural lives. As if we hadn’t tried 
the cat-o’nine-tails and double irons 
—ay, and the gallows, too—over and 
over again in by gone times, and 
with very slight beneficial results ! 
In 1828, there was a popular panic, 
arising from the prevalence of foot- 
puds. Sixteen-string Jack was the 
last of the highwaymen of the Capt. 
Macheatb pattern. Post-chaises was 
no longer stopped on Finchley Com­
mon by well-mounted vagabonds, 
in scarlet roquelaures, richly laid 
with gold," and black vizors over 
their faces, who held a pistol at 
your head, and in the politest terms, 
bade you “ Stand and deliver." The 
“ Yer money or your life," business 
had now fallen into the bands of 
mere vulgar rascals, although they 
too often wore masks and carried 
fire-arms ; but they robbed on foot, 
and generally choose for their depre­
dations that time in the afternoon 
when gentlemen engaged in business 
during the day were returning to 
their suburban residences. This was 
about five o’clock in winter, and 
eight o'clock in summer, after the 
stream of wagons and tradesmen’s 
narta had ceased, and before the 
horse patrol from Bow Street—the 
Immediate precursor of the metro 
politan police force, which was not 
established until 1829—had gone on 
duty. The roads surrounding London 
were at this time of the day left en­
tirely without protection, and the 
footpads consequently availed them­
selves unsparingly of the tempting 
opportunity. The lady and juvenile 
inhabitants of the pretty villa re­
sidences just beginning to crop up 
about Kilbnrn and Cricklewood— 
about Highgate and Hornsey—about 
Fulham and North End—about 
Hammersmith and Turnham Green 
—were kept in a continuous paroxysm 
of alarm, least papa should be 
brought home on a shutter, with a 
bullet through hie chest or his bead 
broken, and his watch and pocket- 
book gone. Nor was the state of 
alarm groundless. The era of the 
great European wars was as yet too 
recent for the metropolis to have be­
come free from swarms of reprobates, 
who, in the days before Waterloo, 
might have enlisted in the army, or, 
to the great Joy of honest folk, being 
being seized by press-gangs ; and 
the science of emigration was in its 
infancy In 1828. Besides footpads, 
the neighborhood of the capital was 
Infested by gypsies, beggars and 
tramps, and by even a more danger­
ous and despicable race of villains, 
the body-snatchers, or “ resurrection 
men,” who prowled about surburban 
churchyards on the evenings of 
funerals, and were beginning to add 
the hideous crime of “ burking ” to 
their predatory misdeeds.

It chanced one very cold and rainy 
morning, in the spring of 1828, that 
my uncle Fred, having just completed 
one of bis business journeys to tbe 
West or England, was enjoying a 
fortnight’s leizure, which be spent 
with tolerable impartiality between 
bis cotta,»e and Edgeware. My uncle 
Fred had been spending a very 
pleasant time. My uncle waa a very 
steady drinker, and boasted that he 
could put away two bottles “without 
turning a hair.” I don't know the 
precise amount of liquid which he 
put away on the night of the rump 
and dozen—perhaps the arrack pnnob 
didn't count—but he owned that he 
felt rather feverish by the time tbe 
party broke up. Soda-water was not 
an article of general consumption In 
1828, so my uncle took a tolerably 
large bumper of brundy-and-water, 
cold, at the bar, to allay his feverish­
ness. There was a remarkably plump 
young lady, behind the bar of the

Angel ;’’ and if the parting saluta­
tion of that young lady to my uncle 
Fred did not consist, of a slap— 
quite in fun, you know—adminis­
tered to one of his black whiskers, 
and a giggling exclamation of “ Go 
along with you, Imperence I” all I 
can eay is, that tbe narrator of this 
history has been grossly misinform­
ed. Tom Archdale, with two or 
three other choice spirits, proposed a 
visit to the English Opera House, to 
see “ Der Freischutz ;” but my uncle 
Fred said be had seen enough life 
for that evening, and announced bis 
intention of having Ids mare put to 
—he always kept a “ tray ” at Sur­
cingle’s II Very stable, in Craven 
Yard,, Drury Lane—and of driving 
home to Edgeware. So be bade his 
friends good night ; saw the mare 
harnessed ; and calling at the “ Old 
Hummume ” for his white top-coat ;

West End

ware Road, towards home. It be 
bovea me, as an impartial historian, 
to admit that when my uncle Fred 
announced his determination to quit 
the choice spirits who had partaken 
of the rump and dozen, be happened 
to remember that at the “ Fortune of 
War” inn, Cricklewood, there was 
an exceedingly well-favored landlady 
with whom be was on excellent 
terms, and who would gladly give 
him a cup of tea, and a steaming 
bumper of pnnch afterwards. 8o he 
pulled up tbe mare at Cricklewood, 
and had her rubbed down, and then 
betook himself to the bar-parlor, 
where the well-favored landlady was 
oveijoyed to see him—it is true that 
she addressed him as a “ dreadful,* 
naughty, wicked man," but that 
was only her fun, yog know,— 
and where she made a capital dish 
of tea, with a round of buttered 
toast, and a slice of broiled ham— 
what appetites they had forty years 
ago ! —and subsequently served that 
steaming bumper of punch of which 
I suoke anon.

My uncle Fred was getting on 
very comfortably ; and I must say, 
that bis invariable habit was to get 
on, under any and all circumstances, 
as comfortably aq ever he possibly 
could. “ We must grease the wheels 
of life; we must take things easily !” 
he was wont to sav when ho stretch­
ed his legs after dinner, and held up 
a glass of right old port to the light. 
It was about eleven o’clock, and my 
uncle was finishing his punch, and 
beginning to think that it waa about 
time to have the mare put to, and 
resume his journey, when the ostler 
—the barmaid bad gone to bed-.-put 
bis head in at the door, and an­
nounced there were three gentlemen 
in a chaise outside, and they wanted 
two nine-penn'orths of brandy-and- 
water, hot, strong, and sweet, 
directly.

“ Why not three nine-penn’orths?” 
the well-favored landlady, who had 
a keen eye to business, said, as she 
bustled about, making the necessary 
preparations.

“ Perhaps Number Three’s a 
Methodist, and thinks it sinful to 
drink brandy-and water?" my uncle 
Fred suggested, jocosely. Teetotal­
ers were only just beginning to be 
heard of fivo-and-forty years ago.

I think Number Three’s had 
enough of summat, whatever it is," 
the ostler Interposed, with a grin 
that had an admixture of uneasiness 
in It.

The landlady, a notable woman 
for pleasing her customers, high and 
low. Insisted on carrying the brandy- 
and-water to the door herself. My 
uncle, gallant as usual, Insisted on 
accompanying her; besides, had he 
not hie mare to see too ? The ostler 
followed in their wake with a lan­
tern.

“The tall geut says the ’orse Is 
skittish, aud that’s why he can’t get 
out,” he remarked, as the procession 
crossed the threshold.

There war need for a light, for it 
was a very black, moonless night, 
and the rain was coming down 
heavily. As the ostler held up the 
lantern, my uncle saw, sitting in a 
roomy chaise, three men. One was 
short and round-shouldered ; the man 
on the off-side was a tall, burly, 
sturdy-looking fellow, who, with his 
big black whiskers, and white hat, 
and generally swaggering air, might 
have passed, to a superficial observer, 
for a vulgarised copy of my uncle 
Fred himself. The third, man, who 
was sitting between the two others, 
was clad in a long waterproof coat, 
which shone in the lamplight strange­
ly ; he was sitting bolt upright, bnt 
his head was bent downwards, and 
bis hat, which was very broad- 
brimmed, was so slouehed over his 
eyes, as, with the large silk scarf 
which enwrapped him, entirely to 
conceal his face.

The brandy-and-water was handed 
to the two men, and they speedily 
emptied the tumblers and returned 
them to the landlady, who, oourtsey- 
ing, asked Whether the gentleman in 
the middle wouldn’t take some.

“Not be," answered the short, 
thick-set man, with a coarse laugh ; 
“ hie bead couldn’t stand it. He's 
hbd,rather too much to-night.”

TO BE OOMTINUED.

drove through the West End to 
of thousands of eat Tyburn Gate, and so, by tbe Edge-

Tee London World tells the fol­
lowing story as a fact : “ A large 
wholesale Ironmonger from Sheffield 
was at Buxton a short time ago, 
and walking over the fields on Sun­
day afternoon with his little boy the 
following conversation took place: 
Son—* How big is hell, father—as 
big as big as thin field?' Father— 
‘ Ye?. I am afraid bigger than this 
field. Son—‘ Is it as ' big as these 
two fields together, father ?’ Father 
—‘ Yes, dear, as big as these two 
fields, and I am afraid as big as all 
these three ’ (pointing to another). 
Son—* I say, father, would you not 
like the order for the fender?* ”

Capt. Shaw, the Chief of the 
London Fire Brigade, it a tall, 
military-looking man ; be is an Irish­
man and an ex-officer of militia. He 
is a splendid whip, and hit coach and 
four is the admiration of all be­
holders. He is a famous waltzer, 
and ladies wish fires to the very Old 
Nick when the gallant CaptaUi Is 
suddenly called away on duty. ^

Hauer Ibviko, .the English actor, 
whose success dates from 1872, is a 
protege of the richest women In the 
world, viz., the Baroness Burdett 
Coutts, a knife and fork being daily 
laid for him at. her table. His fingers 
are double Jointed. His wife dis­
agrees with his acting, so they do 
not reside in the same nest. He ie 
tall and angular

Business Cards.
HANIN8T0N * WELLS,

tltonemt-Uw, Solicitors, Notaries Public, to.

DORCHESTER,” N. B.
D. HANINOTON. W. W. WILLS.

PDBSLEY, CRAWFORD k PUBSLEY,
Barristers and Attorneys-at-Lav,

10 PRINCE WS.IMT. JOHN, *. I. 
O.B.Pugsley. LH.Orswferd. W.Pngiley, Jr.

DICKSON & TRUEMAN,
Barristers * Attorneys-at-Law, Con­

veyancers, Notaries Public, Ac.

Dorchester and Sochilli, N. B.
OFFICES : Over the Port Office, Dorchester; 
Opposite 11. Wood ft Sont' Office, Sackrllls

Business Cards.
HICKMAN ft EMMER80N, 

Attorneys - at -Law, Ac.,
DORCHESTER, N. B.

A. J. Hickman. H. R. Emmkbsom.

Park Hotel,
DORCHESTER, N. B.

T. W. BELL, - - - Proprietor.

Joe. H. DICKSON. vx. A. TRUEMAN

A. E. OULTON,
barrister-at-law, solicitor,

Notary Publie, Conveyancer, Etc.
Ornoa - - - A. L. Palmer's Building,

Dorchester, It. B.
CHARLES R. SMITH, 

Barrister and Attorney - at-Law, 
Solicitor, Conveyancer, Notary 

Publio, Ao.
AMHBBST.......................... If. 8.

Prompt attention paid to the collection of 
debts and transaction of business generally.

F
V. F. COLEMAN, M.D., H. R. C. S. EN8.
ORMEIiLY Surgeon to Toronto Eye 

and Ear Infirmary.
Practice limited to diseases of the Eye 

and Ear.
Office—32. GERM AIN STREET, corner 

North Market Street,
SAINT JOHN, - - - 2 N. B

Hours : 11 to l,'and*2 to 5.

8TIMPS0N, WALLACE ft CO.,
MANUFACTURERS OF THR

Improved New Dominion

ORGANS.
ST. JOHN, - - - - N. B.
This is the mosr popular Organ manu­

factured in Canada.
Sales have doubled in six months.

Manufacture six per week. 

I^Seod for Circular and Price List.

DRESS-MAKING.
JvriLXjiJXTEivsr i

THE SUBSCRIBER wishes to intimate 
to the ladies of Sackville and vicinity, 

that he has added to his business a Dress
MAKING and Mll.LINh.RY DEPARTMENT, each
branch of which is under the supervision 
of a competent person, having had experi­
ence in first-class establishments in St. 
John. A good stock of DRESS GOODS 
and MILLINERY will be kept, which will 
be made up in Fashionable Styles and at 
reassnable prices.

Patronage respectfully solicited.

July 26 J. F. ALLISON.

MARBLE

AND

FREESTONE

WORKS.
H. J. McGRATH,

Dorchester, N. B.

HAVING purchased the entire Stock in 
Trade of Mr. Peter Hagan, and 

with his previously large Stock ot
ITALIAN, SOUTHERN FALLS, AND 

RUTLAND MARBLES.
the Subscriber has now one of the largest 
and best selected stock of Monumental 
Marbles to be found in the country. All 
Stock is guaranteed.

Prices twenty per cent, lower than 
any other Establishment in the Provinces.

AMHERST FOUNDRY
-AND-

MACH1NE SHOP,
KAMOFACTOBY OF

Mill & other Machinery,
Ship's Castings, Stores, 

HOLLOW WAS*, m WASH, 
PLOUGHS, AC. 

AMHERST, - - - NOVA SCOTIA.

Andres' Marble Works,
Amherst end Wallace, N. 8.

THE Subscriber having a large amount 
of superior ITALIAN and AMERI­

CAN MARBLE on hand,Is prepared to sell

Gravestones and Monuments
Of Either Quality, '

At greatly reduced prices. He has 
also a large amount of MARBLE and first 
quality FREESTONE at extremely low
£ rices. Also, Italian Marble Table and 

lounter Tops.
Persons are cautioned against buying 

Southern Falls American Marble for the 
Italian,as on account of their resemblance, 
it is frequently sold for the latter.

Persons wishing to purchase will find it 
decidedly to their advantage to call and 
examine for themselves before buying 
elsewhere.

All orders pibmptly attended to, and 
finished in a workmanlike manner. De­
signs stfht free when required.

•s B. ANDRES.
Amherst, NTS»? Dec. 12, 1876.

KTD. LUND, Agent for taking orders 
in Sackville and vicinity.

UNION HOTEL.
GEORGE V. SHAW, Proprietor.

Hopewell Corner, A. C.
T. W. BELL & Co.

ip Mnofachirero, - • Sbeliac, ». B.
The best and cheapest Soap in the 

Market.

BLAK8LEE ft WHITENEOT,
DEALERS IN

Paper Hums, Me Lead, Oile.Viriiiàei.âc.
22 Germain St., St. John, N. 0,

Business Cards.
CO-PARTNERSHIP CARO.

I HAVE tills day MiocUted Ma. H. B.
Emmebbom with me in proleutenal 

Co-Partnerihlp, and the buiinen hereafter 
will be conducted under the name, style 
and firm of

HICKS**A EM BEKS 61.
Dorchester, N. B.t > A. J. HICKMAN. 

Nov. 2nd, 1877. {

L. WESTERGAARD ft CO.,
Ship Agents ft Ship Brokers,

(Consulate of the Netherlands,) 
(Consulate of Austria and Hungary,)

Vo. 127 WALNUT ITSUT,

“’ I>m, 5oao. a. TowusHMi»,
Philadelphia.

inly s

T. S. SIMMS ft CO.,
Manufacturers of all kinds of Brushes 

and Corn Brooms,
” ’ No. 208 UlflON STREET, 

June U ST. JOHN, N. B.

George Nixon,
Wholesale and Retail Dealer ie

PAPER HANGING,
Bruîmes and Window Glass. 

Kura St. - - - St. John, N. B.

New Harness Shop.

THE .Subscriber has opened a Harness 
Shop opposite the Lawrence House, 

where he intends to

Manufacture Harneaeee
and do general repairing, at moderate

NATHAN O. BULMER. 
Sackville, Sept. 9tli, 1877.

NEW HARNESS SHOP
I HAVE OPENED, in connection with 

the old stand, a

- Retail and Repair Steep,
InCHIGNECTO HALL, Lower Sackville, 
where all my customers will be attended 
to promptly and at cheap rates,—Mr. O. 
B. Estabrooks in charge.

STEPHEN AYER.
HARNESSES at either establishment 

will be sold for prompt pay or cash at 
three months. Cheaper than at any 
other establishment in the Provinces, 
Call and obtain prices. 8. A.

LUMBERJOR SALE.
ALTHOUGH we have suffered heavily 

by the late fire, we still intend to 
cairy on the LUMBER BUSINESS, at the

AMHERST

Wood-Workmg Faetory
In new and spacious premises, near the 
Station.

WE HAVE NOW ON HAND:

LUMBER & SCANTLING,
Laths, Shingles, Clayhoardi, 

aud other Pine Lmasher.
WANTED—1'INE PLANK A BOARDS 

of good quality.

RHODES * CURRY.
Amv erst, N. S., ) N. A. R. Rhodes. 

Nov. 1, 1877. $ N. Currt.

U. S. Piano Co.
$290.

YOU ask WHY we can sell First-class 
7 1-3 Octave Rosewood Pianos for 

$290. ûur answer is, that it coats less 
than $300 to make any $600 Piano sold 
through Agents, all of whom make 100
Kir cent, profit. Wo have no Agents, 

t sell direct to Families at Factory 
price, and warrant five years. We send 
our Pianos everywhere for trial, and re­
quire no payment unless they are found 
satisfactory. Send for Illustrated Circular, 
which gives full particulate, and contains 
the names of over 1600 Bankers, Mer­
chants and Families that are using our 
Pianos in every State of the U cion. Please 
state where you saw this notice.

ADDRESS i

U. 8. PIANO CO., 810 OROAOWAV
New York.

Sent Free, by Mail 1
ORDERS PROMPTLY FILLED FIR

PAPEB B AG8, printed or «print­
ed—the cheapest in the market.

III! Heads end Letter Heade—very
cheep.

Pasters and Dodger», tor Tee Meet­
ing., Sale., Ac.

Cards and Ticket», In variety, cheap.
magistrates’ Bleaks, Ac., on

hand.
Send your order» to

CHIONBCTO POST,
sat Bsexvata, M. B.

NOTICE.

r'E CO-PARTNERSHIP BUSINESS 
which existed between the Subscriber 
and his late father, Thomas Baied, Esq., 
is now continued by the Subscriber John 

Milton Baird alone under the old style 
of Firm of

THOMAS BAIRD â SOIS,
Pursuant to the provision of his father’s 
Wills *

JOHN MILTON BAIRD. 
Sackville, Oct. 22nd, 1877.

Notice of Removal.

G. H. VENNING,
Clock stud Watch Maker.

WOULD reepectfolly inform the ha- 
liabltante of Sackville end vicinity 

that he has removed his Shop to Mr. John 
Bell’s NEW BUILDING, where he will 
be happy to attend to his old customers 
and as many new ones as will favor him 
witMheir patronage. KF*He can premier 
strict attention and reasonable despatch.

Plain Gold Rings made to order. Jewel­
ry neatly repaired. sep26 G. H. V.

Wilson, Gilmour & Go.,
204 UNION ST.,

Capt. McLean’s Brick Bulletin 

ST. JOHN, IV. B.

Xarbleized Mantles and «rates, 

PORTABLE RANGES,
SrCOVLTSSS.

Tinware, etc., etc., 
REFRIGERATORS, 

GRANITE IRON WARE
jnly 18 W., O. A CO.

THE STANDARD

Life Assurance Comp’y.
ESTABLISHED 1826.

Hill Offices: EDINBURGH Ul MONTREAL.
W. M. ItAMSAY, Manager for Canada.

Invested Funds,...... .‘..,$26,000,006
Annual Income,............. 3,750,000

Rates Reduced!
Medical Fees settled by the Company. 

Loans Granted and surrender Values paid 
on Policies. Policies payable at death or 
at a certain age.

CLIFFORD B. TRUEMAN,
Agent for Sackville.

C. F. H. Campbell, M. D., 
febl4 Medical Officer.

moil pBR WEEK at HOME 
g Qll Samples and Watch Free 

to all. Address, 
MONTREAL NOVELTY CO.,

236 St. Jamea Street, Montreal, P. Q.

. 1Y1LL1AH OKAY’S HVïA'.l U; HEIMCIXE, 
Ttee treat K M.* — 

edy Is an unfailing cute*, 
fur Seminal Weakness,Sper- j 
matorr/uu, Jtnpotency.andm all diseases that follow asl 
a sequence of Self-Abuse;1
M Lots of Memery, t’mwJ
snlLoeeUude, Mite /As]
Back, Dimness of Vision'

______ ’.Premature Old Age, and „,¥
many othflf diseases that lead to J*ea.iit, 
sumption and a Premature Grass.
per package, or six p&ckagtw for f ft, by ms_____
postage. Full particulars in our pamphlet, which 

*°eTrnrone. Address WTM. OKAY A CO., Windsor» Ontario, Caaaftjf
For sale at the Sackville Drug Store.

DIPHTHERIA!
JOHNSON’S ANODYNE LINIMENT 

will positively prevent this terrible 
disease, and will positively cure nine cases 

in ten. Information that will save many 
lives sent free by mail. Don’t delay a 
moment. Prevention is better than cure. 
I. 8. JOHNSON A CO., Bangor, Maine.

KNOW By reading and practicing 
the inestimable truths con­
tained in the best medical 
book ever Issued, entitled

THYSELFSæw-Streats of Exhausted Vitality, Premature Decline, 
Nervous and Physical Debility, and the endless 
concomitant ills aad untold miseries that result 
therefrom, and contains more than 60original pre­
scriptions, any ono of which la.worth the price of 
the book. Thin book waa written by the mostex- 
tensive and probably the most skilful practitioner 
In America, to whom was awarded n gold and Jew­
elled medal by the National Medical A ssoclatW 
A Pamphlet, ffluetrated with the very inert

swaps HEALlïiSâFTHYlELF
NOTICE.

A PPLICATION will be mad. at tiw 
earning Scion of the Provincial 

legislature for an Act to Incorporate a 
Company to build a Line of Railway from 
the Albert Railway to Barvoy Cove, In 
the Parish of Alma.

Xlas, A. C„ toy. 6th. UN,


