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â MONEYc\fAND 6ý9MAGN ATL5Gu
Pearsoni Stocks Attracting AttentionNOT. for a long. time have the so-called South American and Mexican

securities, commoicnly known as the "Pearson Croup," received any-
thing like the attention that they have during the past month. Rio

Common, Mexicani Pow;ýer Common and Sao Paulo Common have ail been in
demand, more particularly the first two, both of which touched new high
levels for their present movemlents.

Toronto has been greatly initerested in the upward movement in Rio and
even some of the MacKenzýie and Mann group, who very seldom express an
opinion about any stock on the market, have been very confident in their

Iopinion that Rio would seil at very much higher figures in anticipation of the
I7 per cent. dividenid whichi the company will likely pay towards the end of
the present calendar year.

The activity in MVexican Power was followeýd by the publication of the
comnpaniy's annual statement, which showed that its position had been very
greatly strengthened, and that the plans which had been carried out to ensure
additional power, .had' placed the company in'the way of making very much
larger earnings than ever before. Owing to the recent troubles in Mexico,
Mexican Powver stock had beeni rather neglected, but now a great many
shareholders are fairly confident that the 6 per cent. dividend which they
thought was comning about two yvears ago, may be forthcoming in the not
distant future.

Sao Paulo bas already hiad quite a sharp uipward movenent as a resuit of
operations by a promrinient T~oronto house, and holds firmn arouind 180 in
anticipation of an increase in the dividend rate f rom 10 per cent. to 12 per
cent. It is reported in somte circles in Monitreal that Dr. Pearson, who is at
the head of the three industries, has been recomnmending them strongly to
bis friends, with a view of enablinig themn to more than make up any loss<es
ilhey miight hiave sustained in the Rock, Island episode of last year.
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