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fogical precision and philosophical temper an important question,
bearing intimately upoin the aivancemeit of a noble and teo
frequettly diseouraged science.

For one piece of inforniation, however, -we have to Iliank our
contemporary,-we allude to his notice of lthe Act 7 Vict., Cap.5,
of Ihe existence of which we unblushitngly avow our ignorance:
- an ignorance participated in by many of our professional
brethrcn Io wboîn -\e have spoken on the subjeCt. And as we
believe that few imedical ien Ili Ihe Proýince are aware of the
provisions of this statule, we reprint it for generail iformation.

ln (ine, wc sav, liat if our conlemporary u ould put aside his
evident dislike of our existence, and labour wilit us fraternally in
the coIimotn eauc.e for the cointnon good, wce will cieeriilly
render our aid in advau ing profesional knowidge and sustain-
ing prof*e1.ional rights ; but if ie continues to manlesi tis spirit,
and to wield the editerial pen oniy for ils gratifiention, we siall
abstain fom reogizing his righit lo be cotnsidercd a professional
organ. Tie world is wide enougi for us both, nor wvill his
Op)ositiol Cither affect our progress or damp our ardour.

TH1E ANATOMY ACT.

}T certainly never occurred to the writer of tiis artele to search
thé Statules for the At no1w publshed, the exisîtence of whici
w«e never heard metiotned by any of our professional bretren,
ailthougi the ncessity for somne such measure was very frely
catnvassed at te tinte of the occurrences, the discussion of witicih
in the British Atmerican Journal has iad lthe eflect of britnging it
to light. We have carefully peruscd il, and mnust acknowldge
that it seescu, suflicient to accumiplisi all that is requisite for
the purposes contemplated. But it is not the mere fact of the
existence of an Act of Parliamentl,-it is nul lthe care with viich
ils pirascology is con.structed, m ieh makes il cither a good or a
useful Act. -fow mrany StatuIes lie mnoulderintg in) tLe folios la
vhieh they have becn bound, for years, as useless as lthe paper

on wich tiey are pritedc,-perfctly inoperahe ; nto always
from any defect iti theselves, but sitply because tIose %,hoarc
duly apoiîàte to administer lia rn,-the executive -igetlls
legislative autboity,-are citer ig'norant of thicir existnce, of
powrcfs contfceCd by themn, or the obligations îty impusc. Or il
inay Le, tliat tihis inutilily aises equally frotn lthe ignorance or
apathy of thuse w«hose itcrscts these very law-s arc intcnded to
subserve. That this particular Act, 7 Victoria, cap. 5, is in îis
position of a dead feuer as fatr as Uupper Canada is concernled,
from all these causes, w ill be apparent by a peruzal of Ihe thtird


