
EDUCATIONAL MONTHLY
AND SCHOOL MAGAZINE.

M\Y-j U N , 188 4 .

I>lLIC LIBRARIES.

LY THFE REV. W. H. Wl 1HIROW, D.., F.R.z., CAN.

I AN glad to have an opportunity of
speaking a word of congratula-

tion on the opening of this free pub-
lic library. I can think of no more
worthy mode of celebrating the semi-
centennial of this fair city than by the
inauguration of this beneficent insti-
tution. I can scarce conc :ive of a
grander monument of the city's pro-
gress or a more auspicious omen of
its future welfare. I confess that I
have more than once felt that my
native city, notwithstanding its lite-
rary pre-eminence, compared un-
favourably with nany less populous
and less weathy cities in Great
Britain and Europe and in the United
States, fron its lack of a public
fibrary. I rejoice that that reproach
is now taken away, and that through
the energy and enterprise of Messrs.
Hallam and Taylor, to whom more
than any others the existence of this
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library is due. and through the
intelligent liberality of the ratepayers
of Toronto, we see opened to-day
this magnificent institution.

I regard this library, if the Hon.
Minster of Education will permit me
to say so, as in a very important
sense the cômplement of our Public
School system. Only a few of our
young people can pass from the
Public schools to the colleges or
universities of the country. But these
free libraries, which I hope to see
nultiplied throughout the land, are
the people's colleges, where the
poorest lad or the toiling artisan
shall enjoy the best teaching in the
world. " The true university of these
days," says Carlyle, " is a collection
of books." Ali education that is worth
anything must be largely self-educa-
tion. I an sure that the learned
president of University College will
agree with the opinion that rnany a self-
taught man-who has never seen the
inside of a college-self-taught like
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