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At the annual meetirg of the Ontario
Medical Library Association, the following
officers vere elected for the year: Presi-
dent, Dr. Albert A. Macdonald; st vice-
president, Dr. Laughlin McFarlane; 2nd

vice-prz:sident, Dr. H. Machell; curator,
Dr. N. A. Powell; secretary, Dr. L. M.
Sweel.nam; treasurer, Dr. W. J. Greig;
meir bers of the board of trustees, Drs. A.
Mcliedran, J. F. W. Ross, R. A. Pyne,
Gilbert Gordon, A. F. McKenzie, J. T.
Fotheringham. The report of the cura-
tor showed that a very material in-
crease had taken place in boo s and
journals. The volumes added during the
yea,1r numbered 480, and the library now
contains 3,379 bound volumes and over
1,200 unbound. The library has been so
indexed and arranged as to be of great
value to those desirous of looking up
references. The librarian, under the direc-
tion of the curator, sends books and jour-
nals to practitioners in any part of Ontario
to assist in the preparation of journal or
society papers. This is done without
expense, other than express charges or
postage. The financial report showed
that though valuable assets had been
acquired, the library is in need of sub-
stantial aid in order to make its future an
assured success. Special efforts are being
made not only for the collection of stock
row due, but also for the acquisition of
new shareholders. The possession of three
shares of five dollars each will entitle any

medical man in good standinig to ail the
privileges of the library. Be;ng situatcd
in a central place (corner Bay and Rich-
mond Streets), the roonis of this library
are becoming more and more a resort for
physicians from far and near. The libra-
rian is at all times ready to assist in look-
ing up references, and it is tu be hoped
that an increasing use of this valuable col-
lection may help to repay those who have
done so much towards its establhshmlnt
and maintenance. To friends of the
library the Board would say, that dona-
tions of spare books or journals are ever
welcone and can always be utilized,

Personals.

Dr. L. McFarlane lias gone on a six
weeks' trip to the Pacific Coast.

Dr. R. McLearn was recently appointed
Surgeon to the Infantry School Corps at
Fredericton.

Dr. Murray McFarlane has been ap-
pointed oculist and aurst at St. Michael's
Huspital, Toronto.

Dr. W. H. Pepler will shortly remove
from 799 Queen Street West to corner of
John and Adelaide Streets.

Dr. J. E. Graham, Professor of Clinical
Medicine, Toronto University, is expected
to return from Europe about the 1st of
September.

Di. Price Brown recurned recently fron
New York, after attending the Annual
Meeting of the Amercan Laryngoiogical
Association.

Dr. E. E. King has been appointed one
of the pathologists to Toronto General
Hosjtal in place of Dr. W. H. B. Aikin3,
who has been placed on the active staff of
physicians.

Drs. Temple and Reeve of Toronto,
Sullivan of Kingston, and Harrison of Sel-
kirk, were appointed as delegates from the
Ontario Medical Association to the Cana-
dian Medical Association.


