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the Craft gathered together. This viý;it
to Ionie Lodge waa only one of a series
of visits lie intended paying, ail over the
jurisdiction, b)eginuing, witli the E-ast,
and lie expected endingr in the far West.
H-e accepted the large gathering in the
nature of a compliment to his offlice,
but also to himself.

M.W. Grand -Master Walkem, in te-
plýying to a toast, referred tu lis ap-
pointment as arbitrator between the
Grand Lodge of Quebec and the Grand
1,,dge of Engiand, and said lie expected
the <ifflculty wvould be aiuicabl- settled
thrugh bis efforts. He stated that lie
hiad visited Montreal during, the meet-
img of the Grand Lodge of Quebec, by
wvhovi lie ivas received as thcir guest.
His services as meditator in the dispute
bet.ween Quebec and Englarnd had been
Cordially accepted, and a resolution
hiad been unanimously passed empow-
ering, the Grand Master of the Grand
Lodge of Quebec to revoke the existing
edict of non-intercourse at the request
of the Grand Master of the Grand
Lodge of Canada. This, the Grand
Master said, wvas a higli compliment to
the Grand Lodge of Canada, and tu its
ulhicf oficer, and lie hoped that under
the guidance of the Great Archit-ect of
the Unîverse lie might be instrumental
iii healing the differences between the
two G rand Lodges and restoring that
licace and larmony whichi should at ail
i es exist between the mem1 )ers of the

fraternity.
Tihe evening wvas one of the happiest

in the hiz;tory of Masonry in this city,
and WV. Bru. Morsoni of Ionie, andl his
officers; and members have every reason
to be proud of die success of the r-cep-
t'on.

WHAT IS FREEMASONRY?

Grand Librarian Hierman G. Carter,
editor of the Masonic Departmnent of
the Newv York L'ispatch, writes on this
subject as f.,llows:

«I For centuries the Masonic institu-
tion lias shadowed forth, withi more or
less distinctness, the ideas of equality,
liberty and unity. A Miasonic lodge

is itself a model government-a gOv-
ernment of law. The brethren, whatever
distinctions divide them in the world
without, are equal. The officers are
elected by universal suffrage, and exer-
cise their prerugatives for the general
gD(ood of the Craf t.. Hence we flad thaz
rlasons of ail ages, and especially for
the last t'vu or three centuries, have
been inspired with the loftiest ideas of
social progress, and our institution is
desigo ed to expand the human mind
and tu bless the human race. Althugh
the M.Nasonic institution cannot and
dues not mingle in the conflicts of pol-
itical parties, or engage in conspiracies
against the State or nation, it must
niecessarily, by its great moral influence,
affect materially the social and politi-
cal prugress of th e peuple. For many.
years the fraternity was the sole depos-
itory of the grand idea whichi is nuw
rapidly becoming the supreme thought
of the present generation-that the
people are the primary source of' al
sovereignty. The strength of the Ma-
sonie institution is based on the purest
principles of morality andphilanthropy
-principles that are as immutable as
those that uphiold the universe-prin-
ciples upon which men of every coun-
try, sect and opinion can unite-pin-
ciples of pure benevolence around
whicli the cardinal virtues deligfht to
cluster-principles that have enlisted
the earnest attention of the wise and
good of ail ages. Masons know nu dis-
tinction, but as virtue, integnity and
moral worth may charactenize tiie in-
dividual who may apply for its benefîts
and privilegyes. PU cannot be denied-
that the Masonic institution infuses
intu the hoarts of its niembers ail those
3indred virtoues whicli elevate and adorn
the chiaracter of man. It speaks a lan-
gulage which is understood and spoken.
by the craft whierever disperscd, and it
forms a commun medium of communi-
cation among the brethren of al] na-
tions, kindred and tongues. Let us not
forget the teachings of anL institution
which laid the foundations of society
and cherishied and disseminiated the
elements of civili zation. It is a part of
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