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MEDITATIONS ON THE BOOK OF JUDGES.

“ For whatsoever things were written aforetime 
were written for our learning, that we through pa­
tience and comfort of the Scriptures n ight have 
hope.’*— Rom. xv. 4.

Prepack.
1 he contrast between the books of Joshua and * 

Judges is immense. Joshua, a striking type of the 
spirit of Christ in power*, leads Israel on to con­
quer and dwell in peace in the land of promise. 
The book of Judges gives us quite another order 
of things. Starting from the blessings conferred 
by Jehovah in Canaan, and confided to the re­
sponsibility of the people, it shews us what 
Israel made of them.

use
Did they justify the confi­

dence God had placed in them ? Did they live up 
to their privileges ? 
the book of Judges,

Israel’s history is repeated in that of the church." 
The Epistle to the Ephesians answers, in the New 
Testament, to Joshua ; for in it we see the assembly 
seated in heavenly places, enjoying all spiritual 
blessings in Christ, and wrestling no longer, like 
Israel, “against flesh and blood, but against 
principalities, against powers, against the rulers of 
the darkness of this world, against wicked spirits 
in heavenly places.” (Eph. vi 12—margin.)

The answer will be found in

/

See Meditations on the Book of Joshua," by same writer.


