
MEETINGS AND> REPORTS. (The. Public neait

,iurn life xnay at lest receive the saine
attention and consideration as the lins-
bandry of live stock, and ail that ap-
pertains thereto.

The eonunittee also wifl work for the
proper registration of midwives and aIl
wornen practicing iuidwifery.

<Also the registration of ail graduate
urses, after a thorougli examnation as

to their emfciency and capabilities. These
qualifications will be a great protection
to the public at large, as the nurses un-
able to pass exaxuinations in states wliere
registration lias becorne an enforced law
are establisliing thexuselves i Wiscon-
sin. Tlie registration aliail becoxue in-
terehaingeable, so that a graduate nurse
registered in Wisconsin may practice in
New York aud other states wliere the
r'egistration law obtains.

The comnnittee also shall work earn-
estly for the preveution of tuberculosis,
eudeavoring to reduce througli educa-
tion the appailing figures in the number
of fatalities froin that disease iu Wiscon-.
sin ecd year.

Also inatters relatiug to preveutable
dise s ,especially aniong children, re-
ducîug, ifpossible, the great infant mor-
tality of the state. The vital questions
of saultation sud tie proper housing,
more particularly in tie crowded dis-
tricts.

Iu educating th~e te>acliers iu tie ever
esseutial condition of proper ventilation,
coxnpelliug them te realize that tie sickly
children placed lu out-of-dêors sehools
accompiisli more iu three hours' tixue
than the cliild in "liut-iu" achool rooms
does i six liours .

That we endorme medical inspection of
schiools, proper ventilation of churches,
theatres, railway staton~s and ail public
buildings, and the saniitary care of ail
toilet roonis in ail public places,

THE EMPIRE AND T
Infantile Paralysia iu England.

Robert Buruet, D. P. H., aud Medical
Officer ef Cornwall, Eugiand, presents su
epitome ef the knowledge, from the Eng-
hish point of view, regarding inf antile


