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As we now enter upon aîîother year,
in the publication of the CRA-ýFTSMýAN,

we take the opportunity of wishing our
readers a Happy Newv Vear, and trust
thiat 1897 will be one of happiness, to
the inenl)ers of the Craft, an)d that
peace and good wiil mnay reign suprerne
tliroughout the wVorld.

IN our last issue we reported the ioss
by, fire of the Masonic Hall in Ottawa.
M. W. Bro. J. Ross Robertson, M. P.,
.Past Grand Master of the Masonic
Grand Lodge of Canada, has shown
his sympathy with the Ottawa brethren
in the loss of ail their relios, regalia,
etc., in a practical shape. There arriv-
ed fromi Toronto, to, the care of Aid.
Cook, a magnificently-bound volume of
the sacred iaw, a box of working tools,

'Ind three gavels, to be used i)y the W.
M.'s an)d 'Wardeîîs of the city lodges.
Tlhe working tools are contained in a
beautiftil case, silk Iined, the tools he.
ing of the very best quality. l'le
gavels are replicas of the Old-til~e
gYavel used in th)e Gernian operative
idges cenîturies ago. Thie formnai pre.
sentation of these miagnificent gifts was
made at the meeting of Chaudiere
Lodge, NO. 264, I)ecemiber 22nid, wvhcn
AId. Cook, on iehiaîf of M. W. Bro.
J. Ross Robertson, hianded theni to R.
W. Bro. E. i) P>arlow, D. D. G. M.
Chairmian of the 1M.-sonic Hall Corn-
mnittee, and to R. WV. Bro. Wmr. Rea,
Secretary.

XVE- present our readerb with a por-
trait of an active and ri5ing young
Craftsman, in the person of W. Bro. J.
E. Hansford, W.M. of St. Andrew's
Lodge, No. 16, Toronto. In another
columin we give a short sketch of his
hUfe.

THE way in whichi the question of
leasing the Temple building 15 now
being received by thie different Lodges
in the city has made the sehenie ait
assured success. It is mleeting the
neariy unanimious desire of aIl the
bretliren.


