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resulted in the coalition of that year, and the
adoption of the Confederation policy whieh he
had long previously advocAted. He obtained the

appointment of a Committee to devise a better
ýystem of registering births, marriages and

deaths in U'.,C., and reported that the municipal
system should"be employed to obtain such sta-
tisties, a course '4ýeiy to be adopted; he intré-
duced, on two occasions , a bill to provide for the
carrying into effect of eiecutions within the pre-
ciacts of jails-a reform whieh bas lately been.
adopted both in Eng. and Can; he aiso suggested,
in 1868, the formation of a publie stock, to afford
facilities for investments by executors, trustees
and others. Sworn of the Privy Couneil, and ap-

pointed Minister of Inland Revenue, 16 Nov.,
1869. Sat for present seat in L. A., Can., from
g-e., 1861 until the Union. Returned to Commons
by acclamation at last g. e., and again on his

appointment to office. A Conservative.'-Ottaiva
Perth, Ont. Rideau Club.

MORRISON, ANGTS. [Niagara.]
S. of the late Mr. Joseph Morrison, of Toronto;

,and brother of the 11où. - Mr. Justice Morrison,
Court of Queen"s Bench, Ont. M. Miss Gillmour.

Called to the Bar, U. C., in Michaelmas Terni,
1844. Is a. bencher of the Law Society, U. C.,
and a directoi of the Northern Bailway Co., and
of the Provincial Insurance Co. Sat for North

Simeoe in L.A., Can., from g. e., 1854, until
g. e-, 1863, when deféated : and for present seat
from 1864 until the Union. Was an unsuccessful
candidate for Nôrth Simcoe in Local House at last
g. e. Returned to Commons at last g..e. A Con-
servative, and a'su porter of Sir J. A. Macdonald.
- Wind8or'Place, k0ronto ; Toronto Club; Rideau
Club. / 1


