
found in the ashes of the law, When we are thinking of great
American statesman Rufus Choate does flot fail ta 1 smim into aur
ken.' Like Webster, hie wvas a graduate of Dartinouth College.
It was cornonly said of hlm that whi le he was an under. ,graduate
lie waï emiinentl-y fittëd to' take a prafessorial chair in arts iii any
tiniversity in the country. After he becaine the forecnost Arnerican
lawvyer of bis tirne, and a prominent statesm-an, hie did flot (ail ta
daily haunt the Muses> home and quaif the waters of Aganippe. It
was his wont ta spend the early hours of the morning with the
cireek and Latin authors who had appealed to his youthful fancy
with se patent a charm. R-is chief spje-'ches in the United States
Senate, and on public occasions, shewi fiow carefully, he had sown
his mental garden %vith the seeds of ancient and niodern learning,
As an orator lie had no equal amongst his centeniporaries ; and cf
him it mia, have been truly said b>' bis ceuntryinen at his death :
ITake hinm for ail i ail, %we shall fot look upon his like again."

And %vith Choate Ive mnust close our survey of this very interesting
subject, not because %ve have exhatisted our mnaterial, but because
we have arrived at the limit of our space, In quitting our themne,
however, %ve feel it due te the legal profession te point out that ail
but one of the great statesnien we have mentioned were lawyers.

* * * I Lav se dryý-I deny, it," said Lord Bramnwell, but is
there anything more anhydrous in the wvhole legal demain thani the
late I'imnented judge's omn forenisic and journalist-ic lucub' ations ?
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