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pioyed the language of signs and syni-
bols, solenin performances, and dra-
matie representations; nothing svas
written except in symbols ami hiero-
glyphies.

About 1,000 B. C. the Temple of
Solomon was built, not, however, by
Israelitish masons and carpenters.. but
by Phoenicians. Solomon himself in
bis letterto, ingfirani confesses that
le las no inechanics among his peo-
ple. Hliram Abiff, the Sidonian build-
er, was the Ardhiteet, and le brougît
with him ail the mechanies froin Phoe-
nicia, -while the ]israelites performed1
the work of common laborers.

The Israelites were too exclusive
in their character, to, into]erant
towards othor nationalities and
'tribes, too nomadie in their mode
of living, and had too great an aver-
sion f0 manual labor and mechanics
in general, as to admit the supposi-
tion that they, during the short periodl
of the building of the Temple and
the house of solomon, wouid change
their nature and take a fancy to ai-
chiterture. The state of bondage in
-which the israelites lad been kept for
centuries, was certainly not congenial
for the deveiopment of enlightened
ideas. The nomadie mode of living
and aversion to nianual labor, their
fondness for an idie lie, was the cause
that promptedl Pharaoh to, order the
slaying of ail the first-born among the
Ieraelites. That character the Is-
raelites or Jews not only mianifeste
during their Egyptian bandage, but
also during that of the Babylonian
captivity, ana in ail times te the pres-
ent day.

Only one smail number of the Is-
raelites exercised certain rnystic rites,
manieiy: the Essenes. They, how-

ever, did not practice architecture;
they were exclusively an ascetic seot,
a religions body, a kind of monke.
Their society was formed about 600)
B. 0.; it was, however, greatly des-
pised by the other Israelites. lIt ex-
isted: during the time of Christ, who
as weil as St. John the Baptist, was,
no doubt, acquainted with them, andl
who neyer spoke against the Essenes.

We have neither any reason to
suppose that either Solomon himself,
or the IPriesta of lis people patroniZed
the mysteries of the Phoenician build-
ers, or, as we generaily terni it,
"Masonry."

Solomon, ne doubt, was a wise
man during a part of his life; in
later years, however, his habits be-
came the very opposite of those of a
true Mason, and a man who, like
Solomon, lad to attend to 700 wives
and 800 concubines, lad certainly
neither tume nor mind to, think of
cuitivating Masonie principles.

Under the reign of lis son Beho-
boam, the tyrant, the decay of the
Israelitish nation commenced. Ten
tribes revolted and seceded, and eleet-
ed their own Ring Jeroboani, while
oniy two tribes remained loyal to
iRehoboani. The ten tribes were
styled the Kingdomn of ]lsrael, the two
tribes the Kingdom of Judah. Feuds
and internai -wars, and wars with
neiglboring tribes were continued for
several centuries, until Salamanassar
the Assyrian king, about 720 B. O.,
subdued the two kingdoms, drove off
the ten tribes, the Israelites, ana,
madle the other two, those of Judah%
tributary. The ten tribes became
lost, ana were neyer again found;
even at the present day some enthu-
siasts are in search of tiien. The


