
TilE CANADA 1-EALT1I JOUIRNAL.

THE Ladies' ilealh Protective Asso-
ciation, of Beokmaa Hill1, New York,
says the Sanitary P6rnbe),, which wag-
ed a determined iqmfare on Michael
Kane's manure *inps oji the East
Ri.ver, bias now undertaken another
good work. They have begun an in-
spectionl of the teneinent bouses iu the
city, and say thoy are going te use
every means te compel landiords to
light the halls and furnish water on
the upper fleors, and are preparing a
report on tenements.

TuE number of Ilquack " advertisc-
ments found in professcdly religieus
journals is truly astonishing, says the
Peoplc's Health .Joitrnal. By allowing
such advertisements to appear in their
celumns these journals do a three-fold
iujury; the üreduleus publie is imposed
upon. because it is suppesed, of course.
that nothing but the truth would ap-
pear in a religions publication. Confi-
dence in scientifle medication le dimin-
isIl0d; thereby tho medical profess ion
is injurcd. llumbuggery and fraud
are encour-agod, and consequently bon-
esty and general integrity depreciated.
If the proprief ors cf these journals
expect their influe,,ie for good te be
unlirnitedl, they inust guard their
advel tibînig ee)"Ilns more closely ini
this dir2etion. --. e ûaiinot serve God
and mui mion.>

PUITHISIS CURAMM AT EVERY STAGE.
-In a review of tho English transla-
tion of a work by M. Jaccourd, the
justly ceIlbrated professer of' Medical
Pathology Lo the Faculty of Paris, en-
titled Carabilit), of Phthisis, etc., it is
annouaced that 1-the curability ot'pul-
monary phthisi., at every stage is now
à well established fact," the author's
conclusions flre as fellows: To sum up
what has been stated, pulmenary
phthisis is curable in alh its stages.
This is tho prolific notion that presides

over the whole history of the disease,
and whieh sheuld unceasingly inspire.
and direct ail medical action. The in-
curability proclaimed býy Laennec and
bis immediate successers, is dispreved
by pathelegical anatemy and clinical
observation. None should, therefore,
allew themselves te be influenced by
such a condemnation. which is but a
historical souvenir. When the exist-
ence of tubercles ln the lungs le receg-
nized, iL should net be inferred fremn
that moment that he wl-o has then i8
doomed te death in consoqitence of their
presoee. Should it bc fouind that the
tuibercles seften and a cavera forms, it
should net bc believed, on this accounit
that ail is lest. It lias been shown
that this is net the case, and the natu-
rai tendenüy which tuberule bas te
fibrous transformation, that is te recov-
ery, should net Le fergetten. Before
being disceuraged, the physieian should
search and examine i neessan tly whether
the patient is la the requisite condi-
tiens fer sucb favorable evolution te
occur. If ail[ hope ef absolute rccovcry
must be abandened, a relative cure
should be'wrouglit, and evcry exertioit
Le made te place the patient iu sncb
conditions that lie can 1k-e iiotwith-
standing the lesions which arc now ir-
reparable; ln a word, the plan adopted
sheuld be te stri-e and strîve always,
ivith the unsbaken confidence whichi
may be drawn frem the notion that îrc-
covcry is possible. The enemy ea;i bc
conquercd. This is thc idea that shonild
engeader and sustain every effort. Lt
is certain that this cGnvictien le the
first condition of siuccess; 8ince it le
absence of faith ln the pessibility of
cure which prevents the adoption of ail
thierapcutic treatmcn t.

ADVIRSITY dees8 net take froni ii
truce fricnds ; it enly dispel.s those wv1O
p)1etend te be stnch.


