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WANTED : A MAN I
During tin Hit four months sot oral 

maltors of rltal Importance to Western 
farmers will be before the Dominion Parlia­
ment The farmers bare stated their caw 
to parliament and every member knows what 
the farmers want. It is now np to the 
farmers to see that their representatives 
protect them In parliament. The West looks 
today through the ranks of its Ottawa mem­
bers for a leader 18 THERE ONE OP OUR 
MEMBERS BIO ENOUOH TO STAND UP 
POR HIS PEOPLE? IP HE DOBS HE WILL 
HAVE A POWER BEHIND HIM. Oppor­
tunity never knocked more persistently at 
the door of any man than it does today at 
the door of our Western members. Surely 
some will answer. Let ns give them time 
to"announce themselves.

EQUITY
BUTCRpWN HEN. QUEEN AND

Equity small usher in, for
THOSE WHO BUILD, AND THOSE WHO 
SPIN, AND THOSE TME GR/UN WHO 

GARNER IN. A BRIGHTER DAY.

JAN.4,1911

A WEEKLY JOURNAL DEVOTED TO THE
INTERESTS OF WESTERN FARMERS
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$1.00 PER YEAR SC. A COPY
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