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WAR REVIEW.
The Germans apparently are on the 

eve ot trying to end their retreat from 
the Soissons-Rheims salient and turn­
ing and offering frontal battle In 
France to the Allied armiee. The day 
of rearguard action seems to be draw­
ing to a close. Violent counter meas­
ures against their antagonists already 
are In progress by the Germans over 
most of the front, and seemingly for 
the present at least the Allied advance 
has been materially slowed down. 
Further gains have been made by the 
Allies, but only after the bitterest 
kind of fighting, and these gains have 
been considerably less In extent than 
those of previous days before the Ger­
mans stiffened the retiring armies by 
rushing numerous fresh divisions to 
their aid and adding greatly to the 
aggregate strength of their fighting 
forces within the fast disappearing 
pocket between Soissons and Rheims. 
As a result of violent counter attacks 
delivered with huge effectives, the 
Germans have been ajpe to force the 
tailing back by the Americans and 
French on several portions, but no­
where were they able to find a spot 
weak enough through which they 
could penetrate the Allied line. Stand­
ing firmly and giving ground only 
under absolute necessity the Allied 
troops everywhere have exacted a 
huge toll in men killed, wounded or 
made prisoners from the Germans to 
their every effort, partly to retrieve 
their losses of ground. Particularly 
heavy has been the fighting in the 
center of the salient and on the right 
and left anchor points ot the salient 
resting respectively southwest ot 
Rheims and south of Soissons. It is 
still on the two anchor points that 
the enemy is keeping a watchful eye, 
fearful that the Allied troops may yet 
press back .the line and threaten the 
armies of the German Crown Prince 
with the pincer manoeuvre, for the 
enemy is not yet far enough out of 
the pocket to have passed the danger 
of such a contingency. In the centre 
of the pocket north of the Ourcq river 
the Germans, in a counter attack, 
drove the Americans out of Cierges, 
but this slight gain was more than 
overcome later by the penetration of 
the Americans north from Sergy. 
Beugneux, lying on the west side of 
the pocket, northwest of Fere-en-Tar- 
denois, also was taken by the Germans 
but later the Franco-American troops 
jecaptured it, and with Grand Rosier 
in their possession they still hold van­
tage points for a small turning move- 
sent towards Fere, which, if suc- 
eessful, would give them a goodly 
number ot prisoners. Southwest of 
Rheims the enemy delivered violent 
attacks against the French from both 
sides of St. Euphraise. Their effort 
to capture the village, however, was 
futile, although they pushed their line 
slightly forward on the west side of it. 
Southwest of Ypres the Australian 
troops are keeping up their attacks 
against the Germans, and have capr 
tured the town of Merrls and 169 pris­
oners and a number of trench mortars 
and machine guns. The Germans at 
last reports were heavily bombarding 
the new positions of the British. 
American troops fighting north of the 
Ourcq in the Soissons-Rheims salient 
have enlarged their victory of Mon­
day at Sergy, where they defeated di­
visions of Germany’s picked troops 
and took and held the village against 
counter attacks. Notwithstanding con­
tinued heavy opposition by guns, ma­
chine guns and large numbers of the 
enemy, soldiers from the Middle West 
and East States drove their line north 
from Sergy on Tuesday for a distance 
of about two miles, and were resting 
at night on the slopes approaching the 
woods beyond the town of NesIeS: 
where they stood at last reports. The 
Americans formed the apex Of the 
long line running across the salient 
While the fierce fighting was going on 
between the Americans and Germans 
the French on both sides of the battle 
front also moved forward for goodly 
fains northeast of Fere-en-Tardenols 
uid east of Sergy. In the Nesles for­
mat the Germans are holding strong 
Positions, from which they are shell­
ing, but thus far ineffectively, the 
menacing Allied lines before them. 
Prussian Guards and Bavarians were 
h the thick of the fighting throughout 
Tuesday, but again they were out­
manoeuvred and outfought and again 
•offered heavy casualties.
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A FABULOUS SOL
LONDON, July 30. 

The biggest appropriation demand- 
•à «ince the beginning of the war 

be submitted to the House of 
Commons Thursday, says the Daily

Jtge
Health and comfort in 

old age depends largely on 
keeping the liver and kid­
neys in healthful action.

Pains and aches, stiffness 
of the joints, lumbago and 
rheumatism tell of poisons 
left in the blood by slug­
gishness of the liver and 
kidneys.

People in advanced years 
hold Dr. Chase’s Kidney- 
Liver Pills in high esteem 
because of the promptness 
and certainty with which 
they awaken the action of 
kidneys, liver and bowels.

Telegraph. The vote of credit to be 
asked wUl be for £700,000,000; the 
previous highest waa £660,000,000 
voted a y ear ago. The new appropri­
ation is required to finance the war 
until the end of October.

INTER. ALLIED FOOD CONTROL.
LONDON, July 30.

The Conference In London between 
the Food Controllers of the United 
Kingdom, United States, France and 
Italy Is continuing ita laboura, and 
meetings are being held almost daily, 
and It la expected that the controllers 
will conclude their discussions by hte 
end of the week. Satisfactory pro­
gress has tyeen made and the estab­
lishment of an Inter-Allied Food 
Council, composed of the controllers, 
is now an accomplished fact A re­
solution adopted to-day emphasized 
the need for economy and thé élimi­
nation of waste, as well as increased- 
production. In order to build up the 
stocks as an assurance against all 
possibility, it concludes, “We cannot 
administer the food problem on the 
basis of one year’s wants but-Jfe must 
prepare for long continuance If we 
are to insure absolute victory."

telegram from Constantinople dated 
July 28th, which quotes an article to 
the newspaper "Wasflri Bkfjar" pr> 
senting the Turkish viewpoint "We 
have nothing to say against the prin- 
clplee laid down in the Brest Litovsk 
Treaty," says the newspaper, “but 
when the Caucasus, newly re-organ­
ized, turned to ns, and master of its 
own destinies, refused to be bound bv 
the Treaty, what was more natural for 
us than to take into consideration the 
nocesaltiea ot this new tituation 
created on one Important eastern 
front. Could we close our ears to the 
appeal of the Government ot a peop.e 
largely of the same race and same 
creed as ourselves? We are aware ot 
the action, and its present progress to 
place under German control, Tiflis and 
Baku, Is a logical consequence ot the 
application ot the Brest-Litovsk 
Treaty. How could this treaty be tak­
en into consideration to the affairs of 
the Caucasus seeing that the Bol­
shevik! Government has not even been 
able to return to us to accordance 
with the treaty, our eastern frontier, 
and that in the Caucasus influences, 
freely Independent of the Bolshevikl 
Government, have arisen.” 3 am.— 
This reported attitude on the part of 
Turkey accounts in part for the report 
received through Copenhagen, that 
Turkey and Germany had severed re­
lations.

AUSTRALIANS AGAIN.
LONDON, July 30.

German positions to the Ferris re­
gion on the Flanders front were en­
tered last night by Australian troops, 
who took forty prisoners, the War 
Office announced to-day.

JAPO- SIRE RIAN AGREEMENT.
STOCKHOLM, July 30.

(British Admiralty per Wireless 
Press.)—The official order of the Si­
berian Government, published at 
Omsk, stated on July 12th that Japan 
had granted to the Siberian Govern­
ment £5,000,000 sterling, for the for­
mation of a strong army. In return, 
Siberia undertakes to supply Japanese 
troops which arrive there with pro­
visions. It was also announced that 
the Serberian Government Is'carrying 
on negotiations with America. V

RIOTING IN GERMANT.
AMSTERDAM, July 30.

(Bulletin.)—A new strike has brok­
en out at Kalk, Rheinish Prussia, near 
Cologne, according to the Echo Beige. 
Machine guns were used to repress 
the movement and the leaders were 
arrested, the paper declares. The po­
lice, It is added, were still busy when 
troops were sent dispersing the 
crowds which continued to gather in 
the streets.

Ger-

A HUN SMASH. 
y LONDON, July 29.

(Bulletin) By the A.P.—The 
mans began counter attacking 
heavily along the battle front, accord­
ing to news that reached London 
shortly after noon to-day. There was 
an especially heavy one to the Ameri­
can sector, resulting in driving the 
Americans out ot the village ot Cier­
ges, about five and a half miles south­
east of Fere-en-Tardenols. Another 
thrust drove the Americans back 
from Boughneux near Grand Roses, 
northwest of Fere-en-Tardenois.

IN THE FAR NORTH.
LONDON, July 30.

A conflict between Entente forces, 
in the Murmansk region, and com­
bined Finnish and German troops is 
imminent near Eneresjesen, accord­
ing to passengers on the first steam­
er to arrive at Varde, Norway, from 
Archangel since the autumn of 19l7r 
says a Christiania despatch to the 
Daily Express. The Germans are re­
ported to be moving toward Petchen- 
ga on the coast from Enersjesen, and 
are repairing a road built some years 
ago by the Russo-Finnish Govern­
ment. It is believed the Entente for­
ces are constructing a road from 
Petchenga to Saltijaervl to meet the 
foe half way.

TRUTH WILL OUT.
AMSTERDAM, July 30.

A memorandum demanding ruthless 
action against the men at the helm 
of the German Government in 1914, 
a-x guilty criminals, has been issued 
by former Capt. Von Boerfelde, says a 
Berlin telegram, quoting the Cologne 
Volks Zeitung. The memorandum is 
entitled: “A necessary correction of 
the German white book,” and was sent 
to the members of the Reichstag last 
week by the Captain, who was prom­
inent in connection with the Prince 
Lichnowky affair, brought about by 
the Prince who was German Ambassa­
dor to London in 1914, declaring that 
Germany was responsible for declin­
ing the war. Capt. Von Boerfeld s 
memorandum says that the German 
leaders at the beginning of the war 
was guilty ot appalling deceits, anl 
acted on the service of traitors. He 
demands the immediate arrest of form­
er Chancellor Von Bethmann Hollweg, 
and declares that if the Reichstag does 
not fulfill his demand, the curse of this 
ahd all Succeeding generations will 
fall upon It for cowardly neglect of 
duty. In case of the Reichstag refusal 
Capt. Von Boerfelde declares he will 
Immediately request passes tor him­
self and family to Switzerland, be­
cause he will no longer snare Ger­
many's shame and dishonor.

SEVERE FIGHTING ON THE OURCQ
WASHINGTON, July 30.

Severe fighting resulting from heavy 
counter attacks by fresh enemy troops 
beyond the line of the Ourcq, was re­
ported in General Pershing’s com­
munication for yesterday received to­
day at the War Department.

DELUDING THE PEOPLE.
AMSTERDAM, July 29.

Admiral Von Holtendorff, Chief of 
the German Adnfiralty staff, inter­
viewed the Cologne Gazette on a state­
ment attributed to Sir John Jellicoe, 
the former British Sea Lord, that the 
U-boat war was a failure, that it hal 
ceased to constitute a danger and tjjat 
mere U-boats were being destroyed 
than were being built, said the state­
ment is incorrect, and its credit would 
prove a fatal error for our opponents, 
The fact is that merely by appropriat­
ing nèutral tonnage the situation has 
undergone a temporary amelioration 
especially regarding military supplies 
for America. Admiral Von Holtzeo- 
dorff asserted that the German policy 
iu attacking every ship sailing in the 
enemy service, resulted apart from the 
destruction ot large quantities of war 
material and supplies the infliction ot 
enormous economical damage upon 
the enemy. The enemy losses in ships 
and cargoes alone to July 1st, 1918, 
are estimated to fully surpass fifty bil - 
lion marks. Asked the reason why 
few American transports were sunk, 
the Admiral replied the Americans 
have at their disposal for debarkation 
the coastal region from the northern 
point of Scotland to the French Medi­
terranean ports. With dozens of em­
barkation places we must put our 
boats to lurk off these harbours on the 
chance of getting a shot at the strong­
ly guarded convoy ot fast American 
transports. If one remembers all that 
must be realized, and what little pros-
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MYSTERIOUS DEATH.

LONDON, July 30.
Thomas Francis Anson, third Bari 

of Lichfield, Director ot the National 
Provincial Bank of England, and of 
the Bank of Australasia, was found 
dead to-day at Shughborough Park, 
Staffords, with a gun shot wound to 
the head. Lord Lichfield was born to 
1866.
INDEPENDENTLY OF GERMANY.

AMSTERDAM, July 30.
Turkey is going to handle the situa­

tion in the Caucasus, according to her 
own ideas, nils is indicated to a
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poet ot ecuceees it offers to set the U- 
boate eepedaty at American trans­
ports, we must also remember that it 
is the task of our U boats to reduce the 
entire cargo space to the enemy's ser­
vice, for on this depends his existence 
and ability to carry on the war.

LINES HOLDING STEADILY.
WIT HTHE AMERICAN ARMY ON 

THE AISNE-MARNE FRONT, July 
30. (By the A.P.)—Under a fire from 
the enemy only slightly less than 
that of yesterday the Americans on 
the front north ot the Ourcq held on 
to their positions this afternoon and 
even advanced a little to the road 
from Seringes to Sorqy. Repeated ef- 
) torts by the enemy to dislodge the 
Americans were futile. On the Ameri­
can left the French were moving for­
ward to the right The lines are hold­
ing steadily. The guards that were 
brought up by the Germans to attack 
the Americans yesterday appeared to 
have been withdrawn by the German 
command. The fighting is the heav­
iest the Americans have experienced.

T*

ENEMY’S WITHDRAWAL ORDERLY 

LONDON. July 36.
There has been heavy fighting near 

the Buzant railway, fire miles south of 
Soissons, and also to Plessier Wood 
about five miles further south. In 
this latter locality 45 prisoners were 
taken belonging to three divisions of 
the enemy. Now engaged to the Marne 
salient there are 71 divisions of which 
ten belong to the northern army ot 
Crown Prince Rupprecht. The en- 
enmy’s withdrawal is reported still or­
derly and military opinion to London 
discounts the possibility of rounding 
up of Germans in the salient.

INTERESTING STATEMENT OF SIR 
ERIC GEDDES.

LONDON, July 30.
Sir E. Geddes, 1st Lord of the Brit­

ish Admiralty gave the House of Com­
mons to-day a review of the naval 
situation, and particularly defended 
the policy of starting national ship­
building yards. In discussing the 
shipbuilding programme in connection 
with the navy estimate he compared 
the situation to-day regarding tonnage 
with that of a year ago. Then the net 
loss in tonnage was 550,000 gross tons 
monthly. Submarines then were not 
being destroyed as fast as the Ger­
mans were building them, while tho 
merchant shipyards were short of men 
and material. Four hundred thousand 
tons net loss monthly was the British 
deficit Every yard that could take 
naval work has been put on naval 
building. Gradually during the year 
Sir Eric continued the position had 
changed in many directions. Insteai 
of losing tonnage the world's not re­
sult loss in the last quarter had been 
a gain roughly of 100,000 tons a month. 
The Allied and neutral world was as 
well off on June 30, as on Jan. 1, 1918. 
This result, he said, had been obtain­
ed by reduced sinkings and increased 
buildings. The reduced sinkings had 
been arrived at said the First Lord by 
a greater productive effort devoted to 
warships and small craft of anti-sub. 
character. Nothing was included of 
commandeered or acquired tonnage in 
this result. The problem of a yea.- 
ago was considered by many almost in­
conceivable and? insoluble, Sir Erie 
Geddes continued mercantile carrying 
power was beings sunk at a rate which 
soon would havnjmeant an inability to 
continue the wgjtand there was no 
tried recognized means of combatting 
the campaign. It was necessary to 
provide a building programme of anti­
sub. craft, mines and other appliances 
and merchant ships on a greatly in­
creased scale. The total increase in 
Labor last year in shibbuilding yards 
and marine engineering was 65,000. 
The original demand ot a year ago 
was for 80,000 additional part of them 
skilled. Owing to events on the west 
front and the great demands for te-h- 
nical men for the air force and army, 
it was impossible to get the proper 
quota of skilled men by the withdraw­
al from the army. Unskilled men were 
offered freely, but couldn’t be absorb­
ed because of the lack of skilled men.
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WHY THE GERMANS ARE FIGHT- 
ING DESPERATELY.

LONDON, July 30. 
(Via Reuter’s Ottawa Agency.)— 

The capture of the formidable Butte 
Chalmont, which it was once expected 
the Germans would be able to hold, 
shows that the German retreat has by 
no means ended ,and it is doubtful if 
the enemy will be able to hold the 
Vesie line, for the Allied pressure on 
the two pivots of defence south of 
Soissons and south of Rheims is in­
creasing. In that connection the 
communique’s mention of the Scots 
at Buzancq, south of Soissons, is in­
teresting, showing that the British 
now are engaged on the western as 
well as the eastern side of the salient. 
Should these pivotal positions go in, 
there is still the possibility of the re­
treat becoming a disaster. Therefore 
the Germans are desperately defend­
ing the triangular bastion between 
Soissons, Culchy and the Aisne, which 
General Mangin is hammering from 
the west, while General Dégoutté is 
advancing northward from Fere en­
deavoring to turn it
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ual work. Eleven tons of bombs were 
dropped on enemy dumps and billets, 
and 14 hostile planes were destroyed, 
with the loss of two of onre. During 
the night to spite of unfavorable wea­
ther, bombs were dropped by us on 
Bray and Bapaume. All our machines 
returned.

WORK OF BRITISH AIRMEN.

LONDON, July 30. (Official.)
On Jnly 29th ground mist and low 

visibility interfered with artillery 
observation, but our bombing and 
flghtiflg machines carried out the us-

AUSTHIAN PREMIER’S PEACE TALK 

AMSTERDAM, July 30. 
We are ready to conclude an honor­

able pease as soon as our opponents 
renounce their hostile plans aiming

at our destruction or repression, said 
Baron Von Hussarck, Austrian Pre­
mier, in presenting his Cabinet to the 
Upper House of the Austrian Parlia­
ment aaccordtpg to Vienna advices, 
ment according to Vienna advices, 
that so far as the Central Powers are 
concerned, the war is a defensive one. 
So long as our opponents take the 
standpoint of one-sided dictation, he 
continued, there is nothing for us to 
do but to continue the war and carry 
it on so vigorously that it will be 
shortened. In war as in peace, Aus­

tria will not be alone, he added. Our 
alliance with Germany is a real af­
fair of the heart and will deepen un­
der the influence of peace. There is 
nothing menacing to this allian-e, 
the war-like^ contents of which were 
forced upon the Central Powers by 
their opponents will cease as soon as 
they extend the hand of- peace.

(Continued on 6th page,)
-------------- , >----------------------------

KIN AMD’S LINIMENT CURES DIP*. 
' THERM.


