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Alexandria, luul the satno aulhority in nome of the eastern
provinces. There was no liishop, whether at Ivome or
olsewhere, who, nt tliis period, jiretended to any authority
beyond his own diocese or province.
The evidcnices of the Church's existence in Britain crowd

upon us as we advance down the stream of history. The
Picts and Scots had, however, made frequent incursions
into the country, and had made sad liavoc of the Church,
though they had by no means been able to destroy it. Tho
Saxons, who were heathens, had been invited by the Bri-

tons to assist them against these dreaded enemies ; but had,
in their turn, conquered some parts of the country.* At
length, in 50(5, centuries aft«3r the lirst establishment of the
Church in Britain, - (J-regory, surnamed the (J-reat, Bishop
of Rome, sent the celebrated Augustine to preach the Gos-
pel to the Anglo-Saxons. Augustine found Bertha, Queen
ofEthelbert, King of Kent, a Christian; and by her his
mission was iavored. lilthelbert himself was converted,
and many of his subjects were baptized by Augustine and
his followers. Some years after liis arrival in England,
Augustine took a journey towards the western counties,
whitheT the British Church had been driven ; and haying
asked for a conference with it, was met on the banks of the
River Severn by seven Bishops, their most learned men
from Bangor, Isceod, the chief nursery of the Church, and
Binoth, their Abbot. He made i)roposals to them to unite
with him and his followers in the work in which they were
engaged. But the teriiip of his proposal were such as they
could not accede to. He proi)osed to them to give up
many of their established customs, and to put themselves
in subjection to the Bishop of Rome. To this Dinoth an-
swered in these words : "Be it known without doubt unto
you, that we all are, and (n'^ery one of us, obedient and
subjects to the Church of God, and to the Pope of Rome,
and to every one in his degree, in perfect charity, and to
helpe every one of them, by worde and deed to be the chil-

dren of God : and other obedience than this I do not know
due to him whom you name to be Pope ; nor to be Father
of Fathers; to be claimed and to be demanded; and thi»
obedience w^e are ready to give and to pay to him and to
every Christian continually. Besides, we are under the
government of the Bishop of Kaerleon-upon-bake, who i»

to oversee under God over us, and to cause us to keep the
way spiritual ."t This surely is the language of one be-
longiii«j to an independent branch of the Churjjh, owning
no sub.iection whatever to Rome, Bede also intorms u»
that "they (the British Bishops) would not own Augustine
as Archbishop over them."J Augustine is said to have
shewni much disappointment at this unfavorable close of a
scheme oi union, for whicli he had taken so much pains.
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