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have performed such other exercises as may be prescribed 
to that end,—the whole to the satisfaction of the Com­
mittee on Graduate Studies,—shall be entitled to the Degree 
of Doctor of Science.

•20 —Except as provided in Section 22, the Degree of
Doctor of Laws shall be given only as an Honorary Degree. 

2X —Students who shall have completed any special
course of study, duly established and maintained in connec- 

ft tion with any Faculty or Faculties, and shall have passed 
the prescribed examinations during such course, and also 

tylC/gr ' the special examinations for graduation, and shall have per- 
y Sj/g formed such exercises as may be prescribed to that end,— 

the whole to the satisfaction of such Faculty or Faculties, 
and also to any other examiners whom the Corporation may 
associate with such Faculty or Faculties, shall be entitled to 
the Degree of Graduate in such Special Course.

20. —The Degree of Graduate in Civil Engineering or 
the Degree of Bachelor of Applied Science, heretofore 
granted by this University, may, on application, be ex­
changed by the Corporation for that of Bachelor of Science, 
and every graduate holding that Degree so given in ex­
change shall rank as Bachelor of Science from the date of 
the Degree so exchanged by him.

21. —The Degree of Master of Applied Science or the 
Degree of Master of Engineering, heretofore granted by this 
University, may, on application, be exchanged by the Cor­
poration for that of Master of Science, and every graduate 
holding that Degree so given in exchange shall rank as 
such Master of Science from the date of the Degree so 
exchanged by him.

22. —The Corporation may, in accordance with and sub­
ject to the Statutes and the Regulations of the Corporation 
in force on the 31st day of January, 1899, grant to any 
person who shall have matriculated and attended lectures in 
any Faculty before that date any Degree which might have 
been granted to him in pursuance of such Statutes and 
Regulations.
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