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TREATMENT OF APPENDIJITIN.

Dr. W. E. Ashton concludes :
1. That we must coisider all cases

of appendicitis as being imminently
dangerous to life fron the beginning
of the attack, as there are no means of
determining the exact pathological
conditions present at the seat of
disease.

2. That operative interference is
indicated in mild cases, if medical
treatment fails within twenty-four
hours to produce a decided improve-
ment in the symptoms.

3. That all cases of recurrent ap-
pendicitis should be operated upon as
soon as the diagnosis is clear.

4. That increasing pain in the right
iliac fossa, rapid pulse, continued
elevation of tem'perature, tumor, and
tympany are conditions indicating im-
mediate operation.

5. That it is unsafe to wait before
operating for the development of symp-
toms indicating gangrene or perfora-
tion of the appendix, pus, bowel ob-
struction, or peritonitis. - Therap.
Gazette.

A medical student during the recent
examinations being asked the ques-
tion, " What is the reaction of ainnio-
tic fluid ?" scratched his head,· began
to look rather serious, and finally
stated that " really he had forgotten
the reaction, it had been so long since
he had tasted it."-Am. Pract. and
Newes.

For Vertigo with pain, Prof. Hare
recommends the following prescrip-
tion :

R.-Extract. ergot. fluid . .gtt.-x-xx.
Potassi bromidi..-... gr. x-xx.
Cannabis indicoe. ..... gtt. v.-M.

Sio.-To be takèn in one dose.
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