
PERSONALS.

Dr. Geo. H. Carlisle (Tor. '05), of Esterhazy, Sask., vas
imarried to Iiss C. Thompson, of Cobourg, November 15th.

Dr. B. A. Cohoe (Tor. '01), formerly of Cornell University,
is now on the staff of the Johns Hopkins University, Balti-
more.

Dr. Hillier, of Bovmanville, has been elected Honorary
President of the Conservative Association of the County of
Durham.

Dr. Fred. Grasett, of Toronto, was elected hy acclamation
as representative of the Graduates in Medicine in the Trini÷y
College Council.

Dr. Neil Macplater, President of the New York Canadian
clubvisited Toronto during the last week of November, and
attended the Dinner of the Toronto Canadian Club, Novomber
28th.

Dr. F. H. Scott (Tor. '04), who lias been engaged in post-
graduate work in Europe for some time, lias been awarded one
of the two IRoyal Society research studentships at the Univer-
sity of London.

Dr. Geoffrey S. Beck, of Port Arthur, visited Toronto in the
latter part of November. Huis many friends will be pleased to
know that his health, which w.,as in a precarious condition for
some time, is now excellent.

At a meeting of the Hamilton Medical Association, lield
December 6th, the following officers were appointed for the
coming year: President, Dr. Ingersoll Olsted; Vice-Presi-
dent, Dr. D. G. Storms; Cor.-Secretary, Dr. Davey; Rec.-Sec.,
Dr. L. R. Hess; Treas., Dr. W. J. MeNichol.

The physicians of the counties of Carleton, Lanark and
Renfrew have forned a society called the Ottawa Valley Medi-
cal Association. At the first neeting, which vas lield in Arn-
prior, tie following officers were elected: President, Dr.
Preston; Vice-President, Dr. Lynch; Treasurer, Dr. Kelly;
Secretary, Dr. McIntosh.

Prof. John W. Byers, Professor of Midwifery, Queen's
College, Belfast, lias been honored witli a knighthood. We are
told by tle Briish Medical Journal that this is a matter of
congratulation, not only to Sir John Byers, as he now is, and
his friends, but also to the fpublic. It is all the more satisfae-
tory because it is not a "terminal symptom," as the recipient
is in the prime of life, and has many years of useful work
before him.


