
Thursday to Thursday
it. Now's the time to do something 
about it. The Shyness Programme will 
start soon. Contact us to register or to 
find out more about it. Counselling 
Services, Room 422, Student Union 
Building. Tel: 424-2081.

The Dalhousie University Computer
Users (DUCOG) wants to know what 
your problems are with computer usage. 
The group would like to present Admin­
istration with documentation of the 
problems being experienced at a meet­
ing being held November 9 at 2:30, 
Room 312 of the Old Arts College 
School of Business Building. Any 
information on specific examples of dif­
ficulty experienced by Faculty or Stu­
dents should be sent to Mr. C. Dirksen 
c o the School of Business. Also 
requested are any ideas on how the 
situation can be improved.

The October 31 Coffee House, which is 
at 8 p.m. in the Grawood Lounge, will
be a Hallowe’en costume party. The
theme is Dal Jam '82.

A note from the United Church Com­
munity at Dalhousie. Listed below are 
some activities you might want to be 
part of. Things are developing all the 
time, so keep in touch, and watch the 
Gazette for other announcements.

Six Wednesday evenings: Concerning 
issues that concern us as Christians in' 
today's world. 7-8:30 p.m.. Chaplain's 
Office: October 27 - Updating your 
faith; November 3 - A new approach to 
studying the bible; November 10 - Faith 
and justice issues (e.g. nuclear war); 
November 17 - Spirituality and sexu- 
al-ity. Week-end retreat at a monastery. 
November 5-7: A quiet weekend, largely 
reflective, unstructured, allowing for a 
lot of meditation.

If you are interested in more informa­
tion or any of these activities call the 
Chaplain's office - 424-2287 - ask for 
Avery.
Outreach Tutoring needs volunteers to 
tutor elementary and junior high school 
students who are having difficulties with 
their work. Please phone 453-4320 for 
more information.

Sponsored by the M.K. O’BRIEN DRUG MART 
at 6199 Coburg Road (just opposite Howe Hall)

Serving Dalhousie students for 14 years”.
Thursday October 21
Small Band playing in the Grawood 
Lounge - October 21-23. Admission 
free.

Thursday at Noon presents Alexa 
McDonough in the Green Room of the 
S.U.B. on Oct. 21. at 12 noon.

Monday October 25
//umtlo Uorl /The federal Business Development

Bank with co-sponsorship from Atlantic 
Canada Plus. Dartmouth Chamber of 
Commerc. and C.F.D.R. Radio have 
organized a 1-day inter-governmental 
and industry information session on the 
programmes services provided by these 
levels. Some 32 representatives will be 
on hand on October 25, 1982 at the 
Dartmouth Sportsplex to meet with the 
public. Together, these officials will be 
representing over 200 programmes and 
services for entrepreneurs. This event is 
the kick off for Small Business Week in 
Canada which will be proclaimed by his 
Worship for Dartmouth. The Bank and 
the Canadian Chamber of Commerce 
have designated "Small Business Week" 
as the week of October 24 - October 31, 
1981 and various functions will be held 
across Canada for small businesses to 
assist them for "Managing in Turbulent 
Times". For more information on this 
event, please contact Gerry McCann at 
the Dartmouth Branch of the Federal 
Business Development Bank - 426-8050.

O. I
Dal Liberal Association Meeting:
Thursday. Oct. 21 at 8 p.m.. Room 100. 
SUB. All interested please attend. 
Speaker to be announced.
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•-VBring out your budgets - The Arts

Society is having a meeting at 5 p.m. on 
Thurs. Oct. 21. Room 412. SUB. Arts 
“B" societies please attend with budgets 
in hand - if you can! Thanks.
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V /Women unite to reclaim the night! On

Fri. Oct. 22 at 7 p.m. women of Halifax 
will march in solidarity to protest vio­
lence against women. The Reclaim the 
Night march is part of an internation­
ally organized effort to protest all forms 
of violence against women including: 
rape, battery, incest, sexual harassment, 
pornography, and mental and emo­
tional abuse. This will be the fourth 
consecutive year that Halifax women 
will unite to protest against the fear that 
keeps them off of the streets at night.

Women interested in participating in 
the march are invited to meet at A 
Woman’s Place, 1225 Barrington St., 
Fri. at 7 p.m. Bring along a flashlight. 
Coffee and donuts will be served at A 
Woman’s Place after the march. 
Women requiring transportation or 
day-care should call 429-4068 as soon as 
possible.

Since the march protests the fact that 
women can’t walk at night without male 
escorts it is seen as defeating to the pur­
pose to have men participate. Although 
men are welcome to help with transpor­
tation or day-care they will not be per­
mitted to march.
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.tinues the Celebration of Women in the 

Arts 1982 fall series of presentations 
from Nova Scotia women artists. The 
performance will be on Thursday, 
October 28 at 8 p.m. in the Dalhousie 
Art Gallery. For more information, call 
425-7812.________________________
Because of space and organiza­
tional limits, the Gazette has to put 
a deadline on acceptance of all 
material for Thursday to Thursday 
or Unclassifieds. Please have 
typewritten submissions to us by 
Monday noon for publishing in the 
newspaper coming out that week. 
Thanks, and tell your neighbours.

Professor Elliot Gutmann. on behalf of 
the Canadian Professors for Peace in 
the Middle East, will be addressing 
interested students and faculty on the 
topic Will war in Lebanon mean more 
violence in the Middle East, or less?. 
Professor Gutmann is on sabatical from 
the Hebrew University and is presently 
at Carleton University in the Political 
Science department. He has extensive 
publications and knowledge of the cur­
rent situation in the Middle East. He 
will be speaking in the SUB on Wed­
nesday , October 27. Check at the 
Information Desk of the SUB to get 
time and location.

Tuesday October 26
8 p.m., McMechan Auditorium, Killam 
Library, Dalhousie University. Ethnicity 
and Religious Communalism in South 
and Southeast Asia by Rev. Dr. Bruce 
Matthews, Professor of Comparative 
Religion at Acadia University. Free 
admission. Coffee and donuts will be 
served. Sponsored by the International 
Student co-ordinator, Dalhousie 
University.

Dr. Linus Pauling, who has been 
awarded Nobel Prizes for his work in
the fields of Chemistry and Peace, will Thursday October 28 
be visiting Halifax on the 25th and 26th 
of October as part of his Canadian tour 
for Peace.

While in Halifax, Dr. Pauling will 
attend a panel discussion on October 
25th at 8 p.m. at the Student Union 
Building, Dalhousie University. The 
participants of the panel will be address­
ing various aspects of Canadian issues 
in the Peace movement.

Dr. Pauling's keynote address will be 
given on Tuesday October 26th at 8 
p.m., at the Theatre Auditorium, St.
Mary’s University. His address will 
focus around a special Peace Talk 
which he has prepared for the tour.

Dr. Pauling will host a special news 
conference upon his arrival and will be 
available to the media during his slay in 
Halifax. Further details will be made 
available. All enquiries should be 
directed to the International Education 
Centre, St. Mary’s University. (429-9780 
ext 165 - Ken Persau).

Public Service 
Announcements
Shyness got you down? Do you want to 
feel more comfortable, less 
social situations and in your interactions 
with professors and classmates?

Want to learn to make small talk and 
to approach people more easily?

You have something worth saying - 
so learn how to feel good about saying

Halifax director/playwright Linda 
Moore returns from Victoria with a new 
play Like There Wes No Tomorrow. In 
it, two women explore the bond 
between themselves and their own fall 
from innocence.

The play projects photographer Kath­
leen Flannagan’s images onto scenes 
performed by actors Rosemary Gilbert 
and Trisha Lamie.

Like There Was No Tomorrow con-

Divers - celebrate Hallowe’en under­
water. There will be an underwater 
pumpkin carving contest, and lots of 
prizes to be won. If you are interested, 
you must register before October 29 at 
the Diver’s Log Scuba Store. The 
Entrance Fee is $5.00. For further 
information you can call 454-4296, or 
go to the store which is at 2744 Robic 
Street.

There will be a return engagement by 
international performer Mary O’Hara at 
the Cohn on Friday, October 22 at 8 
p.m.

anxious in

T.G.l.F. Cinema presents The Canadian 
Federation and The Inheritance from 
the Business, Politics-Economy Series. 
The films will be shown on Friday, 
October 22, in room 100 of the S.U.B.. 
at 3 p.m. Unclassifieds
Saturday October 23
Top Scottish entertainers will present an 
evening of good music and plenty of fun 
for all at the Cohn on October 23, at 8 
p.m.

Good essays are made in the EDITING. 
Let a graduate (M.A.) edit yours. Reas­
onable rates. Call 479-1412.

FELLOW STUDENTS,
WHEREAS: There is presently a Dal­
housie Pugwash society in existence. 
WHEREAS: According to Dalhousie’s 
most prominent Mudville citizen, Judy 
Walker, the last census revealed there 
are indeed more farmers in Mudville 
than Pugwash.
WHEREAS: Apples and mud 
essential to the Nova Scotia economy.
BE IT RESOLVED THAT:
1) We, the undersigned concerned stu­
dents. petition council for the formation 
of the Dalhousie Mudville Society.
2) We endorse Judy Walker as honor­
ary president of the said society.

PHI CHI is having a HALLOWE’EN 
PARTY! The party is at 1328 Robie 
Street on October 30, 9-? p.m. Happy 
Hour is 9-10 p.m. The admission is 
$2.00.

HOUSEMAN FOR HIRE: Have knee 
pads, will travel. Free wine glasses with 
every engagement. Swedish and Scan­
dinavian books too. See it all. KY extra, 
sorry.

Join the picket against the latest war 
exercise, Operation Marcot, 11 a.m., 
Saturday October 23. Saturday October 
30, at the U.S. consulate, Scotia Square 
(Duke and Barrington Street). Vigor­
ously oppose the imperialist war prepa­
rations and the danger of a new world 
war. Organized by the Dalhousie Stu­
dent Movement. Everyone welcome.

Wednesday October 27 750-FOUR HONDA excellent condi­
tion. $1000. 469-5272 after 6.

All those interested in joining the 
DALHOUSIE CURLING CLUB the 
last day to register is Friday, October 
22. Please call Marie or Diane at 
423-3666.

FOR SALE: 1974 Honda "754". Good 
condition. $850.00. 445-2601.

K. (who ya callin’ old) Higgins 
Contact: Placement Office, School of 
Business.

Erik Lundberg will speak on Stagflation 
as an Issue of Economic Policy at 8
p.m. on Wed. Oct. 27 in the Rebecca 
Cohn Auditorium. His talk is part of 
the Dorothy J. Killam Memorial Lec­
ture Series.
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COMMERCE INTRAMURALS -Any 
girls who would like to play ringette in a 
one weekend tournament please contact 
Cindy Gibson at 423-1917. If you are 
not in Commerce, but would also like 
to play for a team, also call.
DEAR KEVI: Sorry, 6'9" a must. Also, 
last time I drove an old Chevy, it 
wouldn’t shift out of first. How’s your 
transmission holding up?
P.S. Short people got no reason to live. 
They've got, little hands, little eyes.
They run around telling great big lies. 
They have little cars that go beep, beep, 
beep.
They have little mouths that go squeak, 
squeak, squeak.
Don’t want no short people ’round here.

Prominent dancer Ellen Pierce offers an 
interpretive dance/lecture with Sable 
Images, the work of Toronto artist 
Anne Meredith Barry. Barry’s paintings, 
photographs and drawings explore 
movement in scenes from the Atlantic 
coast and other natural environments 
where land, water and air interact.

Pierce creates her own artistic pers­
pective as she works with dance and 
other media in her presentation. This 
performance at the Mount Saint Vin­
cent Art Gallery is on Wednesday, 
October 27 at 12:15 p.m. For more 
information call 425-7812.

Sunday October 24
Granada: Building a New Society in the 
Caribbean will be the title of a talk 
given by Vincent Noel on Sunday, 
October 24, at the Lutheran Church 
(corner of Windsor and Allan Sts.). 
Vincent Noel is the First Vice President 
of the Granada Trade Union and the 
President of the Granada Bank and 
General Workers’ Union.

TO WHOM IT MAY CONCERN: 
Ardmore Hall has been pretty quiet 
lately. The girls are beginning to feel 
they no longer belong to the Dalhousie 
campus. This letter is to hereby chal­
lenge any group to raid Ardmore Hall, 

signed. The Girls from Ardmore Hall

P.S. Topics to be discussed during the 
year include whether to buy dough 
burgers or bring our lunches; whether to 
drive, bus, or walk to Dal. and other 
such global matters.

/jMoved by Paul S. Robertson- 
Seconded by John S. Wall

TUTOR NEEDED - for a serious stu­
dent struggling with a BIOETHICS 
course. Limited financial resources. Any 
help appreciated. Call Graham at 
454-7677

A CAR WILL BE LEAVING FOR 
MONTREAL/OTTAWA on the morn­
ing of October 28 and returning the 
morning of November I. Share gas/ 
driving expenses. Call 423-2928.

Come to the Grawood Coffee House 
Sunday night on the third floor of the 
SUB - from 8 p.m. - 11 p.m.


