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and ail the provisions that prohibit a certain conduct and
make it an offence.

* (1820)

In areas of trust in whîcli we are not dealing with
specifics, like the illicit taking of funds or otlier clearly
criminal acts, it is very difficuit to draw that lie between
what is acceptable and wliat is not acceptable.

Wliat happens, and wliat lias liappened in Bill C-43
and every other piece of legisiation that I have ever seen,
is that you end up turning it over to some person to make
a judgment, and maybe the member can enligliten me if
lie knows differentiy. Tliat would be permissibie in many
cases but il we are going to maintain the independence
of eiected representatives, if we are going to maintain
their abiiity to stand up for their constituents, for the
oppressed and for people ahl over tlie c )untry who have
problems then the hast thing we want to do is place them
under the control and supervision of a panel or individu-
ai that can make judgments witli respect to their con-
duet. That would put an independent elected person into
a kind of servitude.

Frankiy, if that is what is necessary to restore public
confidence in elected representatives then we are in
serious trouble. If the public is going to elect somebody
and then say: "But in your day-to-day activities, in the
way you handie the affairs that are brouglit to your
attention, you must answer to some officiai who is
appointed to preside and monitor your activities" it will
make members totaliy subservient to the judgment of
that officiai. Tliey wiil have to say to themselves: "Before
I take this action I lad better confer with the board of
control and decide whetlier it thinks this is riglit or
wrong".

We are grappling with a diffîcuit problem. Wlien we
talk about codes of ethics and public ethics we are talking
about a subject that has created havoc for centuries,
from the days of Caesar and the Roman senate. There is
no magic way to assure the public that it can have total
reliance on those whom it elects. But tlie public does
have the riglt-

Now we hear from the NDE For years we thouglit it
was the Conservatives and the Liberals who were the bad
persons. We thouglit the NDP were pristine and pure.

Supply

The difference was that it neyer got mnto government.
We did flot know what it was doing.

Then it formns the government in Ontario, Saskatche-
wan and British Columbia. 'Men we find out what is
going on with the NDE Then we find out about hiring
friends as exedutive officiais. Then we fmnd out about
giving contracts and about firing public officiais and
replacing them witli political friends. What else do we
fmnd? 'Me only problem with the NDP was that it did flot
have the opportunity to perform these unethical acts.
Now that it lias the opportunity it is performing tliem in
spades. Wlien members of the NDP stand up and give us
lectures on ethics we can ask: "Hey, but does that apply
to Bob Rae and lis staff? Does that apply to the premier
of Saskatchewan and lis political appointees and con-
tractors? Does that apply in British Columbia?"

Now they are flot so clear about these ethical stan-
dards. Now that they are involved in a few littie mischief
making activities tliey are not so quick to debate this
subject. Wliat they will leamn is what we have leamned,
whicli is that honesty and integrity corne from within.
Tliey corne from, the people and from the persona of
eacli indîvidual. If they do not have it inside them then
there is no any legisiation that will legisiate it for them or
for the people of Canada.

Tlie answer is that we should work toward some code
of ethics. We should continue the task of writing a code
that is acceptable and effective. I think that is what the
Prime Minister wants and that is wliat lie intended by
introducing the bill for discussion.

Mr. René Soetens (Ontario): Mr. Speaker, I rise not to
participate in this debate, thougi I liave listened to it for
a long time. Following the comment of the lion. gentle-
man my concern is that this debate is serving no useful
purpose.

What bothers me more is that we do flot even seem to
have a quorum in the House to have it liappen. I wouid
point that out. It is in my opinion, according to Standing
Order 29(l), that there is a iack of quorum in the House.

The Acting Speaker (Mr. Paproski): I will ask tlie
Clerk Assistant to count the members present.

And the count having been taken:
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