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After debate thereon, the question being put on the
motion, it was agreed to on the following division:

(Division No. 144)
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Messrs.

Abbot
Alexander
Allard
Allmand
Anderson
Andras

(Port Arihur)
Andres

(Lincoln)
Appolloni (Mrs.)
Baker

(Gander-Twillingate)
Baker

(Grenville-Carleton)
Baldwin
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Bégin (Miss)
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Bussières
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Condon
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Lang
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Lefebvre
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Lumley
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Diefenbaker
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(Qu'Appelle-Moose
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MacDonald (Miss)
(Kingston and the
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Nicholson (Miss)
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Penner
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Reid
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Trudeau
Trudel
Turner
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Hantington
.larvis
Kempling
Knowles

(Norfolk.Haldimand)
Lambert
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La Salle

Messrs.
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MacLean
Malone
Marshall
Masniak
Mazankowski
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McKenzie
McKinley
Mair
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Murta
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O'Sulhivan
Patterson
Reynolds
Ritchie
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Rynard
Scott
Stevens
Towers
Wagner
Wenman
Whiteway
Whittaker
Wise
Woolliams
Yewchuk-53

A Message was reCeived from the Senate informing this
House that the Senate had passed the following Bis:

Bill C-94, An Act for granting to Her Majesty certain
sums of money for the public service for the financial year
ending 3lst March, 1977.

Bill C-93, An Act for granting to Her Majesty certain
sums of money for the public service for the financial year
ending 3lst March, 1977.

Pursuant to Order made Monday, June 28, 1976, the
Order being read for the consideration of the report stage
of Bull C-84, An Act to amend the Criminal Code in rela-
tion to the punishment for murder and certain other seri-
ous offences, as reported (with amendments) from the
Standing Committee on Justice and Legal Affairs;

Motion numbered 1 standing in the name of the honour-
able Member for Burnaby-Richmond-Delta (Mr. Reyn-
olds), as f ollows:

That Bill C-84, An Act to amend the Criminal Code in
relation to the punishment for murder and certain other
serious offences, be amended by deleting Clause 1.

was withdrawn.

And a point of order having been raised as to the accept-
ability of certain motions, Mr. Speaker reserved his
decision.

A Message was received f rom the Honourahle Wishart F.
Spence, O.B.E., Puisne Judge of the Supreme Court of
Canada, acting as Deputy Governor General, desiring the
immediate attendance of the House in the Senate
Chamber.

Accordingly, Mr. Speaker went with the House to the
Senate Chamber.

And being returned;

Mr. Speaker reported that when the House did attend the
Honourable the Deputy Governor General in the Senate
Chamber, His Honour was pleased to give, in Her Majes-
ty's name, the Royal Assent to the following Bill:

Bill S-32, An Act to implement conventions for the
avoîdance of double taxation with respect to, income tax


