
3. Medicine

2

(g) I discussed with Minister Chi the Bethune medical exchange
program and I am pleased to say that we have agreed that an early
res=ption of this exchange would be mutually beneficial for both
countries .

(h) Still in the field of medicine, we noted with satisfaction
that a Chinese medical delegation has last year attended the McGill
Sesquicentennial in Hontreal and we discussed the desirability of
further visits by both sides in the very near future .

4. Education

(i) Minister Chi and I touched on the subject of student and teacher
ezchanges . We agreed such exchanges were mutually beneficial and
desirable . Officials on both sides will be e=amining the development
of a prograra in the field of education to be instituted at an early
mutually convenient date .

(j) We also discussed exchanges of publications between our various
academic and scientific institutions .

5 . Sports

I have discussed with the Foreign Minister of the Pebple's Republic
of China the encouragement of the sports exchanges that are under
discussion between the sports federations of the two countries . We
agreed that sports exchanges can play a useful role in developing
understanding between Canadian and Chinese peoples . Canadian and
Chinese sports federations have had an opportunity in connection with
my visit for a further exchange of views and have agreed in principle
to new exchanges in the fields of volleyball, table tennis, ice hockey
and gymnastics. Details of such exchanges will be worked out by the
sports federations . I understand that possible future exchanges in the
fields of basketball, figure skating, soccer and the exchange of coaches,
films and literature in physical training, were also discussed .
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