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But the plaintiffs were not entitled to recover ai
although the road was not in good repair for automol
the speed at which the plaintiffs were travelling-bet
20 miles an hour. The hole spoken of was a "'drop "
caused by a downward grade and heavy rains. Tbi
carelessly, and bis carelessness caused the accident to

The plaintifT8 were as a matter of law identifieg
driver. The car was owned by the plaintiff Jame
knew that bis son was prohibited by law, owing to 1
driving a motor-vehicle. Yet it was by Rce's author
the concurrence and sanction of bis ce-plaintiff that
dr$ving the car, Even if the prohibition did not exi
gence of the driver affocted his parents, as he was a(
authority.

The, Motor Vehicles Act, R.O.. 1914 ch. 2017
amended by 7 <Jeuj. V. c-h. 49, sec. 10, proNvides that no
the age of 16 yeairs shall drive a miotor-v-ehicle.

As the plaintiffs' son was, at the date of the a
hibited by the statute frorn driving a motor-irehicl
the highway wbich he was making, at the instance of
who were aware of bis age, was uûlawful.

Reference tLo (Jannan v. Bryce (1819), 3 B. & A
185; Grand Ti'unk R.W. Co. of Canada v. Baruett
361, 369;, Greig'v. City of Merritt (1913), 24 W.L.R.
City ofl Saskatoon, [1917] 3 W.W.R. 1110; Babbi
Vehinles, 2.nd cd., para. 1087; Keonovsky v. Que.
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