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[Translation]I urge the government, in its ambitious agenda for review and 
renewal, to assess the cost effectiveness of all programs and 
services the government delivers. It is imperative now more 
than ever to assure Canadians that their hard earned tax dollars 
are being spent wisely.

WINTER OLYMPICS

Mr. Stéphane Bergeron (Verchères): Mr. Speaker, it is with 
pride and great pleasure that I rise today in this House on my 
own behalf and on behalf on my colleague from Saint-Jean to 
stress the dazzling performance by skaters Isabelle Brasseur and 
Lloyd Eisler who won the bronze medal in the pairs figure 
skating category yesterday at the Lillehammer Olympic Games.

Isabelle Brasseur and Lloyd Eisler were bronze medallists at 
the Albertville Olympic Games, have been the Canadian cham­
pions for several years and hold the world champions title. Their 
impressive record is due to their exceptionally hard work and 
determination.

HUMAN RIGHTS

Mr. Pat O’Brien (London—Middlesex): Mr. Speaker, it is 
essential that the Canadian government continue to call for the 
Mexican government to guarantee respect for human rights of 
all its citizens, in particular for the people who were brutally 
mistreated in the recent uprising in the Chiapas region.

• (1405 )

After giving this wonderful performance and winning this 
beautiful medal, Isabelle Brasseur and Lloyd Eisler are now 
putting an end to their successful career at the amateur level. 
These two champions, who train at the Haute Performance 
Centre in Boucherville, will now enter a professional career that 
promises to be as successful.

To these two champions who thrilled Quebec and Canada and 
who so often filled us with pride, and earned our admiration, I 
say congratulations and good luck on behalf of Quebec and 
Canada.

The constituents of London—Middlesex were gravely con­
cerned with reports of torture and summary executions of 
guerrilla combatants by government troops, and they condemn 
the indiscriminate bombing by the military.

I join with my constituents in urging the Canadian govern­
ment to call on the Mexican government to respect the presence 
of human rights organizations, to allow the bishops of the area to 
mediate in the conflict and to act on the natives’ call for land 
reform.

Canada has a responsibility to ensure that the human rights of 
the citizens of our new trading partner are respected. This can 
only be guaranteed through continued monitoring by the in­
ternational community.

[English]

WINTER OLYMPICS
CRIMINAL CODE

Mr. Philip Mayfield (Cariboo—Chilcotin): Mr. Speaker, on 
behalf of the people of Cariboo—Chilcotin I would like to 
congratulate the athletes representing Canada at the winter 
Olympics at Lillehammer, Norway and wish them great success.

It is unfortunate, however, that a world class athlete from 
Quesnel, British Columbia, was not given the opportunity to 
participate in this prestigious sporting event because of a tough 
new qualification policy.

Tony Fiala has dedicated his whole life to preparing for 
competition. In the 1991-92 season he scored first overall in 
Canada and second overall in the North American biathlon. 
Canada’s qualifications standards are not based on an overall 
record which would place him at the top but by a two occasion 
showing with a standard much higher than that required by most 
other countries fielding competitors.

Tony Fiala may not be winning any medals at Lillehammer, 
Norway, but to the people of Quesnel and throughout British 
Columbia, Tony Fiala is a winner all the way.

Ms. Roseanne Skoke (Central Nova): Mr. Speaker, life 
begins at the moment of conception and continues until natural 
death.

Respect for life and the dignity of human suffering together 
with the recognition of the moral, ethical and spiritual values is 
well founded in both natural law and Canadian law.

The Criminal Code of Canada forbids aiding, counselling or 
assisting suicide. This law does not merely exist to regulate our 
behaviour. Rather, it articulates and symbolizes our values and 
beliefs as a nation.

In recognition of all the heroic individuals who silently suffer 
the physical pain and endure the emotional torments of this life 
from day unto day until natural death, I demand that the existing 
laws of the Criminal Code respecting assisted suicide be strictly 
enforced to ensure that our nation’s values and moral conscience 
with respect to life not be fettered, for not to do so will create a 
greater injustice to mankind than any human pain or suffering 
could possibly inflict.


