
Her Garden

often tbey tire'us out, or bold us back, or
force us into toucli. If a player je not in
condition, or lacking in "pep," if lie is over-
confident, or if hie does not know hie oppon-
ent's tactics, lie je rarely able to break through
and score. It le necessary to train long and
bard, to know your own weakness, and to
f;tudy the modes and playe of the ojpsition.

In ths big life-game that we bave to play
at sehool, at home and on the etreet, as well
as on the phlying field, we bave got to train
ourselves not for a single gaine, but for
every day. How can we train for this gaine
of character making ? Surely, by studying
the rule-book,-tbe Bible contains tim al;
by consulting witli tbe great captain,-.ý
prayer àe just doing tbat ; and by taking
exercise in tbe gymnasium of the wil,-obey-.
ing instructions, sticking to our resolutions,
flnishing up our job.

It is necessary, too, to watch your oppon-
entseclosely ; to notice wlien they usually
strike you and at wliat spot tliey generally
get through. You will flnd it most often
liappens when sometbing or somebody lias
annoyed you, or wlicn you are in doubtful
company. Watch your lime, attend to the
weak spots and look out for the enemny's
rush.

Tbe otber side of the gaine ie teai play;
playing for tbe side, not for yourself. Tliat
je why a football gamne je better sport than
an individual race. The useful nman on the
teai je the player wlio passes the bail instead
of "hogging" it, or tlie basebail player wlio
inakes a "sacrifice hit,'" putting himself out,
but ecoring bis team-mate.

Life to tlie boy who wears Chriet's colore
should flot be a race for individual honore>
but a gaine in which lie tries to help the other
feilow along. Hie position may be liarder
than yours, bis chances may be poorer, hie
opposition may be touglier. You muet not
neglect your own position, but by playing
combination with the fellow beside you, by
backing bim up cloeely and by unselflshly
sharing the chances with hlm, you are flot
only making good yourself, but helping tlie
other feilow and your side to w.in out. And
there ie no greater satisfaction possible than
this. It brings nor only praise, but thanke
as weil.

Keep in training, consuit the captain,
watcb the opposition, "1pase the bail," neyer
say quit : that ie playing the game.

Her Garden
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(Marian ICeith)

She was driving through the bot city streets,
higli up oni the seat of the market wagon.
She was just sixteen and was on a most won-
derful journey to the city with father, to buy
a new bat. She bas decided it was to be
white, with a wreatb of pink roses. Best of
ail she was paying for it berself. In the back
of tbe wagon, piled upon tbe lettuce and
cabbages and otber vegetables for market,
were glowing masses of flowere ; garden roses
and pansies and sweet peas and many otber
kinds, ail grown in lier own garden, by bier
own band. And tbese were to pay for the
new bat.

Tbey bad long ago left the green flelds and
wvhite roads, and were now driving througli
tbe evil-smelling streets of P- poor quarter of
the city. Sbe looked with wondering eyes
at the blackened waUs of tbe old bouses, the
dirty yards, tbe swarms of ragged children.
And suddenly sbe called out, "Oh, fatber, do
stop a minute 1"I

Tbey were passing a littie city play-ground,
literally flled witli chiîdren. And the girl
fresh from, the great, wide play-ground of
green fields and deep, cool woods, stared.
Just tbe summer before, some good women,
whose motlier liearts were sore for the littie
oues'witlzi no place to play, and wbose inother
Learts were alarmea at the awful train of
those samne little one appearing for crimes
in the juvenile court, had bouglit tbis play-
ground.

It was a tiny lot in a busy corner of tbe
downtown district, with the wall of a great
factory along one side. The factory cliimneys
belclied black clouds of smoke over it, tbe
railway tracks eut off a big corner, and every
flve minutes huge engines thundered past.
The sun beat down upon tbe factory wails
and was refiected over tbe p]ayground as
tliough great oven doors were opened upon


