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[En glish]
THE LATE MARY STANFIELD

TRIBUTES TO LATE WIFE 0F MEMBER FOR HALIFAX

Mr. Joe Clark (Leader of the Opposition): Mr. Speaker, ail
of us appreciate the fine words you spoke yesterday on behaîf
of ail members of this House in expressing the deep regret of
members of this Chamber at the death yesterday of the wife of
the hon. member for Halifax (Mr. Stanfield).

AIl of us who knew Mrs. Stanfieid are saddened by ber
passing, but are sustained by the memory of a vibrant, natural,
sensitive woman. Politics is sometimes a stuffy business, and
Mary Stanfieid wouid let none of us get away with that. To
Canadians across the country she brought a gift of warmth
and wit-
[Translation]
-in both officiai languages. Indeed, it is an expression of her
character that she learned the French language here and that
she spoke it with verve and pleasure.
[English]

Those of us who were priviieged to be ber friends knew a
charity and a concern for others that went weil beyond the cai
of ber responsibilities. She was fresh air in our lives, our party
and our country. We extend to the famiiy our condolences at
her passing and our gratitude for sharing ber with us.

Somne hon. Members: Hear, hear!

Hon. Jean Chrétien (Minister of Finance): Mr. Speaker, on

bebaîf of tbe members of our party, i should like to express

our very deep sympathy to the hon. member for Halifax (Mr.
Stanfield) at the loss of his wife, Mary. To aIl of us who had

the privilege of knowing her, she shahl be remembered as a

very happy lady who was always eager to share warmth and

friendship with ail members and their farnîlies, regardless of

which party they represented. We extend our sincere condo-
lences to my hon. friend and bis family, particularly those who
were close to her.
[Translation]

And i would like to take the opportunity to say to the House
how Mrs. Stanfieid was admired when she was visiting French

communities in Canada. She was a great lady, very charming

and gay. She had realiy understood, as it is more and more

accepted among aIl Canadians, that it is possible to be a

genuine Canadian and, at the same time, have access to both

officiai languages of our country. To Mr. Stanfieid and bis

family, 1 present my deepest sympathy on behaîf of ail mem-
bers of the House.

[En glish]
Mr. Edward Broadbent (Oshawa-Whitby): Mr. Speaker, on

behaif of the members of my party, 1 should like to join with
the Minister of Finance (Mr. Chrétien) and the Leader of the
Officiai Opposition (Mr. Clark) to express our deep grievance
at the passing of this frank and engaging woman, a woman
who brought joy to ail who knew her. We extend to the bon.
member for Halifax (Mr. Stanfield) our deepest sympathies at
this time, and we express our hope that the grief wbich wilI
corne from this sad passing will soon be overcome in his life.

Some hon. Meinhers: Hear, hear!

0 (1410)

[Translation]j
Mr. Gilles Caouette (Témiscainingue): Mr. Speaker, on

behaif of my colleagues, 1 wish to join the representatives of
the three other parties in offering our most sincere condolences
to the hon. member for Halifax (Mr. Stanfield), his wife
having passed away. 1 must point out that last year, when my
own father passed away, the Stanfield family and members of
my family met repeatedly, which means that we share aIl the
more the pain of those dîfficuit moments. Mrs. Stanfield was
acknowledged as a great Canadian lady, and the fact that she
could speak French was always greatly appreciated by our
group of members of parliament who corne mainly from
Quebec. Once again, our deepest condolences to the hon.
member for Halifax.

ROUTINE PROCEEDINGS

[En glish]
EXTERNAL AFFAIRS

SUGGESTION CANADA BRING QUESTION 0F AIR PIRACY BEFORE
UNITED NATIONS-MOTION UNDER S.O. 43

Mr. Don Mazankowski (Vegreville): Mr. Speaker, 1 rise
under the provisions of Standing Order 43. 1 make this motion
in the belief that the seriousness and the gravity of the threat
posed by international terrorists to the lives and safety of

innocent persons wiil persuade members of this House to give
it unanimous consent. Therefore, 1 move, seconded by the hon.
member for Prince George-Peace River (Mr. Oberie):


