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FIVE MINUTE SERMON
Rev. J. P. Hickey, O. S. B.

RESULTS OF A GOOD LIFE
"The kingdom of heaven in like to a grain of 

mustard seed. (Matt. xiii. 81.)

This parable of the mustard seed, 
my dear brethren, was spoken by our 
Blessed Lord immediately after those 
of the sorer and the cockle amongst 
the wheat. Those two parables 
teach us the difficulty of being good, 
and bow few keep good. Only one- 
fourth of the hearers receive the 
Word of God ; and even then, 
amongst the good seed, the enemy 
sows the cockle. Their lesson is one 
of discouragement ; the lesson from 
the parable of the mustard seed, on 
the'.other hand, is one of encourage­
ment—viz., from so small a begin­
ning great results. “ The least in­
deed of all seed », but when' it is 
grown up it is greater than all herbs, 
and beoometh a tree, so that the 
birds of the air come and dwell in 
the branches thereof.” (ibid., 82.)

The truth of this parable stands 
every test, and it does us good to 
verify it. The remembrance of it 
has comforted many a humiliated 
heart, given courage, determination, 
and strength to many a wayfarer 
journeying to heaven.

For who is typified, in the first 
place, by the mustard seed ? Christ 
our Lord. His birth, His life, His 
apparent failure in the world, the 
disaster, as even His disciples 
thought, of His death, were the seed.
Contrast them with the redemption 
that He brought and the victory with 
which He has overcome the world 1 
What Name is known, and adored, 
and recognized as King of earth and 
heaven but that onoe despised Name 
that was nailed to the cross, “ Jesus 
of Nazareth ?” The mustard seed 
grown into a tree.

And as the parable depicted Him­
self, so also is it true of His Spouse, 
the Holy Catholic Church. Born in 
the upper chamber in Jerusalem on 
the day of Pentecost, nursed in sor­
row and suffering, exiled, hidden in j^iaught.

have gone before us? Our surround­
ings may be all out of keeping with 
our hearts’ intentions ana desires. 
Neighbours, with no religion, could 
not understand us if they tried : 
they see nothing very different in 
our liVes from their own : but God 
does. We are living for Him, aiming 
to please Him, longing to he faithful 
to Him. Our hearts are not here ; 
they are with those who have gone 
before us, who persevered to the end, 
and who are now happy for ever with 
the Saints of God, as the blessed re­
sult of a good life.

VOCATIONS

It was the belief of the old-time 
pagans that among their honored 
gods and goddesses a certain number 
watched over the cradles of little 
children, directing them, from their 
earliest moments, towards adopting 
that particular calling in life for 
which each child was destined. We 
see in that pagan belief a resem­
blance to the teaching of our own 
religion, that each creature coming 
forth from, the band of God is des­
tined to fill a special and definite 
place in the realm of creation, and 
that God’s divine assistance is at the 
disposal of every creature towards 
carrying out His eternal plan.

To come down to the fundamental 
reason for our existence, we recall 
the lesion, given us in our earliest 
days, as to why we are in this world. 
Why did God create ua ? What is 
the chief, the one and only reason for 
our existence ? The Catechism told 
us that. It taught us that “ God 
made us to know Him, to love Him 
and to serve Him in this world, and 
to be haofly with Him forever in the 
next world.” That is the “ voca­
tion,” the calling of every one of us, 
without exception. We are all tend­
ing toward eternal happiness with 
God. If we fail to attain that end, 
our existence has been in vain. We 
have frustrated the plan of God ; 
have made all His works go for

the catacombs, stamped out, as the 
persecutors foolishly boasted, it lived 
through all, and grew and gathered 
strength, and when the days of peace 
dawned, it was found to have over­
spread the world.

But we can realize things of the 
days of our fathers and of the pres­
ent, better and more readily than 
those of the distant past. As an 
example, then, of the growth of the 
Church take that of the United States 
of America. We know it now as the 
most enterprising and most pushing 
Christian nation in the world. Less 
than one hundred and twenty years 
ago their first Bishop was created by 
Pope Pius VI. Bishop Carroll was 
consecrated at Lulworth Castle, in 
the South of England—the mustard 
seed of the American Church. Be­
fore he died, in 1815, four more 
bishoprics had been added to Balti 
more, and there were thirty priests 
for that vast continent. Watch the 
miraculous growth of the Holy 
Church. In thirty years more—that 
is, in 1845—there were twenty one 
Bishops, and the thirty priests 
had become seven hundred. And in 
forty years after that, when Catholic 
America celebrated its * centenary— 
1889—the one Bishop, of a hundred 
years ago, looked down from heaven 
upon the land, and beheld thirteen 
Archbishops, seventy-one Bishops, 
and eight thousand priests 1 

And who had chiefly paopled God’s 
Church in the United States ? The 
poor Irish emigrant and hi^hildren. 
The penal laws, the famine years, 
had depleted Ireland, but her people 
had gone forth, poor little seeds of 
the Faith, and had already grown up 
the noble tree with its spreading 
branches, the Church of Christ upon 
earth.

Do not remembrances such as 
tiese fill our souls with gratitude 
that we are children of the same 
Church ? Do they not give us cour­
age to face our duties and our work 
as Catholics ? When prayer is dis­
tasteful, our heart unruly, persever­
ance in a good life eluding our en­
deavours, we must not lose heart, 
but be determined to be faithful in 
little things. Remember, the king­
dom of God is like to a grain of mus 
tard seed. The holy men and women 
who have gone before us, who built 
up the Church of God, were only 
poor sinners like ourselves. They 
had passions, weaknesses, imperfec­
tions, jealousies, heart burnings like 
ourselves ; but they cherished the 
faith of God, and persevered in lowly 
service of prayer, of obedience to the 
laws of the Church, of respect and 
reverence for all that they had been 
taught to love and hold dear. And 
the result? Everlasting joy and 
glory with the angels of God in 
heaven.

It is so easy to forget in everyday 
life, to raise up our eyes and comem­
ber that we are meant for heaven. 
Look at the result, the issue of a 
good life, instead of bemoaning the 
burden we have to carry, the length 
of the journey, and the weariness of 
well doing. Discouragement and re 
pining take the heart out of any 
man's work. The parable of the 
mustard seed is one emphatically 
meant by our Blessed Lord to en­
courage us, to make us prize the gift 
of faith that be has bestowed on us, 
and to warm our hearts with the de­
sire of imitating those who have 
gone before us.

The faith within us can transform 
our daily life. Offering all that we 
do each day to the favour of God, we 
are not working then long houes for 
a poor pittance. No ; the work of 
our labour and our faith is for God, 
and God is faithful to reward us.

And in the constant endeavour of 
a holy, though hidden life, is it not a 
consolation to think of those who

Human experience has shown us 
that all men do not follow the tame 
road to tbeir eternal destiny. As 
one, starting out on the journey of 
life, scans the future to find the 
path by which he is to travel, he 
finds himself confronted by a con­
fusing choice of ways. He cannot, 
of course, elect more than one. 
And his choice, in the final analysis, 
will be one of two. The first is a 
broad, well set and attractive road, 
winding in easy course towards 
eternity ; this the road of the com­
mon or ordinary life. The other is 
narrow, to the human eye less at­
tractive, but leading more directly 
to its end ; this the road of the priv­
ileged or extraordinary life. Each 
of us has to choose between these 
two, for we are meant for either one 
of them. If we get on the wrong 
road we are out of place. And our 
mistake will not concern ourselves 
alone : we are sure to interfere, in 
addition, with others who are follow­
ing the same road on which we travel.

The selection of our path cannot 
be left to chance. We are not to be 
carried along on whatever route the 
winds of fortune may blow us. If, 
in its wildest sense, our vocation is 
to eternal life, so, in a special way 
may we be said, each of us, to have 
a calling to a particular path that 
will bring us there. God’s band is 
stretohed forth to lead us along that 
particular route. If we yield to His 
guidance and follow it, we are fol 
lowing our vocation.

We have noted that God does not 
give anyone a vocation without giv 
ing him special help to follow it. If 
one, of his own initiative, strikes out 
on another path, he must go un 
aided. The help from on high that 
would have been his portion is 
withdrawn. He himself has forfeit­
ed it.

“ What an impression of strength 
and power is conveyed by the loco 
motive as it rumbles swiftly round 
curves and over bridges, pulling after 
it heavy freight and precious human 
lives,” says a writer on this subject.
“ But let the engine jump off the 
track and follow a road of its own 
choosing, and a lamentable wreck of 
tangled and twisted steel and iron 
will be seen. So it is with human 
lives. God is never sparing of hap 
piness and prosperity, of love and 
beauty of soul, to those who, with 
their eyes constantly riveted upon 
His holy will, and their band firmly 
grasping His Divine hand, are going 
along the path of their life.

“ Not so when passion, or ambition 
or the love of pleasure are the only 
guiding stars in the journey heaven­
ward. These lights soon flicker and 
abandon their followers to wretched­
ness and to themselves.”

Through an erroneous notion, 
many have come to understand “ vo­
cation” to mean only a call to what 
we have termed the extraordinary, 
or privileged life - the life of the 
priesthood or the religious. In that 
sense we frequently hear the remark:
“ I feel that I have no vocation.” 
But your vocation may be to live in 
the world, to pursue the ordinary 
Christian life. From the beginning 
God has clearly marked out this path 
for the greater number of His crea­
tures. His Blessed Mother and St. 
Joseph were called to live in the 
world. For those who, like them, 
were to set up their own Nazareths, 
special help and supernatural assist­
ance was provided. Not only was 
such a life sanctioned from on high 
but the Son of God, at the marriage 
at Cana, clothed it with the mantle of 
sacramental dignity.

No argument is needed to show 
that life in the world is not incom­
patible with attaining eternal salva­
tion. We have countless examples 
of souls who have not only not failed

to work out their destiny in married 
life, but have attained to marked 
sanctity in doing bo. tit. Anne, St. 
Joachim, St. Monica, St. Elizabeth of 
Hungary, are only a few of the many 
models held up to ue by the Church. 
We are nowhere taught that to be 
virtuous, one must leave the world 
and enter the priesthood or the eon 
vent. For many, it would be an 
egregious mistake to do so. There is 
always great need of thoroughly 
virtuous people who, in the world, 
will establish and maintain model 
Christian families. Those intended 
by God to follow such a life would 
fail in their vocation, were they to 
adopt any other.

We read of a Monsieur Dupont, 
known in the town of Tours, France, 
where a century ago he lived, as 
“the saint.” His friends urged him 
to take up the life of the priesthood.
“ I shall pray that God may enlight­
en me as to His will ” was his an­
swer. After due reflection, accom­
panied by prayer, he confessed to hie 
advisers : “ In vain have I prayed. I 
feel no inclination whatsoever 
towards the priesthood or the relig­
ious life. It is my vocation to re­
main in the world and there to serve 
God and work for the salvation of 
souls.” And he remained a layman, 
of exemplary and holy life.

There are some, however who ard1 
called by God to lead an extraordi­
nary life. Their vocation is the 
more sublime, and aims directly at 
that self denial and Christian per 
fection of which the Son of God 
Himself is the model. One who ie 
called to leave the world and follow 
Christ is expected to reproduce in 
himself, or herself, those virtues 
with which the life of Christ was so 
replete. Therefore is a priest or a 
religious referred to as “ another 
Christ.” And if it be argued that 
there have been individuals who 
have entered into this extraordinary 
life without the manifest vocation 
to it, it is conversely just as sadly 
true that many have suspected the 
call, or heard it whispered in their 
own hearts, and have failed to give 
it heed.

The means by which God mani­
fests His Divine will towards His 
creatures are many and different. 
Not all are shown their vocation as 
clearly as was St. Peter, who was 
bidden : “ Come, follow Me l” or St. 
Paul, who was struck down and 
blinded on the road to Damascus.

Ordinary souls must expect that 
Divine Providence will use ordinary 
means in showing and developitg 
their vocations. How these means 
may be recognized is of the next 
importance.—Catholic Transcript.

NO MORE KIDNEY 
TROUBLE

Since He Commenced 
to Take “Fruit-a-tlves”

78 Licks Avenue, Ottawa, Ont. 
“Three years ago, I began to feel 

run-down and tired, and suffered 
very much from Liver and Kidney 
Trouble. Having read of 'Frult-a- 
tives’, I thought I would try them. 
The result was surprising.

I have not had an hour’s sickness 
since I commenced using ‘Fruit-a- 
tives’, and I know now what I have 
not known for a good many years— 
that is, the blessing of a healthy 
body and clear thinking brain”.

WALTER J. MARRIOTT. 
50c. a box, 6 for $2.00, trial site 10c. 

At all dealers or sent postpaid on 
receipt of price by Frult-a-tives 
Limited, Ottawa. '

HEROINE OF 
THE WAR

HOW A GIRL BOOKKEEPER WON 
THE CROSS OF HONOR

The most signal honor France can 
bestow has been conferred upon little 
Marcelle Sommer for her heroism in 
the War. Long ago, as far back as 
the first retreat to the Marne, she 
won the Cross of the Legion of 
Honor, and since that time her gal­
lantry has been such that she has 
been acclaimed in the great hall of 
the Sorbonne at Paris. It is here 
that France gave honors to the great 
men of the world, poets, philosophers 
and scientists in times of peace, and, 
as we read the account of Mile. Sem- 
mer’e deeds as set forth in the New 
York Times, it mu at be agreed that 
she was worthy of the honor.

The orator of the occasion, Mr. 
Klotz, from the department of the 
Somme, began hie address by an 
eulogy of the obscure and unnum­
bered heroines of the War, the 
mothers who sent their sons to the 
front, the women in the occupied 
districts who never lost faith in the 
ultimate return of the French. Then 
he recounted the service which Mar­
celle Sommer, only twenty-one, had 
performed :

The outbreak of the War found her 
an orphan girl in the little village of 
Eclusier, near Frise, on the Somme. 
There she was a bookkeeper and 
superintendent of a phosphate fac­
tory founded by her father, an Alsa­
tian who had fled from Alsace in 
1871, not wishing to become a Ger 
man subject. After the defeat of the 
Allies at Charleroi the French tried 
to make a stand along the Somme, 
but being outnumbered by the huge 
forces of the invaders, they fell back 
across a canal in the vicinity of Mar- 
oellô Semmer’s home, with the enemy 
in hot pursuit. When the retreating 
Frenchmen had got across the canal, 
the young girl had the presence of 
mind to raise the drawbridge over 
the canal. Then, fearing that the 
German advance guard, now close 
behind, might swim across the canal 
and seize from her the key, without 
which the drawbridge could not be 
lowered again, she threw it into the 
canal. She was in the nick of time. 
Already German soldiers on the other 
bank were firing across at her and 
the fleeing Frenchmen.

By this audacious act Marcelle 
Sommer held up the advance of an 
entire German army corps until the 
following morning. Not until then 
were they able to collect some boats, 
make a pontoon bridge and negotiate 
the passage of the canal, thus giving 
away golden hours to the hard 
pressed French troops.

In spite of all the risks, the young 
girl insisted on remaining in her vil 
lage during the German occupation 
In a subterranean passage used in 
the working of a phosphate mine 
near 1 Eclusier the brave Marcelle 
managed to conceal no less than six­
teen French soldiers who had strayed 
from their commands in the precipi­
tate retreat from Charleroi and Mons.

The auditors, every man, woman 
and child of them, leaped to their 
feet, mud with enthusiasm. They 
craned their necks to catch a glimpse 
of the heroine. Unable to escape 
them, the young girl stood up, blush­
ing. Through the great hall of the 
Sorbonne, where the most famous 
people of the world bad been hon 
ored by France, swept a storm of 
cheers. A reward more splendid 
than the Croes of the Legion of 
Honor, than the War Cross, than the 
salutes of soldiers at the front, had 
come to Marceilè Summer.— St. Paul 
Bulletin.

WHEN THE SIXTY NINTH 
COMES BACK

She not only kept these men hidden, 
but fed them, provided them with 
civilian garments, and, when a pro­
pitious moment arrived, aided them 
to escape into the French lines.

While she was helping a seven 
teenth she was caught by a detach­
ment of Germans, who dragged her 
and the French soldier before the 
local commander. When asked 
whether she had indeed meant to 
help the soldier to escape she cried 
out :

“Yes ! And he is not the first. I 
helped sixteen others and 1 got them 
where you cannot catch them. Do 
what you will with me now. I am 
an orphan and have but one mother 
—France ! 1 am not afraid to die

She was sentenced to be shot. 
They took her from the courtroom 
and rr'l'toed her before the tiring 
squad, out wlldle the girl 'had been 
helping seventeen soldiers to escape, 
the battle of the Marne had been 
fought and won and tin French were 
now rapidly advancing. At the 
moment when her death seemed only 
a moment away the French artillery 
opened fire on the town and the Ger­
man positions around Eclusier. The 
cannonade was so sudden that the 
firing squad was disbanded, and in 
the confusion Marcelle was able to 
escape to her subterranean gallery.

Shortly after the French reoccupied 
Eclusier. The Times goes on to eny : !

Between the lines of the opposing \ 
armies lay the Somme, which in the 
vicinity of Eclusier and Frise spreads 
out into a sort of big pond with 
marshy banks. When the water rose 
it often flooded the lines so that sol 
diers frequently lost their way, and 
here it was that Marcelle again foupd 
a means of aiding France. Being 
thoroughly acquainted with the 
neighborhood, she used to pilot par­
ties of soldiers. This brought her 
again close to death. While leading 
a squad of men who wanted to dig 
an advanced trench in the village of 
Frise she fell into the hands of a 
party of Getmons.

They locked her up in the little 
village church of Frise, reduced last 
summer to a heap of ruins during 
the battle of the Somme. On the 
morrow, she felt sure, they would 
shoot her.

But once more luck and the French 
artillery were her salvation. The 
French across the Somme began a 
lively bombardment of Frise. One 
shell blew a large hole in the church 
wall. Through this hole, unperceived 
by her captors, Marcelle crawled. 
Creeping past the Germans scattered 
through Frise, she soon tumbled, 
safe and sound, into the nearest 
French trench.

By this time her fame had spread 
and rewards began to shower upon 
her. She got the Cross of the Legion 
of Honor, and some time later the 
War Cross. In spite of all she had 
gone through, she persisted in stay­
ing in the Somme country and con­
tinued to work in the cause of 
Fiance. For fifteen months she 
remained, despite shot and shell, in 
her little French village, taking care 
of wounded soldiers. Also among 
her charges was a woman of ninety, 
too feeble to travel to a safer place. 
Marcelle looked out for her night 
and day with unflagging devotion.

Everywhere soldiers knew and 
admired her. One English general 
ordered his soldiers to salute when 
she passed and refrain from address­
ing her unless she spoke first.

At last, however, the strain of 
bombardment and work, aided by 
her grief at the death of her soldier 
brother and brother in-law, proved 
too much for her strength and she 
was persuaded to go to Paris. Yet 
she had no intention of stopping her 
efforts. She petitioned the authori­
ties to allow her to enter a nurses’ 
school in order that she might con 
tinue to aid the wounded. She added 
that it was necessary for her to work, 
as everything she possessed had been 
lost |in the War. Her request was 
granted. The Times o includes :

All this Mr. Klotz told hie audience 
at the Sorbonne. Then suddenly he 
stretched out his hand in dramatic 
gesture and electrified his auditors 
with these words :

“This little heroine of Picardy, this 
admirable girl, this incarnation of 
the qualities of the woman of France, 
this girl of simple origin, flawless 
dignity, of serious mind and gentle 
ways, this girl of indomitable will 
power, is here, ladies and gentlemen, 
here among you, in this room I And 
1 feel that 1 am the spokesman for 
every one of you wlieù I now extend 
to her the expression of our respect, 
our gratitude, our admiration !”

Even if peace came to-morrow it 
would probably take from 12 to 18 
months to bring all the Canadians 
back.

They would have to be kept in the 
meantime.

Pay and allowances alone cost over 
$14,000 000 a month.

Transportation expense would 
probably amount to $15,000/ 00.

To demobilize the Canadian troops 
would undoubtedly cost over $250,- 
000 000.

$500,000.000 ie needed through the 
Victory Loan, no matter what comes 
or goes.

Canadian industry and the Army 
both need strong financial support.

The Sixty-ninth is on its way— 
France heard it long ago,

And the Germans know we’re com­
ing, to give them blow for 
blow.

We’ve taken on the contract, and 
when the job is through 

We’ll let them hear a Yankee cheer 
and an Irish ballad, too.

“ The Harp That Once Through 
Tara’s Halls ” shall fill the 
air with song,

And the Shamrock be cheered as the 
port is neared by our triumph- 
and throng,

With the Potsdam Palace on a truck 
and the Kaiser in a sack,

New York will be seen one Irish 
Green when • the Sixty-ninth 
comes back.

We brought back from the border 
our flag—t’was never ;ost ;

We left behind the land we love, the 
stormy sea we crossed.

We heard the cry of Belgium, and 
France the free and fair ;

For where there’s wtrk for fighting- 
. men, the Sixty-ninth is there.

The men who fought at Marye’s 
/ - Heights will aid us from the 

sky.
They showed the world at Freder 

icksburg how Irish soldiers 
die.

At Blackburn Ford they think of ue, 
Atlanta and Bull Run,

There are many silver rings on the 
old flagstaff, but there’s room 
for another one.

God rest our valiant leaders dead, 
whom we cannot forget ; 

They’ll see the Fighting Irish and 
the Fighting Irish yet.

While Ryan, Roe and Corcoran on 
history’s pages shine,

A wreath of laurel and shamrock 
w.*its the head of Colonel 
Hino.

The heart that suffers with resig­
nation sees farther than the mind 
that reasons.

“ The Hirp That Once Through 
Tara’s Halls ” shall fill the air 
with 60»g,

And the Shamrock be cheered as the 
port is neared by our triumph­
ant throng,

With Potsdam Palace on a truck and 
the Kaiser in a sack,

New York will be seen oue Irish 
Green when the Sixty-ninth 
comes back.

—Joyce Kilmer

VICTORY LOAN NECESSARY 
WHETHER PEACE COMES 

OR NOT

Don’t let the German peice propa­
ganda interfere with the success of 
the Victory Loan.

Canada’s war expenditure to-day is 
greater than ever before. There are 
75,000 more Canadians overseas than 
there were a year ago.

They are still going over as fast as 
Canada can send them.

Dangerous Antiseptics 
and GermUcies Are 

Unnecessary
A dependable antiseptic has come to 

be considered a necessity in most homes. 
Especially is this true since Absorbine, 
Jr., has nad such a wide introduction, 
because this liniment is not only a pow­
erful antiseptic and germicide, but it is 
absolutely safe to use and to have 
around the house. It is not poisonous 
and it cannot do harm even if the 
children do get hold of it. That is a 
big point to consider.

Absorbine, Jr., is concentrated and 
is therefore economical It retains its 
germicidal properties even diluted one 
part Absorbine, Jr., to 100 parts water, 
and its antiseptic properties, one part 
Absorbine, Jr., to 200 parts of water.

The antiseptic and germicidal proper­
ties have been repeatedly tested and 
proven in many prominent chemical 
laboratories Detailed laboratory re­
ports mailed upon request.

Absorbine, Jr., combi

/

Unusual Things
Anything about the home 
that needs washing and 
that will not be hurt by 
pure water itself may be 
safely immersed in the 

creamy, pure, cleans­
ing Lux lather.
Silk shades, hangings, oil- 
pictures and their frames, 
jewelry, bric-a-brac, heir­
looms, etc., all are purified 
like new with Lux.

LEVER BROTHERS 
LIMITED. TORONTO

Liquor and Tobacco

efficiency.
. combines safety with I 

$1.25 a bottle at most drug- I
gists or postpaid.

Send 10c. for liberal trial bottle.
W. F. YOUNG, P. D. F.,

299 Lymans Bldg., Montreal, Can

The Catholic Hghlams 
of Scotland

The Western Highlands 
and Islands

BY

DOM ODO BLUNDELL
O. S. B., F. S. A. (SCOT.)

Author of “The Catholic Highland!) of - Scotland 
(Central Highlands)" “Ancient Catholic 

Homes of Scotland"

2 Vols. $2.75 Postpaid

Oh V atlmlir Bftecnrh
LQNDON, CANADA

11*11*2*0 9r M°Taooart'e Vegetable,
IR til# I La Remedies for these habite are 

safe, i’iexpeneive home treat­
ments. No hypodermic injections, no lose of 
time from business, and positive cures 
Recommended by physicians and clergy. 
Enquiries treated confidentially. Literature 
and medicine sent in plain sealed packages ! 

Address or consult —

Dr. McTaggart’s Remedies
809 Stair Bunding Toronto, Uanedti 1

STAMMERING

L

or Bturterinft overcome positively. Our 
natural methods permanently restore 
natural speech. Graduate pupils every­
where. Free advice and literature.
THE ARNOTT INSTITUTE

KITCHENER, - CANADA

Phone 
Main 7215

11 7 Yongc St. 
TORONTO

DRUGS CUT FLOWERS
PERFUMES CANDIES

Ordt'1 by Phone — we deliver 
K3T Watcb our Ads. in Local Dailies Thursday

D(|LAjS 
MEMORIAbWINDOWj,
ANDLEADEDLIW

B. LEONARD
QUEBEC : P. Q.

We Make a Specialty of Catholic Church Windows

THESE 2 VALUABL

,T LAM’S TRAPPER5 by

COOt^n.96 past9cancanNETS 
TRAPS 

^HEADLIGHTS 
fAMMUNITION 
ANIMAL BAIT

French, ? „ -nimals—b°”n, to use for
fur bearing ,,yle of Vr F tab. »nd * 

!0t «ihng Prlce °f ste’d to W*

-s.’sesi
JTLTJrÆ ând‘>ï^.g,7
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SHIP.-
your MILLIONS OF DOLLARS

Will be distributed among the Trappers this Season for Raw Pure. 
The ONE RAW FUR market Is " Hallam V’, and no matter where you 
are, Hallam will buy your Pure for SPOT CASH andpay highest prices. 
All you do, is simply to send your furs direct to “ HALLAM", and your 
money is mailed to you as soon as the furs are received. Try us. 
Thousands of experienced trappers, living in all parts of Canada ship 
their furs to us year after year, because they find Hallam returns are 
prompt, Hallam grading very fair, and Hallam prices highest, 

busy—Catch all the fur bearing animals you possibly can, and don't make 
' ‘ * " year, but ship all your RAW FURS direct to John II allaiany mistake ttiis year.

Limited, where you receive the most loney. We will buy from one skin up.

WEAR
HALLAM'S GUARANTEED 

FUR GARMENTS
Hallam'» For Fa.tne. Beak 4i
pages, shows these beautiful 
furs photographed on living 
people.
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