
BOOKS
BUBAL LIFE IN CANADA. By Rev. John McDougall, M.A. The first book 
dealing with the Canadian situation. A splendid study book for Young 
People’s Societies and Brotherhoods. Price, cloth, $1.00 postpaid; paper, 
60 cents postpaid.
START YOUB CHILD BIGHT. By William Lee Howard, M.D. These con­
fidential talks to parents and teachers point out clearly what they them­
selves should know and what the children themselves should know of their 
physical power if they are to be strongly fitted to cope with conditions as 
they grow up. Price, 75c.
BEPBODUCTION. By Winfield S. Hall, M.D., Professor of Physiology. 
Northwestern University Medical School, Chicago. The Biology, Physiology 
and Sociology of Reproduction; also Sexual Hygiene. Price, $1.00.
FROM YOUTH TO MANHOOD. By Winfield S. Hall, M.D., Professor of 
Physiology, Northwestern University Medical School, Chicago. A book of 
105 pages, endorsed by the Young Men’s Christian Association and leading 
educationists. Price 60 cents.

IN CONFIDENCE TO BOYS. By Rev. H. Bisseker, M.A., of London, Eng­
land. Every boy should have this booklet placed in his hands. Single copy, 
5 cents; 60 cents per dozen; 60 cents t>er dozen postpaid.

THE STRENGTH OF TEN. By Winfield Scott Hall, M.D., Ph.D., Chicago. 
This little book is pronounced the very best work published on the subject 
of personal purity for boys. It deals with the subject of manhood from the 
heroic viewpoint, directing attention to those qualities which make strong, 
successful, manly and noted men. The last chapter deals with personal 
purity, approaching the subject in such a tactful, forceful and thorough 
manner that the boy’s interest is held until the very last, and he is given 
just the information he ought to have at this period of life. Price, 25 cents.

LIFE’S STORY—A Book for Girls. By Jeannette Winter Hall, wife of Dr. 
Hall, Chicago. In response to the oft-repeated question, “How shall I tell 
my daughter the Story of Lofe?” this little book is written. It seeks to tell 
the truth plainly, yet without offence. Its object is to show the great and 
beautiful plan of Nature by which all life reproduces its kind, and to inspire 
a reverence for creative power. Girls from ten to fourteen may read it 
alone, or read and talk it over with their mothers. A copy ought to be 
placed in the hands of every girl. Price, 25 cents.

SCARLET, OR WHITE? “Scarlet, or White?” is, without question, the 
strongest story that has appeared in any language in pleading the cause of 
the “ scarlet ” woman, and in properly showing up the " scarlet ” man. It 
deals most effectively with every phase of the purity question. It ought to 
be scattered by the thousand in every land. Price, 25 cents.

For these books address the General Secretary:

46 Wesley Building - TORONTO, ONT.


