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Mr. McCutcheon: Thank you very much. Mr. Chairman, when is your next 
meeting of this Committee? I wonder if, in fairness to all the rest we should 
adjourn.

The Chairman: You are about to say that we might call it a day. Yes. It is 
one o’clock, and the officials have been here a long time. At the next meeting 
you will start off the questioning. We have meetings now scheduled for the 14th 
and 16th of June and the 21st and 23rd of June. I do not have any meeting 
scheduled next week and the reason for it is that the days were just booked 
solidly for next week. Next week there are four meetings at all the times 
nine-thirty and eleven. We do not have permission to sit when the House is 
sitting, but even if we did I do think that the schedule is such next week that it 
would be very difficult.

I have asked Mr. Deachman to try and fit us in to one of those time; maybe 
one of the other committees may drop out or something, but the definite ones 
are the 14th, 16th, 21st and 23rd. I do not know whether it will be at the 
nine-thirty or the eleven o’clock time. The only other possibilities for next week, 
because I think that members probably would like to continue as soon as 
possible, is if we sat on a Monday or Friday or at the one o’clock hour, and I 
thought with that in mind Mr. McCutcheon, we might have a steering commit­
tee meeting. That does not seem to meet with too much response, but I think it 
is something we might discuss maybe later today, Mr. McCutcheon; we could 
have a meeting on that.

I would like to thank the officials for their patience in staying with us for 
the extra half an hour today and for their very informative answers and their 
references to Canada’s first province.

The meeting is adjourned.


