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ELECTRICITY STANDARDS REVIlSED

The National Research Council of Canada has
announced that a new base of reference for the volt -
the practical unit of electromotive force (emf) - or
voltage, will be introduced in Canada next January.
The Council also announced that the base of refer-
ence for the ohm (the practical unit of electric re-
sistance)would be modified et the same time to make
it conform to the recognized international value. "We
are changing the values of the volt and ohm, as main-
tained in Canada, to agree more closely with the best
knowledge of absolute values available today," said
Dr. A.F. Dunn of the Electricity Section of NRC's
Division of Applied Physics.

Canada's basic standards of physical measure-
ment, including the volt and the ohm, are housed and
serviced by the Division of Applied Physics. The
Division acts as Canada's national standards lab-
oratory and provides Canadian industry and science
with the foundation for ail their measurements.

ured more accurately in terms of the absolute units.
The new value represents a better measurement of
the voltage of these cells in terns of the theoretical
unit of electromotive force derived from the basic

units of length (meter), mass (kilogram) and time
(second).

With this reassessment, the value of the volt as

defined by the International Committee will be de-
creased by 11 parts in a million. For Canada, the

decrease will be eight parts in a million, because
the existing value of the volt in this country is three
parts in a million less than that currently defined by
the International Committee.

The new value for the volt will become effective
on January 1, in ail ten countries except Russia,
where the change will be made later in the year.


