
T/te L'mperor Franci~

fromi a paper wilîi hie held in his
liand :-For verv weighty reasons
'we have decided irrevocably to la'
down flic Imperial crown in favour
of our beloved nepliew, the inost
serene Archiduke Francis Josephi,
wvhomi wv hereby declare to be of

The weighiticst reason of ail wvas
Iiis owvn uitter incapacity, to govcrn
in 50 turbulent and perilous timces.
The astute Archiduchess Sophie,
miothier of Francis Joscphi, sawv no

Josephl of Aust'r.ia. 10.3

a protection against the Turks,
stil)ulating that tlicir. old riglits of
self-government should be pre-
serve(l to then.

" Mie I-apsburgs accepted the
crowvns, but rieglectcd to observe
the othier provisions of the comi-
pact. l3ohieiaý, tlic treatcd as a
c0nqueredl provinlce, (quartering
uplon its northierni borders a larg-e
Gernian colonv. under orders to
stamip out the very idea of
Czechi nationalitv. H-ungary, they

C~ARI>ESS, BUI>A-1'ESTI[.

hiope for Austria, but in the ini-
iîiediate accession of lier brighit
and resolute son, thien in bis nine-
teeîith yeair.

It wvas no bcd of roses on wvhich
thie young Enîperor sat down.
Troubles as nuxiierous as flic
polyglot tongules of his subjects,
and centuries old, stared limiii i
thie face.

.The Magvar kingdoni of St.
Steplienl and the Czèch kingedoxîî
of St. Vacslav, lIad offered tlîeir
crowns early in the sixteexîth cen-
tury to tue House of I-lapsburg as

allowed tlue Turks to ravage at
pleasure, and disregarded the ap-
peals of tue 'Magyars for assist-
anice." Absolutismi on the throne,
and Gernian domination in the
enmpire, have becn the fruitful
sources of Austrian troubles ever
silice.

The wave of revolution which if
iS848 rolle(l over Europe, swvept
violently over every part of Aus-
tria. The Lombardo-Venetian
provinces were in revoit. The
Magyars of Huxigary-a chival-
rous, intellectual, and lofty-


