
both, as the case may *be,---the total rates, if any, "per pound,
assessed on such last mentioned property for alil purposes, and
the anount of interest due by the Corporation or Company, or
by the Municipaliy.

3. The Auditor Gencral shall annually compile from the Re-
turns so transmitted a statement in tabular forni, shewing the
names of the several Corporations in one column, and the con.
tents of their respective Returns against their respective names
in other colunms corresponding to those in the said Schedule!
and he shall cause copies thereof to be laid before each branch
of the Legislature within the first fifteen days of the Session
next after the completion of ihe sane, or if Parliament be
sitting when the same is completed, as soon as May be
such completion.

4. The time limited by the first section of the said Act, for
causing copies of By-laws and Returns relating to By-laws,
passed before the date of the said Act to be transmitted ho Re.
gistrars of Counties and Registration Divisions, is hereby ex-
tended to six months after the passing of this Act.

5. Any Clerk, Secretary, or Secretary-Treasurer as aforesaid,
of any Municipality or Corporate Body as aforesaid, neglecting
to performn, wilhin the proper period, any duty devolvingupon
him in virtue of this Act, or of the said Act as anended by this
Act, shall be subject to a fine of fifty pounds, or in default of
payment thereof, to imprisonment until such fine is paid, but
for a period not exceeding twelve months, to be prosecuted for
in the name of the Attorney General, in any Court having com-
petent jurisdiclion.

6. So much of the Act first above nentioned as provides
any punishunent, is repealed.


