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by Sandy Smith

This past week was a fairly 
busy one around Dalhousie, 
here is a brief rundown of what 
happened.
FIELD HOCKEY - The Tigers 
won three of a possible four 
points in Saint John's this 
past weekend. The weekend 
also saw Pam Taylor’s scoring 
streak stopped at ten games; 
she was unable to score in 
Sunday’s 1-0 win after meeting 
one of the two goals in Satur­
day’s tie game. She leads the 
league in scoring with thirteen 
goals. Mary McGlone’s goal 
Sunday, which came late in 
the game, gave Dal its win. 
SOCCER — A 1-1 tie with the 
St. F.X. X-Men left the Tigers 
undefeated and in first place 
in the East division of the 
AUAA soccer league. Ron 
Robinson scored the lone 
Tiger goal. The Tigers finished 
out the regular season with a 
two o'clock game Sunday at 
Saint Mary’s, and then play a 
three o’clock game against the 
X-Men on Studley next Tues­
day.
WOMEN’S 
Heather Kaulbach scored five 
goals in two games this past 
weekend as the women’s soc­
cer team continues to trounce 
all of their opponents. Satur­

day Kaulbach had a pair of 
goals in a 5-0 win over Mount 
Allison. Vicki Leonard, 
Henriette Groeneveld, and 
Erica Erlos each scored once. 
Chris Pootie earned the 
shutout in the Dal goal.

Sunday, Kaulbach had a hat 
trick in a 7-1 win over St. F.X. 
Brenda Ryan, Vicki Leonard, 
Beth Wilson, and Wendy 
MacGregor each had one goal 
as well.
VOLLEYBALL 
team opened its exhibition 
season on a winning note tak­
ing the championship in the 
Fundy Open Volleyball Tourna­
ment in Truro this past 
weekend. The Tigers compiled 
an eleven win, one loss record 
enroute to the final, losing on­
ly to the Sunbury club of 
Oromocto, N.B. The Tigers 
eventually defeated Sunbury 
in the final, three games to 
one.

very beneficial for the team ac­
cording to coach Lois 
MacGregor. MacGregor also 
announced that she has ap­
pointed Karin Maessen and 
Karen Fraser, both members 
of Canada’s national team, co­
captains of this year’s team. 
HOCKEY — The Tigers took 
the consolation title at this 
past weekend’s Moncton In­
vitational Tournament with a 
6-3 win over the University of 
Quebec. The Tigers had been 
eliminated by the Saint Mary’s 
Huskies 7-4 in preliminary 
play. The Huskies eventually 
won the tourney with an 8-4 
win over the host Moncton 
team.

Friday night in Sackville, 
N.B., the team rallied for a 3-3 
tie with the Mount Allison 
Mounties. This weekend the 
Tigers play host to the UNB 
Redmen Friday night at 8:30 in 
that newly remodelled Halifax 
Forum.

Gary Ryan had a successful 
trip; his efforts earning him 
athlete of the week honours. 
Ryan scored three goals, Brian 
Gualazzi had four in the three 
games, Rick MacCallum had 
three, Paul Jeffrey netted a 
pair, and Adrian Facca potted 
one too.
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kJan Prsala, Rod Walsh, and 
Phil Perrin were outstanding in 
the Dal victory.

The women’s team was 
busy as well. They travelled to 
PEI to hold a player clinic on 
Sunday for two Island high 
schools. The team also staged 
an exhibition game for the 
schools in the form of an inter­
squad game. This game was
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located at 5189 Prince Street at Barrington in 
Downtown Halifax
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Just as this past weekend 
was busy for Dalhousie ath­
letes, this weekend is busy 
too. The swimmers, tennis 
players, hockey players, field 
hockey players, soccer play­
ers, and volleyballers all see 
action this weekend.

SWIMMING — Nigel Kemp 
takes his squad into the first 
meet of the 1980-81 season 
with a great deal of experience 
on the team. AUAA swimmers 
of the year Brian Jessop and 
Susan Mason are both back to 
swim for the Tigers, as are 
bronze medalist in the CIAU 
finals last spring, Tom 
Scheibelhut, Arthur Rennie, a 
finalist in both the 100 and 200 
metre freestyle at last spring’s 
national finals, Louise 
Deveau, the gold medal winner 
in the 200 metre butterfly at 
the ClAU’s, and Loraine Booth, 
a 400 metre individual medley 
finalist. Kemp also looks to 
freshmen Carol Flynn and 
Dawn Seto to do well this 
weekend. Flynn is a strong 
freestyle performer he reports, 
and Seto was one of a half 
dozen Nova Scotians to be a 
national qualifier.

VOLLEYBALL

ment. The men will be playing 
at the high school meet too.

HOCKEY — In coach Peter
Esdale’s attempt to play all 

of the teams in the AUAA con­
ference before the regular 
season gets underway the 
hockey team plays three 
games this week. Friday night 
they host UNB at the Forum at 
8:30 p.m. Sunday they move on 
to Antigonish to play the 
X-men at two o’clock. Wolfville 
will be the sight of Thursday’s 
game against the Acadia Axe­
men.

TENNIS — The Tigers will 
be out to defend their AUAA ti­
tle this weekend in Moncton. 
Universitie de Moncton hosts 
this year’s final. Last year the 
Tigers won on the slick floors 
of Dal’s very own Dalplex.

FIELD HOCKEY 
Tigers will be in Antigonish 
Saturday before finishing out 
the year in a match against the 
Saint Mary’s Belles here next 
Wednesday on Studley at two

SOCCER — The Tigers have 
two tough games left on their 
schedule this week. Sunday 
they venture out to Saint 
Mary's to take on the Huskies, 
and Tuesday they will host the 
Saint F.X. X-men here at three 
p.m. Sundays game is a two 
p.m. start.
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Student Discount CouponThe
women’s varsity team plays its 
annual game against the 
alumni this Saturday, October 
25th, at 8:30 p.m. in the 
Dalplex. The game will be the 
second of the day for the 
women as they will stage an 
inter-squad game at 12:30 dur­
ing the annual Dalhousie High 
School Invitational Tourna-

50* off
The

AUAA championships are 
scheduled for this weekend in 
Saint John’s. Pam Currie can 
be looked to lead the Tigers.

CROSS COUNTRY PlAZA 6UROPA
on any food order picked up or delivered

Expiry Date Oct. 31/80
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