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At last - a 

cold cure
a •Tlllt

(RNR CUP) - The good news is 
that science may have found a cure 
for the common cold. The bad 
news is that it’s uncomfortable, 
time-consuming and not available 
in North America.

The Israelis report they’ve had 
phenomenal success with a gadget 
called the Thinotherm', which 
shoots 110-degree Fahrenheit water 
vapours into the nose. The devel­
opers say the hot water blocks virus 
growth during crucial stages in 
their reproductive cycle, and can 
cure 72 per cent of all colds within 
one day.

The machines are being mass- 
produced for export to Europe but 
American scientists are reportedly 
giving them the cold shoulder. 
They’re saying most patients just 
don’t have the. well, patience, to sit 
hooked up to a machine for an 
hour and a half - although it seems 
a small price to pay for nipping a 
cold in the bud.
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